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DECLARATION
Site Name and Location: -
Pease Air Force Base (AFB), Sites 9 and 11, New Hampshire
Statement of Basis and Purpose: |

This document presents the no-action decision for Sites 9 and 11 at Pease AFB, New
Hampshire. Site 8 (Fire Department Training Area 2) (FDTA-2), which also is in Zone 3,
is addressed in a separate ROD and is not addressed in this Zone S (Sites 9 and 11) ROD.
This decision document was developed in accordance with the Comprehensive
Environmental Response, Compensation, and Liability Act as amended by the Superfund
Amendments and Reauthorization Act of 1986 (42 USC Subsection 9601 et seq.) and the
National Contingency Plan (40 CFR Part 300). This decision document is based on the
Administrative Record for the sites. The Administrative Record for the sites is located at
the Information Repository in Building 43 at Pease AFB, New Hampshire. The
Administrative Record Index is presented in Appendix C.

The State of New Hampshire (NHDES) concurs with the selected remedy.
Description of the Selected Remedy:

No action.

Declaration Statement:

No actions are necessary to ensure the protection of human health and the environment at
Sites 9 and 11, and no S-year reviews are necessary. The foregoing represents 2
determination by the U.S. Air Force and the U.S. Environmental Protection Agency (EPA)
that no remedial action is necessary under CERCLA at Sites 9 and 11.

* Concur and recommended for immediate implementation:

ir F

By: L Date: 2/ 5/ '?j[
Alan K Olsen ’

Director, Air Force Base Conversion Agency

U.S. Environmental Protection Agency

By: /—& \/\ \ W -.Date: Ci(?e("al\—

3&bn P. Devillars
Regional Administrator
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RECORD OF DECISION SUMMARY
I. SITE NAME, LOCATION, AND DESCRIPTION

Pease Air Force Base (AFB) is a National Priorities List (NPL) site consisting of numerous
areas of contamination. This Record of Decision (ROD) presents the selected remedial
actions for Site 9 (Construction Rubble Dump 1) (CRD-1) and Site 11 (Fuel Maintenance
Squadron Equipment Cleaning Site) (FMS), both of which are located in the northern
portion of Pease AFB in the area designated as Zone S at the northeastern end of the -
runway. Site 11 is located adjacent to the north rainp of the aircraft parking apron. Site
8 (Fire Department Training Area 2) (FDTA-2), which also is in Zone 5, is addressed in
a separate ROD and is not addressed in this Zone 5 (Sites 9 and 11) ROD.

Sites 9 and 11 have been investigated under the U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration

Program (IRP). The results of the investigations indicate that remedial activities are not

required at Sites 9 and 11 to meet the requirements of the Comprehensive Environmental |
Response, Compensation, and Liability Act (CERCLA) (42 USC Subsection 9601 et seq.),

as amended, and the National Contingency Plan (NCP) (40 CFR Part 300).

The former Pease AFB is located in the Towns of Newington and Greenland and in the City
of Portsmouth, in Rockmgham County, New Hampshire. As shown in Flgure 1, Pease AFB
is located ona peninsula in southeastern New Hampshire. The pemnsula is bounded on the
west and southwest by Great Bay, on the northwest by Little Bay, and on the north and
portheast by the Piscataqua River. The City of Portsmouth is located east and souﬁeut of
the base. Pease AFB occupies 4,365 acres and is located approximately in the center of the

peninsula.

Land uses at Pease AFB since its closure on 31 March 1991 include industrial/commercial,
military, and a wildlife refuge. Land use in areas immediately surrounding Zone 5 varies.
Zone S (Sites 9 and 11) is bounded by the runway and Taxiway D to the south and
southeast, and by undeveloped forested land to the northeast. Pickering Brook, located

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod all - 1 09/13/%4



within this forested land, flows off base to the north-northeast. A low-lying wetlands area
that drains south into Peverly Brook is located west of Site 9 (see Figure 2).

Sites 9 and 11 are not currently in use. The ultimate disposition/future use of these sites
has not yet been determined. It is assumed that residential, commercial, or industrial
buildings w111 not be constructed on these sites because of their proximity to the runway and
airfield clear zone.

To the north and east of Zone 5 (Sites 9 and 11), the off-base land use is primarily
residential. The N ewington Town Forest is located in the northern portion of Zone 5 and
extends north of the base boundary into the Town of Newington. The Newington Town
Garage is located on the western side of Nimble Hill Road and also is immediately north
of the base boundary. Investigations were conducted off base at the following locations:
in the vicinity of the Newington Cemetery, on Nimble Hill Road; at a dumpster reportedly
used for the collection of bulk items for disposal, on Little Bay Road; and at residential
properties belonging to Watson, Coleman, Harvey, Cross, Gilbert/Pickering, the Parsonage,
and the Town of Newington. The locations of the off-base features in the vicinity of Zone
5 are shown in Figure 3.

At the beginning of World War II, the U.S. Navy used an airport located on the present
Pease AFB property. The Air Force assumed control of the site in 195 1, and construction
of the existing facility was completed in 1956, During its history, Pease AFB has béen the -
home of the 100th Bombardment Wing and the 509th Bombardment Wing, whose mission
Wwas to maintain a combat-ready force capable of long-range bombardment operations. Over
time, various quantities of fuels, oils, solvents, lubricants, and protective coatings were used
at the base, and releases of contaminants to the environment occurred,

The New Hampshire Air National Guard (NHANG) relocated the 157th Military Airlift
Group (MAG) from Grenier Field at Manchester, New Hampshire, to Pease AFB in 1966,
The mission of the group was changed in 1975, when it was designated as the 157th Air
Refueling Group. In December 1988, Pease AFB was selected as one of 86 military

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\zone5rod.all 2 ‘ 09/13/94
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installations to be closed by the Secretary of Defense’s Commission on Base Realignment
and Closure. The base was closed as an active military reservation on 31 March 1991. The
Air Force is retaining approximately 229 acres for use by NHANG. The federal stewardship
of 1,054 acres has been passed from the Air Force to the Department of the Interior, U.S.
Fish and Wildlife Service, for use as a National wildlife Refuge. The Air Force has
transferred to the Pease Development Authority (PDA) a 1,702-acre, no-cost airport public
benefit transfer. This transfer occurred through a contract of sale and long-term (55-year) ’
Jease in anticipation of a deeded transfer. PDA now operates the runway and adjacent
flightline areas as a commercial airport. ‘

There are approximately 3,700 dwellings within a 1-mile radius of Pease AFB. Based on
water usage Surveys conducted in 1988 and 1992 and on available U.S. Geological Survey
(USGS) andNew Hampshire Department of Environmental Services (NHDES) information,
it was determined that a mumber of these dwellings have wells and/or springs located on
their associated properties. The Town of Newington in particular has a large pumber of

 private wells. The majority of Portsmouth residences surveyed are serviced by town water

only. A compilation of area springs and wells for Pease AFB, based on information
available to date, is presented in the Pease AFB Off-Base Well Inventory Letter Report
(G-599) and in Appendix G of the Draft Final Zone 5 RI Report (G-635). Well location -
maps are provided as attachments to the letter report (G-599).

Pease AFB is located in the Piscataqua River drainage basin (see Figure 1). Drainage flows
radially away from the peninsula into Great Bay toward the west, Little Bay to the northwest
and north, and the Piscataqua River to the east. Little Bay flows into the Piscataqua River
at the northern end of the peninsula. Great Bay, Little Bay, and the Piscataqua River are
all tidally influenced. Consequently, these bodies of water are subject to semidiurnal water

" jevel fluctuations.

Pickering Brook is the'primary surface water pathway that carries runoff away from the
Zone 5 (Sites 9 and 11) area toward the Piscataqua River. The headwaters of Pickering

- Brook are located in an extensive, forested wetlands area adjacent to surface water sampling

MEO1\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrodall 9 09/13/94



point 8027. Pickering Brook flows off base approximately 1,500 feet downstream and then
joins Flagstone Brook to flow into the Piscataqua River. Before Pickering Brook reaches
Flagstone Brook, it joins with other small tributaries that flow from properties along Fox
Point Road, which is northeast of Site 8. In addition to Pickering Brook, several wetlands
areas exist east of Site 8 and northeast of Site 11. The wetlands northeast of Site 8,
identified as Wetlands XII, are relatively extensive. East of Merrimac Drive, at the
headwaters of Pickering Brook, Wetlands XIII surrounds the brook (see Figure 2).
Wetlands XTII is immediately adjacent to Flagstone Brook, and a portion of it flows into
Flagstone Brook near its conjunction with Merrimac Drive. Because Pease AFB was a U.S.
military installation, the Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) did not delineate
floodplains at the base. Therefore, it is not known whether Zone 5 (Sites 9 and 11) is
w1thm a 100-year floodplain. There are no records indicating that flooding has occurred at
Pease AFB. In addition, Zone 5 (Sites 9 and 11) is the highest elevation point on the
peninsula, suggesting that flooding is not likely.

Knights Brook is located north of Site 9, entirely outside of the Pease AFB boundary.
Knights Brook does not receive any runoff from Pease AFB. It begins as two small seeps
that merge and flow north to Little Bay. Near the origin of Knights Brook, the stream width
ranged from approximately 15 feet in a wetlands area to 1.3 feet in a channelized section.
The water depths ranged from 1.5 to 4.5 inches, as measured in June 1991. Based on review
of aerial photographs and field reconnaissance surveys, Knights Brook appears to be a short
stream dominated by cattails throughout its length.

Peverly Brook begins as an approximate 10-acre, emergent wetlands, located weét of Site
9. Peverly Brook flows toward the southwest and becomes channelized immediately after
passing through a culvert under Merrimac Drive. Downstream of this point and north of
MclIntyre Road, Peverly Brook varies in width (from 0.9 to 2.5 feet) and depth (from 2 to
3 inches) until it discharges into Upper Peverly Pond located approximately 1,800 feet
downstream.

MKD01\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod.2ll 10 09/13/54



Approximately 70 feet of relief exists across Zone 3 (Sites 9 and 11). Two topographic
highs, with elevations of approximately 122 feet above mean sea level (ft MSL), are located
in the southeastern portion of Zope 5. Approximately 30 feet of relief exists across Site 11.
The land surface in the Site 9 area slopes from an elevation of approximately 110 ft MSL
to approximately 58 ft MSL near the wetlands located at the head of Peverly Brook (see
Plate 3 of the Draft Final Zone 5 RI Report) (G-635)-

More information on the sites is presented in the Stage 3C Draft Final Zone 5 Remedial
Investigation (RT) Report (G-635).

II. SITE HISTORY AND ENFORCEMENT ACTIVITIES
A. Site 9 Use and Response History

Site 9 ‘(CRD-l)‘ served as a soil bon'ow area and disposal site for construction debris,

including concrete, asphalt, wood, tree Stimps, brush, and scrap metal. CRD-11s bordered

by Merrimac Drive to the south and the base boundary to the north. The western boundary |
of the CRD-1 area is defined by the emergent wetlands that drain southwest, toward Peverly

Brook. The eastern border of CRD-1 runs northwest along the base boundary, just west of
the Newington Town Garage. Since fall 1991, the area studied as part of the investigations
at CRD-1 has extended beyond the base boundary to an unpaved road that extends east-
southeast of Little Bay Road. Figure 1 shows the location of CRD-1.

Aérial photographs taken between 1943 and 1987 were reviewed to mODItOr the
development of the CRD-1 area. Aerial photographs from 1943 show that, at that time, the
CRD-1 area was wooded. By 1954, nearly all of the area had been cleared. Logging
operations were being conducted in the western part of the site, and most of the eastern half

of the site was a field.
By 1960, sand and gravel borrow operations had begun in the northwestern half of the site,

where an excavated pit was observed (see Figure 4). Phase I records indicate that disposal
of construction debris in the area began in 1958; however, there is no evidence of this type

MIKO01\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod all 11 . 09/13/94



edges of CRD-1, respectively.

By 1987, the excavated area was larger. Additional €xcavation extended the large pit to the
south and east. An additiona] small pit was present north of the small -circular pit first

FS Report (G-634).
B. Site 11 Use and Response History
The northwestern boundary of the Site 11 (FMS) area of Investigation is adjacent to the

southeastern corner of Site §. The northern border of Site 11 is defined by an unpaved trail,
which extends southeast from Site 8. The northeastern border is defined by a wooded area

MEOI\RPT:00628026.004\z0n¢5r0d a1 12 09/13/94
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containing a wetlands. A taxiway and the north ramp of the flightline form the southwestern
and southeastern boundaries of the Site 11 area of investigation, respectively. The Site 11
boundary was chosen based on evidence of stressed vegetation, organic vapors detected in
the surface soil, and disturbed areas. Figure 1 shows the location of Site 11.

FMS was originally established as an IRP site during the Phase I investigation performed
in 1983 and 1984. The Phase I findings were based on a records research, base personnel

interviews, and site inspections.

The Phase I study (G-84) s;uggested that, prior’ to 1971, solvents used to remove the
protective cosmoline coating (a petroleum product used as a rust preventative) from new
aircraft parts may have been intermittently disposed of at this site. Locations across Site
11 that were unvegetated or appeared to have stressed vegetation were identified as

potential disposal areas.

Aerial photographs dated 1952, 1960, and 1976 were reviewed in the 1988 Stage 2 Interim
Technical Report No. 1 (G-530). These photographs and a set of aerial photographs from
1987 were re-examined to evaluate the Site 11 activities as part of the IRP investigations.
The 1952 aerial photograph revealed that, prior to the initial Pease AFB construction in
1954, the land encompassing Site 11 was used for farming. Later photographs reveal that
the area of alleged Site 11 activities had been sparsely vegetated with low trees and shrubs
since 1960. Locations that were unvegetated or appeared to exhibit stressed vegetation also
were observed in these later photographs; however, specific site activities were not
identified. Although the precise boundaries of the Site 11 could not be determined, a
cleared area of approximately 4.3 acres estimated from the 1960 photograph diminished, as
a result of vegetative growth, to approximately 3.3 acres in 1976. In the 1976 photograph,
a northwest-southeast-trending unpaved road crossed the site. In the 1987 photograph, even
more vegetative growth was noted, and the cleared area was limited to approximately 1.4
acres located along the unpaved road identified in the 1976 photograph.
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The Site 11 area is not currently in use. In-place airport operational restrictions on land use
within the boundaries of the airport restrict construction of residential, commercial, or
industrial buildings at the site because of its proximity to the runway and airfield clear zone.

C. Sites 9 and 11 Activities

The IRP Phase I Problem Identification/Records Search (G-84) identified Sites 9 and 11
as potential sources for the release of contaminants to the environment. In résponse to this
finding, a presurvey was conducted to obtain sufficient information to plan a more detailed
study. The presurvey was completed in 1984. Based on the presurvey, RIs were conducted
at Sites 9 and 11 in accordance with CERCLA, as amended; the NCP; and all relevant EPA
guidance, including EPA’s Guidance for Conducting Remedial Investigations and Feasibility
Studies Under CERCLA, Interim Final, October 1988, OSWER Directive 9355.3-01, and
other EPA guidance for conducting RI/FSs under CERCLA.

The Stage I investigation, which began in 1984, was designed to identify'potential' impacts
of previous site activities and to investigate potential soil contamination at Site 11. Surface
water samples from Peverly Brook were collected and analyzed for total organic halogens.
The results of those investigations are presented in the Phase I — Confirmation/
Quantification, Stage 1 Final Report for Pease AFB (G-525), submitted in June 1986.

'Stage 2 field work was performed from October 1987 through May 1989. The primary
purposes of the Stage 2 investigation were to characterize the source areés and to more
accurately delineate the extent of contamination in the groundwater. The Stage 2 field
investigations are described in detail in four Interim Technical Reports (ITR Nos. 1 through
4) (G-530; G-531; G-536; G-537) and in the Stage 2 Draft Final Report for Pease Air Force
Base (G-533). Stage 2 activities also included soil-gas sampling at Site 11 to screen shallow

 soils for coﬁtamjnarits and to select soil boring locations. Soil borings at Site 11 were

advanced to characterize the lateral and vertical extent of potential soil contamination. Test

pits were excavated at Site 9 to characterize the types of buried material.
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Stage 4 field work was conducted at Sites 9 and 11 from June 1991 through November 1993.
The objectives of the Stage 4 activities were t0 assess the extent of contamination in soil and
groundwater to support the risk assessment at Site 9 and to select additional soil and
groundwater samples at Site 11 to support a No Further Action Decision Document
(NFADD). Most of the field activities for Sites 9 and 11 were conducted in Stage 4.
Table 1 summarizes the Stage 4 activities. Activities conducted at Sites 9 and 11 in Stages
1, 2, and 4 are described in detail in the Draft Final Zone 5 RI Report (G-635).

D. Enforcement History at Pease AFB

In 1976, the Department of Defense (DOD) devised a comprehensive IRP to assess and
control migration of environmental contamination that may have resulted from past
operations and disposal practices at ‘DOD facilities. In response to the Resource
Conservation and Recovery Act (RCRA) of 1976 and in anticipation of CERCLA, DOD |
issued a Defense Environmental Quality Program Policy Memorandum (DEQPPM 80-6),
dated June 1980, requiring identification of past hazardous waste disposal sites on DOD
agency installations. The program was revised by DEQPPM 81-5 (11 December 1981),
which reissued and amplified all previous directives and memoranda on the IRP.

Pease AFB was proposed to be added to the NPL in 1989 and was listed on the NPL in
1990. On 24 April 1991, the Air Force, US. Environmental Protection Agency (EPA), and
NHDES signed a Federal Facilities Agreement (FFA) establishing the protocol and
timetable for conducting the Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study (RI/FS) process at
Pease AFB. As part of this timetable, the Air Force, in an effort to streamline activities,
designed a basewide strategy plan for conducting an RI/FS. This strategy plan grouped the
pumerous sites into seven zones or operable units based on geographic location, potenﬁal
receptors, and potential future uses. RI/FS Reports were prepared for each zone. Sites 9
and 11 are addressed in the Draft Final Zone 5 RI and FS Reports (G-635; G-634).

MKO01\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrodall 17 4 09/13/94



Summary of Stage 4 Activities for Sites 9 and 11

Table 1

MK01\RP’I‘:00628026.004\zone5md;all

Zone 5, Pease AFB, NH
Site No. Date Activity Scope Purpose
9 6/91 Surface water, sediment, and benthic Wells 814A, 815A, 8020, 8021, and Evaluate potential impact of CRD-1 on
sampling. : 8022. _ stream quality,
9 6/91 Monthly water level measurement, Monitor wells and staff gages. Characterize overburden and bedrock
Additional locations added as they groundwater flow patterns.
were completed. .
7/91 Wetlands delineation, West of Site 9 (on base). Delineate wetlands boundaries,
7/91- Very low-frequency (VLF) Off-base grid. Identify potential bedrock
8/91 electromagnetic (EM) and seismic contamination migration pathways and
refraction geophysical surveys, characterize bedrock topography,
respectively,
8/91 Wetlands survey. Wetlands delineation, Determine accurate boundary,
9/91 Electrical carth resistivity (EER) and Off-base grid, Identify vertical layers,
EM-34 geophysical surveys,
9 10/91 Exploratory soil borings and soil Six soil borings: 7370 through 7375. Characterize soil quality and determine
sampling, : lithology.
9 11/91- Overburden and bedrock well Wells 5048, 6()34, 6035, and 6043, Monitor bedrock and overburden
12/91 installation, groundwater quality.
9 11/91 Survey. Soil borings 7370 through 7375; Establish locations and elevations.
wells 5048, 6034, and 6035, ’
9 1/92 Survey. Survey well 6043, Resurvey wells 5048, | Establish accurate lacations and
6034, and 6035. elevations,
9 1/92 Groundwater sampling, Wells 557, 559, 618, 6034, 6035, and Characterize water quality of
6043, overburden and bedrock monitor wells,
9 4/92 Exploratory soil borings and soil Borings 7440 through 7442, 7444 Characterize soil quality and determine
sampling, through 7446, and 7449, lithology.
9 8/92 - Benthic invertebrate sampling, Peverly Brook, Assess stream quality.
18 09/12/94



Table 1

Summary of Stage 4 Activities for Sites 9 and 11

Zone 5, Pease AFB, NH
(Continued)
Site No. Date Activity Scope Purpose
9 8/92 Survey. Locations 7440 through 7442, 7444 Establish accurate locations and
through 7446, and 7449. Resurvey 557, | elevations.
559, and 618. _

9 9/92 Slug tests. 559, 7446, and 7449. Evaluate overburden water-bearing unit

: characteristics.
9 9/92- Overburden monitor well and Monitor well 5099. Piezometers 7591, | Characterize overburden groundwater
10/92 piezometer installation. 7601, 7603, 7608, 7609, 7645, and 7654. | flow.

9 11/92 Groundwater sampling. Wells 557, 559, 618, 6034, 6035, 6043, Accurately characterize groundwater

7446, 7449, 7603, and 7609. quality by sampling new and older
locations.
9 11/92 Survey. ) Wells 5099, 7591, 7601, 7603, 7608, Establish accurate locations and
7609, 7645, 7654, and NIW-35. elevations.

9 5/93 Groundwater sampling. Monitor well 5048. Characterize groundwater quality;
monitor well 5048 was dry during
carlier sampling rounds.

9 6/93 Groundwater and surface water Piezometers 7645 and 7654. USGS Characterize groundwater and surface

sampling. well NIW-35. Boiling Springs water quality.
(location 814B).
11 7/91 Monthly water level measurement. Monitor wells and piezometers. Characterize overburden groundwater
Additional locations added as they flow patterns.
were completed.

1 8/91 Piezometer (groundwater) sampling. Piezometers 732 and 733. Characterize overburden groundwater
quality.

11 11/91 Exploratory soil borings and soil Soil borings 7379 through 7382. Evaluate soil quality.

sampling. Piezometer installed in boring 7382.

MKO!\RP’I‘:00628026.004\10ne5md.all
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Table 1

Summary of Stage 4 Activities for Sites 9 and 11

Zone 5, Pease AFB, NH
(Continued)
Site No. Date Activity Scope Purpose —,

11 5/92 Piezometer installation, Piezometer 7443, Assess thickness of Glacial Till (GT);
monitor bedrock groundwater flow.

1 5/92 Sample groundwater from piczometer VOCs, SVOCs, and inorganics. Assess potential bedrock groundwater

7443 prior to development. contamination,

11 9/92 Sample groundwater. Piezometer 7443, Evaluate potential bedrock groundwater
contamination.

11 9/92- Survey. Old and new points; bedrock outcrops. | Establish accurate locations and
elevations.

11 10/92 Resample groundwater, Piezometer 7443, Confirmational sampling,
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III. COMMUNITY PARTICIPATION

Throughout the recent history of Sites 9 and 11, there has been community concern and
involvement. EPA, NHDES, and the Air Force have kept the community and other
interested parties apprised of site activities through informational meetings, fact sheets, press
releases, Technical Review Committee meetings, and pubh'c.meetings.

In January 1991, the Air Force completed preparation of a community relations plan that
outlined a program to address community concerns and keep citizens informed and involved

during remedial activities.

Numerous fact sheets have been released by the Air Force throughout the IRP at Pease
AFB. These fact sheets are intended to keep the public and other concerned parties
apprised of developments and milestones in the Pease AFB IRP. The fact sheets released .

 to date that concern Sites 9 and 11 are summarized as follows:

Fact Sheet Release Date J
Pease AFB Installation Restoration Program Update : October 1991
Pease AFB Installation Restoration Program Update December 1992
Zone 5 Proposed Plan January 1994

In addition to the fact sheets, a number of public meetings have been held concerning the
remediation of Zone 5. On 14 November 1991, an IRP update public meeting was held,
and on 12 January 1993, an IRP public workshop and meeting were conducted to provide
. the public with information on the status of the Pease AFB IRP. On 1 March 1994, the Air
Force conducted a public hearing and informational session for the Zone 5 Proposed Plan,
during which oral comments on the Proposed Plan were received. A transcript of oral
comments received during this meeting and the Air Force’s response to comments are
included in the responsiveness summary (see Appendix A). A full transcript is available in

the Administrative Record file at Pease AFB. Responses to written comments received
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during this period also are included in Appendix A. In addition, a public comment period
for the Proposed Plan was conducted between 26 January 1994 and 10 March 1994,

An Administrative Record containing documents and correspondence pertaining to the
Pease AFB IRP is located in Building 43 at Pease AFB. An index of the Administrative
Record is maintained at EPA Region I in Boston, Massachusetts.

IV. SCOPE AND ROLE OF OPERABLE UNIT OR RESPONSE ACTION
A .

This ROD presents the selected remedy at Sites 9 and 11. Typically, remediation of
Superfund sites involves activities to remove or isolate contaminant source materials in
conjunction with activities that mitigate migration of contamination through groundwater
and/or surface water pathways.

Sites 9 and 11 have been investigated under the Air Force IRP beginning with a 1983
records search that identified the sites as areas of potential sources of contamination that
could be released to the environment. During Stages 1, 2, and 4, field work and data
analyses were performed to characterize surface and subsurface conditions at Sites 9 and
11 and their vicinity. The results of these investigations show that no contaminant source
materials were identified at Sites 9 and 11.

The baseline risk assessment for Site 9 indicated that the cancer risk to human receptors
resulting from incidental ingestion of, and dermal contact with, contaminated soil, sediment,
or surface water (filtered and unfiltered) at the site did not exceed EPA’s acceptable range
of 10° to 10* and the total hazard index for human receptors for the same exposure
scenarios did not exceed EPA’s benchmark of concern of 1. Both cancer and noncancer
risks posed by bedrock groundwater were within acceptable ranges based on organic
compounds and either filtered or unfiltered (total) Inorganic compounds (G-635). The
cancer risk posed by exposure to overburden groundwater (organic and inorganic
compounds) from filtered groundwater samples was slightly greater than 10 More than
99% of this calculated risk was due to the presence of arsenic. However, the calculated risk
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posed by arsenic in Site 9 overburden groundwater is.lower than that posed by arsenic at
the current Maximum Contaminant Level (MCL). MCLs are enforceable, human heaith-
based drinking water standards. The ecological risk assessment indicated that no signiﬁca.nt
adverse health effects on ecological receptors resulting from incidental ingestion of, or
dermal contact with, soil, surface water, or sediment are expected.

The potential for contaminants to leach from soil into groundwater resulting in human

receptor ingestion of, or direct contact with, contaminated water, was evaluated at Site 9.

" This evaluation indicated that existing concentrations of chemicals of concern (COCs) in

soil, subsequent to leaching, would not result in groundwater concentrations exceeding the
groundwater Remedial Action Objectives (RAOs). RAOs are defined as the general
conceptual goals of remedial actions, such as compliance with Applicable or Relevant and
Appropriate Requirements (ARARs) or reducing risks.

A baseline risk assessment was prepared as part of the Site 11 NFADD to evaluate whether
contaminant levels detected at the site pose unacceptable risks to human and ecoldgical
receptors. The results of the risk assessment indicated that soil and groundwater at the site
do not pose an unacceptable human health risk, or an unacceptable site-related ecological

risk.

In all media, for both sites, a comparison of site-specific .chemical concentrations with
" regulatory criteria and/or background concentrations revealed that existing contaminant

concentrations are within these criteria.

The concentrations of several metals from unfiltered groundwater samples collected at
CRD-1 exceeded regulatory guidelines. These elevated levels are most likely due to
sampling artifacts and are not representative of actual conditions at CRD-1. In late 1993,
EPA resampled four CRD-1 groundwater monitor wells using a low-flow sampling technique
t0 confirm the actual metals concentrations at the site. The results revealed that metals
concentrations were well below regulatory guidelines. In addition, metals concentrations in
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filtered groundwater samples from CRD-1 wells have consistently been below regulatory

levels.

Based on this assessment, no further action at Sites 9 and 11 is warranted under CERCLA.
However, mitigation/elimination of potential physical hazards associated with inert
construction debris at Site 9 will be performed under NHDES closure requirements for inert
construction debris landfills, independent of CERCLA.

V. SUMMARY OF SITE CHARACTERISTICS
aLavany O o111k CHARACTERISTICS

Section 1 of the Draft Final Zone 5 RI Report (G-635) contains an overview of the RI
activities conducted at Sites 9 and 11. Based on the results of the RI, a working conceptual
model was developed that incorporates all available data concerning Sites 9 and 11 and their
vicinity, including geological, hydrological, and analytical data; field measurements; aerial
photographs; and visual observations. The salient points of the model are summarized as

follows:
L Unsaturated overburden conditions exist in the vicinity of the bedrock ridge
between Sites 8 and 9. '
° A component of Site 8 overburden groundwater flows westward, from Site 8,

toward the bedrock ridge.
K The overburden is saturated approximately 100 feet west of the bedrock ridge.

° In the vicinity of the cemetery, bedrock groundwater containing low
concentrations of cis-1,2-dichloroethene (cis-1,2-DCE)- discharges to the

overburden.

®  No volatile organic compounds (VOCs) were detected in the groundwater
samples collected from the overburden piezometers located in the vicinity of
the cemetery. ‘

° A topographic low at Site 9 serves as a local recharge area.

. ‘Two overburden water-bearing units [Upper Sand (US) and Lower Sand (LS)]
are present across much of Site 9. Groundwater flow in both of these units
is predominantly to the west, toward the wetlands; however, in the northwest
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portion of the site, a portion of the groundwater in the US unit may flow
toward the northwest. '

° At Site 9, a downward vertical gradient exists between the US and LS water-
bearing units, although the hydrologic interconnection between these units is
limited by the low-permeability Marine Clay and Silt (MCS) unit.

° Groundwater in the US unit discharges to the wetlands in the vicinity of
Boiling Spring, located west of Site 9. '

° There does not appear to be significant impact from Site 9 on surface water
and sediment quality in Upper Peverly Brook.

° Limited (magnitude and extent) VOC contamination (concentrations below
MCLs) exists in the US and LS groundwater, with no identified source at Site
9.

° Across Site 9, groundwater in the bedrock flows from east to west, beneath
the wetlands. :

° With the exception of contamination associated with the Site 8 halogenated

hydrocarbon (HHC) bedrock groundwater ~plume, bedrock VOC .
contamination at Site 9 is at levels below MCLs and is primarily fuel-related
contaminants, potentially associated with aircraft takeoffs and landings.

A. Geology

This subsection provides a brief summary of basewide and site-specific geologfc conditions.
A more detailed descriptidn of Zone 5 geology is presented in the Draft Final Zone 5 RI
" Report (G-635). ‘

Bedrock _Geology

The bedrock in the vicinity of Pease AFB is composed of metamorphosed sedimentary,
volcanic, and intrusive igneous rocks of the Proterozoic to lower Ordovician age Merrimac
Group. This group includes the Kittery and Eliot Formations, which are variably composed
of quartzite, phyllite, and metagraywacke.
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The Eliot Formation comprises the bedrock underlying Site 9, where it is composed
primarily of phyllite and metagraywacke, commonly interbedded on a scale of centimeters.
The phyllite is light to medium gray, chlorite-quartz-sericite phyllite and dark green chlorite
phyllite, commonly with gray quartzite or metagraywacke laminations (2 to 4 mm thick).

The phyllite is moderately to strongly foliated with crenulations. The metagraywacke is a
tan-weathering, medium to dark gray, light green-gray, fine-to-medium grained, calcareous,
chlorite-sericite-quartz-feldspar metagraywacke. The metagraywacke commonly contains
. silvery gray phyllite laminations and is moderately foliated to massive. ‘

Bedding in the Eliot Formation is typically folded, striking northeast and dipping steeply to
the northwest (50 to 90 degrees). The Eliot Formation is typically moderately to strongly
foliated, with foliation commonly subparallel to the bedding. Natural fractures are typically
planar or stepped, moderately rough, and commonly iron-stained (limonite) where open.
Milky quartz, white calcite, and quartz-calcite veins are common.

The bedrock topographic map of the Site 9 area (see Figure 5) was constructed using
drilling logs (see Appendix C of the Draft Final Zone 5 RI Report) (G-635) and seismic
refraction survey data. There are no bedrock surface contours in areas where there are no
drilling logs to confirm the results of the seismic refraction survey, these areas are marked

as seismic low or seismic high.

The bedrock surface in the Site 9 area slopes toward the west, reaching a low of

approximately -5 ft MSL (see Figure 5). The maximum bedrock elevation is approximately
80 ft MSL near the Newington Town Garage. The dominant feature is a north-south-
trending bedrock valley located west of the former CRD-1 borrow pit area.
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Overburden Geology

The generalized stratigraphic sequence of the glacial deposits of coastal New England is (in
ascending order): till, stratified drift, including subaqueous outwash; marine clay and silt
of the Presumpscot Formation; and outwash, such as deltaic and subaqueous fans (G-468).

The glacially derived overburden at Pease AFB is Wisconsinan in age. Based on drilling
information, glaciomarine deposits have been divided into four units as follows (from oldest
to youngest):

Glacial Till (GT).

Lower Sand (LS).

Marine Clay and Silt (MCS).
Upper Sand (US). '

The overburden unit at Pease AFB also includes Recent age sediments, such as marsh
deposits and manmade fill. Although all of these units are present ‘at Site 9, one or more
of the units may be absent at any particular borehole location. Figure 6 shows the CTOSss

section in Zone 5, and the cross-section location is shown in Figure 2. |

B. Hydrogeology

Groundwater occurs in both the bedrock and the overlying unconsolidated deposits at Pease
AFB. In some areas of Pease AFB, the unconsolidated deposits are unsaturated, and the
water table occurs in the bedrock unit. At other locations, the MCS unit forms a confining
layer and separates the US water-bearing unit from the deeper water-bearing unit in the LS.
Groundwater across Site 9 was observed in the glacial deposits (GT, LS, MCS, and US) ahd
in bedrock. The overburden was observed to be unsaturated along the bedrock high east
of Site 9, and the US was seasonally unsaturated at well 5048 located due south of
Merrimac Drive. A summary of hydrogeologic conditions 6bserved at Site 9 is provided in
the following subsections. Additional information is provided in the Draft Final Zone S RI
Report (G-635).
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Overburden Hydrogeology

By convention, at locations where the MCS and LS are absent, the overburden water-
bearing unit is referred to as the US even though saturated conditions may exist in the GT
unit. Across Site 9, the saturated thickness in the US unit ranged from 0 feet in the
seasonally unsaturated areas (well 5048) to almost 40 feet at well location 6034. Seasonally
unsaturated conditions in the US appear to coincide with bedrock highs, and, in the case of
well 5048, with a knob of MCS (see Figures 6 and 7). Figure 7 is a contour map of the US
groundwater flow unit potehtiometric surface across Site 9, preparéd from data collected on
17 December 1992.

The saturated /unsaturated boundaries (as shown in Figure 5) were developed based on soil
boring and monitor well drilling logs and monthly water level measurements collected from
wells and piezometers. The maximum observed width of unsaturated overburden east of
Site 9 (from the vicinity of the Newingtén Town Garage) was approximately 500 feet. This
estimate is based on saturated overburden conditions observed during drilling and well
installation at locations 7751, 7752, and 7786. In addition, the horizontal hydraulic gradient
calculated for the US water-bearing unit (0.03 ft/ft) (see Figure 5), the requirements of
refracted boundaries on the flow path diagrams, and bedrock elevations were used to
estimate the western limit of unsaturated overburden. Based on this information, the
estimated western limit of unsaturated overburden in December 1992 coincided

approximately with the 85-ft MSL bedrock elevation contour (see Figure 5).

Groundwater elevations in the US unit ranged from a maximum of approximately 82 ft MSL
east of Site 9 near the unsaturated zone to a minimum of approximately 53 ft MSL near the
wetlands west of CRD-1. The groundwater contours shown in Figure 5 were constructed
to reflect groundwater elevations measured in the monitor wells and the constraints of the
vertical flow path diagrams of the Draft Final Zone 5 FS Report (G-634). Based on the
elevation of the top of the MCS near the wetlands (<41 ft MSL), the westerly flow of
groundwater in the US unit, the presence of Boiling Spring, and the elevation of
groundwater in the US and surface water in the wetlands, groundwater in the US unit most
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likely discharges to the wetlands west of CRD-1. Examination of Figure 5 reveals that,
between well 5099.and piezometer 7608, groundwater in the US unit flows westward, toward
the wetlands, at a horizontal gradient of 0.02 ft/ft. In the vicinity of well 559, coincident
with the presence of the MCS unit, the horizontal hydraulic gradient decreased significantly,
to approximately 0.0002 ft/ft. Using an effective porosity of 0.25 and a horizontal hydraulic
gradient of 233 to 285 ft/day (G-635), the US groundwater velocity at Site 9 is expected to
range from approximately 1.49 to 16.0 ft/day.

. Bedrock Hydrogeology

Figure 8 is a contour map of the bedrock potentiometric surface across Zone 5, prepared
from data recorded on 17 December 1992, Water elevations measured from shallow
bedrock wells and hybrid wells were included for reference, but were not used to contour
the potentiometric surface. Groundwater flows in the bedrock from the regional bedrock
and potentiometric high east of Site 8 toward the west and northwest across Zone 3.
Lithologic heterogeneities in the bedrock (e.g., diabase dikes) and bedrock iopography may
influence groundwater flow locally, but appear to have little influence on the regional
bedrock groundwater flow pattern. The groundwater velocity in bedrock across Site 9 is
estimated to range from approximately 32 to 120 ft/day, based on a range of horizontal
hydraulic gradients of 0.008 to 0.03, a hydraulic conductivity of 4.1 ft/day, and an effective
porosity of 0.001 (G-635). Based on 17 December 1992 measurements across Site 9,
 bedrock groundwater flows at a horizontal gradient of 0.03 ft/ft.

C. Distribution of Contamination

Site 9 Soil Quali

Throughout the three stages of investigation at Site 9, soil samples were collected in areas
suspected to be potential contaminant sources. During these in‘)estigaﬁons, construction
debris was identified at the site. The soil quality at Site 9 does not appear to have been
significantly affected by the construction debris or by previous site activities. To evaluate

whether contaminant concéntrations in the soil were related to previous site activities or
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could impact human health or the environment, the detected concentrations were compared
to background concentrations and a risk assessment was performed. In addition, where
appropriate, the detected concentrations were compared to EPA and NHDES regulatory
criteria.

In general, relatively low concentrations and sparse occurrences of soii contaminants were
detected at the northern and western portions of CRD-1. The VOCs detected in Site 9 soil
samples were present at low concentrations. Total petroleum hydrocarbons (TPHs) were
detected at two locations at concentrations above NHDES guidelines for virgin petroleum
éontaminaﬁon. Only one of the locations, however, contained TPHs at a. concentration
above background concentrations.

Semivolatile organic compounds (SVOCs) were detected at eight of iO soil sampling
locations at Site 9. The presence of these SVOCs is likely attributable to comstruction
debris such as asphalt. Low concentrations of pesticides were detected in Site 9 soil
samples, and the levels detected did not pose unacceptable risks to human and ecological

receptors.

With the exception of isolated, low-concentration detections of SVOCs and TPHs associated
with asphalt in soil collected at CRD-1, the contamination distribution does not appear to
be related to known site activities.

Site 9 Groundwater Quali

Monitor wells were constructed in each water-bearing unit at Site 9 at locations
downgradient of potential sources of groundwater contamination. To determine whether
the compounds detected in groundwater were related to previous site activities or could
impact human health or the environment, the detected groundwater contaminant
concentrations were compared to background concentrations, and a risk assessment was
performed. In addition, where appropriate, detected concentrations were compared to EPA
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and NHDES regulatory criteria. Based on the analytical results of groundwater samples
collected from the Site 9 monitor wells, it was concluded that groundwater quality at Site
9 has not been affected by previous site activities.

The low concentrations of VOCs observed in groundwater samples collected from
overburden and bedrock wells at CRD-1 did not exceed MCLs, and are most likely related
to Site 8 activities. The contaminated groundwater at Site 8 will be treated as part of the
Site 8 remedial action. With the exception of contamination associated with the Site 8 HHC
bedrock groundwater plume, bedrock VOC contamination at CRD-1 is primarily fuel-related
contaminants, and is not believed to be associated with Site 9 activities. A source area for
this contamination has not been identified at CRD-1. No SVOCs or pesticides were

detected in overburden groundwater samples.

Site 9 Surface Water and Sediment Quality

Peverly Brook is located west of CRD-1, with its headwaters iinmediatély at the end of the |
runway. Polynuclear aromatic hydrocarbons (PAHs) and TPHs were detected in sediment
samples collected from Peverly Brook, but, based on the hydrogeologic regime, these
contaminants are most likely related to deposits from jet engine exhaust, or to preservatives
used on the runway light supports, rather than disposal activities at CRD-1. Metals
concentrations detected in the surface water and sediment at this site appear to be naturally
occurring, and are not related to site activities. Oné organic compound (toluene) was
detected in a single surface water sample. However, the presence. of this compound is likely
related to aircraft takeoffs and landings and not to site-related activities. Surface water and
sediment quality in the wetlands and Upper Peverly Brook do not appear to have been
affected by CRD-1 activities.

Site 11 Soil Quali

Throughout the three stages of investigation at Site 11, soil samples were collected in areas

suspected to be potential contaminant sources. Based on these investigations, no discrete
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contaminant source was identified at the site. Furthermore, the soil quality at Site 11 does
not appear to be significantly affected by the reported site activities. To determine whether
the compounds detected in soil were related to previous site activities or could impact
human health or the environment, the detected contaminant concentrations in soil were
compared to background concentrations established for off-base soil, and a risk assessment
was performed. In addition, where appropriate, contaminant concentrations were compared
to EPA and NHDES regulatory criteria.

TPHs were detected in Site 11 soil samples at concentrations below both background
concentrations and NHDES guidelines established for virgin petroleum-contaminated soil.
Toluene, a VOC that is typically present in fuels and solvents, was detected in soil collected
from two soil sampling locations. The detected concentrations of toluene were two orders
of magnitude below NHDES cleanup guidelines. No SVOCs or pesticides were detected

above trace concentrations.

Site 11 Gronng' water Quality

Monitor wells were constructed in locations at Site 11 suspected of containing groundwater
contamination. To evaluate whether contaminant concentrations in the groundwater were
related to previous site activities or could impact human health or the environment, these
concentrations were compared to background concentrations obtained off base, and a risk
assessment was performed. In addition, where appropriate, the detected concentrations
were compared against EPA and NHDES regulatory criteria. Based on the analytical results
of groundwater samples collected from six monitor wells, and on the comparison with
background and risk-based concentrations, the groundwater quality at Site 11 has not been
affected by past site activities.

Metals were detected in Site 11 unfiltered groundwater samples at concentrations above
regulatory guidelines. However, these elevated levels are most likely due to suspended
sediment, which also affected the detected metals concentrations at nearby CRD-1. The
concentrations of several metals from unfiltered groundwater samples collected at CRD-1
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exceeded regulatory guidelines. These elevated levels are most likely due to sampling
artifacts and are not representative of actual conditions at CRD-1. In late 1993, EPA
resampled four CRD-1 groundwater monitor wells using a low-flow sampling technique to
confirm the actual metals concentrations at the site. The results revealed that metals
concentrations were well below regulatory guidelines. In addition, metals concentrations in
filtered groundwater samples from CRD-1 wells have consistently been below regulatory

levels.

~ Nitrate/nitrite was detected in one groundwater sample from Site 11 collected in December
1988 at a concentration that exceeded the nitrate/nitrite MCL. Nitrate/nitrite was detected
in subsequent samples from the same well at concentrations below the MCL. Low
concentrations of trichloroethene (TCE) were detected in groundwater samples collected
from one piezometer. The absence of this compound in soil samples collected across the
site suggests that its presence also is localized. In addition, the overburden and bedrock
groundwater flow directions between Site 8 and 11 indicate that the low levels of TCE

detected at the one location at Site 11 do not oﬁginate from Site 8 (see Figures 7 and 8). '

V1. SUMMARY OF SITE RISKS

Human health and ecological risk assessments were performed to estimate the probability
and magnitude of potential adverse human health and environmental effects from exposure
to contaminants associated with Sites 9 and 11 in Zone 5. The human health risk
assessment followed a four-step process:
1. Contaminant identification, which identified those hazardous substances that,
given the specifics of the site, were of significant concern.
2. Exposure assessment, which identified actual or potential exposure pathways,
characterized the potentially exposed populations, and determined the extent

of possible exposure.

3. Toxicity assessment, which considered the types and magnitude of adverse
health effects associated with exposure to hazardous substances.
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4, Risk characterization, which integrated the three earlier steps to summarize
the potential and actual risks posed by cancer risks.

The results of the baseline human health and ecological risk assessments for Sites 9 and 11

are discussed in the subsections that follow.

Site 9

A baseline risk assessment was prepared as part of the RI to evaluate whether contaminant
concentrations in Zone S soil, groundwater, surface water, or sediment pose unacceptable
risks to human and ecological receptors. The risk assessment for Site 9 was based on the
following current and future use scenarios. Under current land use conditions (i.e.,
inactive), access to Site 9 is limited to maintenance workers and trespassers. A maintenance
worker was selected as the current RME for the soil pathway for Site 9. A current
maintenance worker was assumed to be more likely than a trespasser to come into direct
contact with soil on a regular basis. Because groundwater is not currently used at Site 9,
a current RME was not selected for the groundwater pathway. It was also assumed that
future land use of Site 9 will continue as industrial. Site 9 is located at the end of the
runway, which will continue to operate in the future. Therefore, Site 9 is expected to be
inactive in the future, serving only as an access route to the runway for the maintenance of
runway lights. Future receptors at Site 9 would be limited to maintenance workers and
trespassers. Therefore, a maintenance worker was chosen as the future RME for the soil
paihway for Site 9. An off-base resident was selected as the future RME for the
groundwater pathway for Site 9. The results of the risk assessment for Site 9 are

summarized in this subsection.
Human Health Risk
The results of the baseline risk assessment for Site 9, completed as part of the RI, indicated

that no unacceptable adverse health effects on human receptors resulting from incidental

ingestion of, or dermal contact with, contaminated soil, sediment, or surface water are
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expected. Cancer risks are within EPA’s acceptable risk range of 10* to 10%, and hazard

indices are less than 1.

Both cancer and noncancer risks posed by bedrock groundwater are within acceptable
ranges. The cancer risk posed by exposure to overburden groundwater was greater than 10™
(ranging from approximately 1 x 10 to 5 x 10”°). More than 99% of the risk reflected the
presence of arsenic. Arsenic is naturally occurring at Pease AFB, and it was detected at
concentrations below the MCL (50 .g/L). Consequently, the calculated risk posed by
arsenic in Site 9 overburden Qoundwater is lower than that posed by arsenic at the current -
MCL. At the current MCL for arsenic, the lifetime cancer risk to an individual through
drinking water ingestion is calculated to range from approximately 2 x 10 to 3 x 103

Ecological Risk

The baseline risk assessment for Site 9 indicated that no significant adverse health effects
on ecological receptors resulting from ingestion of, or contact with, soil or surface water are
expected. The total hazard indices for ecological receptors associated with ingestion of soil
did not exceed 1. The total hazard indices for the ecological receptors associafed with
surface water were greater than 1, but were less than 10 based on average surface water
concentrations. A hazard index between 1 and 10 is subject to interpretation based on the
toxicity of the ¢chemical and the uncertainty in the calculation. The less toxic the chemical,
and the more uncertainty in the risk calculation, the less concern is associated with hazard -
indices between 1 and 10. The primary contributor to chronic surface water risk (83% of
total risk) in Peverly Brook was aluminum, which exceeded criteria in one sample only.
Hazard indices for ecological receptors as a result of exposure to sediment exceeded 10.
The primary contributors to sediment risk were PAHs and pesticides. Maximum hazard
quotients for pesticides detected in Peverly Brook sediments, based on NOAA ER-L and
ER-M values, exceeded 10. However, based on equilibrium partitioning, a method
recognized by EPA as a measure of bioavailability, an exceedance of 10 occurred at only
one sediment sampling location (hazard quotient = 1,930). PAHs, although detected
throughout the sediment sampling stations in Peverly Brook, were near or below established
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PAH background levels for Pease AFB. The maximum hazard quotients (based on ER-L
and ER-M values) for those PAHs slightly above background were greater than 10.
However, based on equilibrium partitioning, there were no hazard quotients greater than
1. Given the single exceedance of a hazard quotient of 10 for pesticides, and no
exceedances of a hazard quotient of 1 for PAHs as determined by equilibrium partitioning,

the ecological risks for sediments were found to be at an acceptable level.

The baseline risk assessment, presented in Section 6 of the Draft Final Zone 5 RI Report
~ (G-635), is available -in the Administrative Record at the Pease AFB Information
Repository.

Site 11

A baseline risk assessment was prepared as part of the NFADD to evaluate whether
contaminant levels detected at Site 11 pose unacceptable risks to human and ecological
receptors. The risk assessment for Site 11 was based on the following current and future
use scenarios. Because of the proximity of Site 11 to the aircraft parking apron and ruﬁway,
it was assumed that future use of Site 11, as with current use, would be restricted to
commercial/industrial use (i.., residential development would not occur). A maintenance
worker was chosen as the RM:E for the soil pathway. A future off-site adult resident was
selected as the RME for the groundwater pathway. Groundwater is not currently used at

Site 11. The results of the risk assessment are summarized in this subsection.

Human Health Risk

The results of the risk assessment revealed that exposure to soil and groundwater does not
pose a risk (either cancer or noncancer) to potential current or future receptors at the site
above the EPA threshold criteria. Cancer risks are within EPA’s acceptable risk range of
10 to 106, and hazard indices are less than 1.
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Ecological Risk

Ecological risk was determined for representative ecologiéal species at Site 11. The
maximum reported concentrations for the chemicals in surface soil exceeded risk-based
concentrations for only one compound (4,4'-DDT). While 4,4’-DDT at the maximum
reported concentration does present a potential risk to ecological receptors, 4,4’-DDT was
only positively identified (0.037 J mg/kg) in one 0- to 2-foot-deep soil sample.

VII. STATUTORY DETERMINATION
A. Rationale for Selecting No Action at Site 9

The statutory determinations required by CERCLA Section 121 for remedial actions are not
applicable because risk-based levels are not exceeded at Site 9.

. The baseline risk assessment conducted during the RI at Site 9 (see Section VI) provides
the basis for concluding that Site 9 poses no current or potential future threat to human
health or the environment. More information on the baseline risk assessment is presented
in the Draft Final Zone S RI Report (G-635). Concentrations of contaminants in
environmental media at the site do not create human health and environmental risks
resulting from exposure to site-related contaminants exceeding EPA’s acceptable ranges.
Therefore, no action is required under CERCLA.

B. Rationale for Selecting No Action at Site 11

The statutory determinations required by CERCLA Section 121 for remedial actions are not

_applicable because risk-based levels are not exceeded at Site 11.

The baseline risk assessment, as described in Section VI, conducted duﬁng the NFADD
provides the basis for concluding that the conditions at Site 11 pose no current or potential
future threat to human health or the environment. The human health and environmental
risks do not exceed EPA’s acceptable ranges. Groundwater quality at Site 11 meets state
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and federal primary drinking water standards and ambient water quality criteria. The
minimal surficial contamination observed at Site 11 did not exceed NHDES soil cleanup
guidelines. Therefore, no further action is required. More information on the baseline risk
assessment is presented in the IRP Site 11 NFADD (G-619). The current and future
controls on the property, as stipulated by the FFA in the airport public benefit transfer, will
ensure that the Site 11 area will only be used consistent with the risk assumptions specified
in Section VL

VII. DOCUMENTATION OF SIGNIFICANT CHANGES

_ The Air Force presented a no action Zone 5 Proposed Plan for Sites 9 and 11 in January
1994 (G-671). There have been no changes in the selected alternatives since submission of
the Draft Final Zone 5 FS Report (G-634) and Zone 5 (Sites 9 and 11) Proposed Plan

(G-671).

IX. STATE ROLE
NHDES reviewed the various alternatives and has indicated its support for the selected '
remedy. NHDES has jurisdiction over Site 9 closure activities, and closure plans will be

coordinated with the appropriate NHDES divisions. A copy of the Declaration of

Concurrence is provided as Appendix A.

MKO01\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod.all 46 09/13/94



REFERENCES

G-84 CH,M Hill. 1984. Installation Restoration Program Records Search for Pease AFB,
NH.

G-468 Smith, G.W. and L.E. Hunter.  1989. "Late Wisconsinan Deglaciation of Coastal
Maine." In: Studiesin Maine Geology — Volume 6: Quaternary Geology. R.D. Tucker
and R.G. Marvinney (eds.). Maine Geological Survey. pp. 13-32.

G-525 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1986. Installation Restoration Program, Phase II
— Confirmation/Quantification, Stage 1 Final Report, Pease AFB, NH. June 1986.

. G-530 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1988. Interim Technical Report No. 1 for the

Installation Restoration Program Stage 2, Pease AFB, NH. February 1988.

G-531 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1988. Interim Technical Report No. 2 for the
Installation Restoration Program, Stage 2, Pease AFB, NH. August 1988.

G-533 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1989. Installation Restoration Program, Stage 2
Draft Final Report, Pease AFB, NH.

G-536 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1989. Interim Technical Report No. 3 for the
Installation Restoration Program, Stage 2, Pease AFB, NH. February 1989.

G-537 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1989. Interim Technical Report No. 4 for the
Installation Restoration Program, Stage 2, Pease AFB, NH. April 1989.

G-569 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1991. Wetlands Determination Report, Pease AFB,
NH. Phase 3 Investigation. June 1991.

G-599 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1992. Off- Base Well Inventory Letter Report Pease
AFB, NH. 17 September 1992.

G-619 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1993. Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4, Site
11 No Further Action Decision Document, Pease AFB, NH. February 1993.

G-621 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1993. Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4,
Wetlands Determination Report, Pease AFB, NH. February 1993.

G-634 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1993. Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4,
Zone 5 Draft Final Feasibility Study Report, Pease AFB, NH. October 1993.

G-635 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1993. Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4,
Zone 5 Draft Final Remedial Investigation, Pease AFB, NH. September 1993.

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod.ref - 47 09/09/94



REFERENCES
(Continued)

G-671 WESTON (Roy F. Weston, Inc.). 1994. Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4,
Zone 5 Draft Proposed Plan, Pease AFB, NH. J amary 1994.

MK01\RPT:00628026.004\zone5rod ref 48 09/09/94



AFB
AFCEE/ERB
ARAR
CERCLA

coC
CRD-1
DEQPPM
DOD
EDB
EER
EM
EPA
FDTA-2
FEMA
FFA
FMS
FS
ft MSL
GT
HHC
HQ AFBCA
IRP
ITR
LS
MAG
MCL
MCS
'MOU
NFADD
NHANG
NHDES
NPL
PA
PAH
PDA
QAPP
RAO
RCRA
RI
RI/FS
RME
ROD
SAP

LIST OF ACRONYMS

Air Force Base

Air Force Center for Environmental Excellence/Base Closure Division

Applicable or Relevant and Appropriate Requirement

Comprehensive Environmental Response, Compensation, and Liability

Act
chemical of concern
Construction Rubble Dump 1

Defense Environmental Quality Program Policy Memorandum

Department of Defense

ethylene dibromide

electrical earth resistivity
electromagnetic

U.S. Environmental Protection Agency
Fire Department Training Area 2
Federal Emergency Management Agency

Federal Facilities Agreement

Fuel Maintenance Squadron Equipment Cleaning Site
Feasibility Study

feet above mean sea level

Glacial Till :

halogenated hydrocarbon

Headquarters Air Force Base Conversion Agency
Installation Restoration Plan :
Interim Technical Report

Lower Sand

Military Airlift Group

Maximum Contaminant Level

Marine Clay and Silt

Memorandum of Understanding

No Further Action Decision Document

New Hampshire Air National Guard

New Hampshire Department of Environmental Services
National Priorities List

Preliminary Assessment

polynuclear aromatic hydrocarbon

Pease Development Authority

Quality Assurance Project Plan

Remedial Action Objective

Resource Conservation and Recovery Act
Remedial Investigation

Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study
reasonable maximum exposure

Record of Decision

Sampling and Analysis Plan
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SARA
SCOPE

SI

SVOCs
TCE

TPHs

TRC

Uus -
USAFOEHL
USGS

VLF
WESTONg

LIST OF ACRONYMS
(Continued)

Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization Act
Seacoast Citizens Overseeing Pease Environment
Site Investigation

semivolatile organic compounds

trichloroethene

total petroleum hydrocarbons

Technical Review Committee

Upper Sand

U.S. Air Force Occupational and Environmental Health Laboratory

U.S. Geological Survey
very low-frequency
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
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State of New Hampshire
DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
6 Hazen Drive, P.O. Box 95, Concord, NH 03302-0095

—~
NHDE S 603-271-3503 FAX 603-271-2867
—_— TDD Access: Relay NH 1-800-735-2964

September 13, 1994

Mr. Alan K. Olsen

Director, Air Force Base Conversion Agency
1700 North Moore Street, Suite 2300
Arlington, VA 22209-2802

Re: Record of Decision for Zone 5
Pease Air Force Base Superfund Site
Pease Air Force Base, New Hampshire

Subject: Declaration of Concurrence
Dear Mr. Olsen:

In accordance with the Comprehensive Environmental Response, Compensation,
and Liability Act of 1986 (CERCLA), the Air Force has prepared the "Record of Decision
for Zone 5" (Zone 6 ROD) which presents the no-action decisions for two of three Areas
of Concern (AOCs) in Zone 5 at the Pease Air Force Base Superfund Site. The Zone 5
AOCs, identified in Appendix Il of the "Pease Federal Facility Agreement Under CERCLA
Section 120" (Pease FFA), are: 1.) Site 9 - Construction Rubble Dump 1; 2.) Site 11 -
Field Maintenance Squadron Equipment Cleaning Site; and, 3.) Site 8 - Fire Department
Training Area 2. The Zone 5 ROD addresses Sites 9 and 11 while Site 8 will be
addressed in a separate ROD.

As a party to the Pease FFA, and acting as agent for the State of New Hampshire,
the Department concurs with the no-action decisions selected under CERCLA for Sites 9
and 11. Although no action under CERCLA is required, due to the nature of some of the
material at Site 9 (Construction Rubble Dump 1), the Department's Solid Waste Rules
require closure of this site as a solid waste facility.

Whereas the Air Force has agreed to close Site 9 under State authority, {as
opposed to CERCLA authority), the Air Force will be required to comply with all
administrative, as well as substantive, requirements. (i.e., The Air Force will be required
to obtain all applicable permits such as a Temporary Permit for the closure of a solid waste
facility , a Significant Alteration-of-Terrain Permit, and Groundwater Management Pemit.)

AIR RESOURCES DIV. WASTE MANAGEMENT DIV. ‘WATER RESOURCES DIV. WATER SUPPLY & POLLUTION CONTROL DIV.
64 No. Main Street 6 Hazen Drive 64 No. Main Street PO.Box 95

Caller Box 2033 Concord. N.H. 03301 P.O. Box 2008 Concord. N.H. 03302-0095

Concord. N.H. 03302-2033 Tel. 603-271-2900 Concord, N.H. 03302-2008 Tel. 603-271-3503

Tel. 603-271-1370 Fax 603-271-2456 Tel. 603-271-3406 - Fax 603-271-2181

Fax 603-271-1381 Fax 603-271-6588



Letter to Alan K. Olsen

Re: Zone 5 ROD Declaration of Concurrence
September 13, 1994

Page 2

The Department's solid waste facility closure standards mandate, "...all facilities
shall be closed in a manner that does not endanger public health or adversely affect the
environment and which minimizes the potential for accidents that could lead to personal
injury or property damage” (Env-Wm 312.01). The Department will review the following
closure design documents and monitoring plans in order to ensure compliance with
applicable State regulations:

- The capping system; : :

- The gas management system and post-closure landfill gas monitoring plan
(if necessary); '

- The landfill settiement monitoring system and monitoring plan;

- The stormwater management (drainage) system;

- The groundwater and surface water monitoring system;

- Long-term operation and maintenance plan; and

- Post closure access control systems.

Long-term monitoring will be necessary in order to determine the effectiveness of
the closure actions at Site 9. Water quality monitoring is determined on a site specific
basis and will be addressed in the Groundwater Management Permit. Frequency and
location of water quality monitoring is typically required on a tri-annual basis until a
baseline condition is established. A comprehensive, detailed review of the monitoring data
will be conducted by the Air Force and the Department in order to ensure the closure
action provides adequate protection of human health and the environment and complies
with applicable regulations.

Sincerely,

Robert W. Varney E—-
Commissioner

cc: Philip J. O'Brien, Ph.D., Director, DES-WMD
Carl W. Baxter, P.E., DES-WMEB
Richard H. Pease, P.E., DES-WMEB
Martha A. Moore, Esq., NHDOJ-AGO
Michael J. Daly, EPA
Arthur L. Ditto, P.E., AFBCA
James Snyder, AFCEE
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RESPONSIVENESS SUMMARY
OVERVIEW

The Air Force issued the Zone 5 Proposed Plan to the public in January of 1994. In this
Zone S Proposed Plan the Air Force identified its preferred alternatives for the two sites,
Site 9 and Site 11. The selection of these preferred alternatives by the Air Force was
coordinated with USEPA Region 1 and NHDES. The preferred alternative involves no-
action at each of the sites.

The sections below describe the background on community involvement with Zone 5
activities and the Air Force’s response to both written and verbal comments received during
the Zone 5 Proposed Plan Public Comment Period of January 26, 1994 to March 10, 1994.

BACKGROUND ON COMMUNITY INVOLVEMENT

Prior to the start of the public comment period the Air Force issued a Fact Sheet that
summarized the contents of the Zone 5 Proposed Plan. Presentations on the status of work
being conducted and results of the work in the Zone 5 area were made to the Pease AFB
Technical Review Committee (TRC). Additionally, the content of the Zone 5 Proposed
Plan was presented to and discussed with the members of the TRC. Announcements were
mailed to.all individuals on the Pease AFB mailing list in January 1994 prior to the
beginning of the public comment period. Additionally, press releases were issued to the
media announcing the beginning of the public comment period. Announcements were
published in two local newspapers prior to the public hearing date of March 1, 1994. The
original public hearing, scheduled for February 9, 1994, had to be postponed .due to
inclement weather. Notices of cancellation were sent to all media and interested parties.
The rescheduled public hearing date and public comment period extension announcements
were published in two local newspapers. It is noted that the public comment period and
public hearing for Zone 5 ran concurrent with Site 8. Proposed remedial actions for Zone
5 and Site 8 were presented together to the public.

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS RECEIVED DURING THE COMMENT PERIOD AND AIR -
FORCE RESPONSES

During the public comment period, written comments were received from one group and
one verbal comment relative to Zone 5 was made by a Citizen’s group at a public hearing.

1. Comment (written): What is the Plan for the landscape restoration of Zone 5?

Response: Zone S designates an area of Pease AFB where several sites have
been grouped together, in.this case Sites 8,9, and 11. In the case
of Zone 5, restoration does not occur for the total zone area but
only for the sites covered in the Zone 5 Proposed Plan. For Site
11 no action has been selected, therefore, no site restoration will
be necessary. An earthen cap will be constructed over the Site 9
area. This cap will include seeding of the covered area.
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2. Comment (verbal):  As for Site 9, the Construction Rubble Dump, SCOPE concurs
that no further action is required other than to close out this site
under the State of New Hampshire’s landfill closure regulations.

3. Comment (verbal): Likewise with Site 11, the Field Maintenance Squadron’s
equipment cleaning site, it should require no further action.

Response: The Air Force acknowledges SCOPE’s concurrence with the
preferred alternatives for these two sites.
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ADMINISTRATIVE RECORD FILE INDEX

FOR THE

INSTALLATION RESTORATION PROGRAM
PEASE AIR FORCE BASE

NEW HAMPSHIRE

JANUARY 1994
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ABOUT THE ADMINISTRATIVE RECORD FILE

The administrative record file is a collection of documents which form the basis for
the selection of a response action at a Superfund site. Under section 113(k) of the
Comprehensive Environmental Response, Compensation and Liability Act (CERCLA), the
U.S. Air Force is required to establish an administrative record file for every Superfund
response action and to make a copy of the administrative record available at or near the
site.

The administrative record file must be reasonably available for public review during
normal business hours. The record file should be treated as a non-circulating reference
document. This will allow the public greater access to the volumes and also minimize the
risk of loss or damage. Individuals may photocopy any documents in the non-confidential -
portion of the file, according to the photocopying procedures at the local repository.

The documents in the administrative record file may become lost or damaged during
use. If this occurs, contact the administrative record file manager at Pease AFB.
Documents may be added to the administrative record file as site work progresses. This
index will be updated as documents are added to the administrative record file.

The administrative record file will be maintained in Building 43 at Pease AFB.
Questions and/or comments about the administrative record file should be directed to:

Arthur L. Ditto, Remedial Project Manager
Air Force Base Disposal Agency
Operating Location A, Building 43
61 International Drive
Pease AFB, NH 03803-0157
(603) 430-2586

Dynamac Corporation assisted in the organization, establishment and on-site setup of the
Administrative Record File at Pease Air Force Base.
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ABOUT THE INDEX NUMBERING SYSTEM

Document Number -

Comprised of a 3 letter site code (PEA), the category number,
the entry number and the page range of a document. (Both
page numbers will be the same for a one page document.) If
documents are eventually placed on a microfiche system, the
document number consists of the site code followed by the
microfilm reel and frame number.

Example: PEA (1.1) #1 001-031

Site Code (Category #) Entry # Page Range

PEA (1.1) . #1 001-031

Long Title The long title and brief description of document.

Author Indicates anthor or primary originator of document. If a
contractor prepared the document, indicates company
and location.

Recipient Indicates primary recipient of document.

Date Indicates date document was issued.

'Iype Indicates document type

Second Reference

Location

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\zone5rod.apc
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1.0

20

3.0

4.0

5.0

ADMINISTRATIVE RECORD FILE STRUCTURE

SITE IDENTIFICATION

1.1 Background - RCRA and other Information

12 Notification/Site Inspection Reports

13 Preliminary Assessment (PA) Report

14 Site Investigation (SI) Report

1.5 Previous Operable Unit Information

1.6 Correspondence

REMOVAL RESPONSES

21 Sampling and Analysis Plans

22 Sampling and Analysis Data / Chain of Custody
23 EE/CA Approval Memorandum (Non-Time-Critical Removals)
24 EE/CA (Engineering Evaluation / Cost Analysis)
25 Action Memorandum

2.6 Amendments to Action Memorandum

27 Removal Response Reports

28 Correspondence

REMEDIAL INVESTIGATION (RI) |

3.1 Sampling and ‘Analysis Plan (SAP)

32 Sampling and Analysis Data/Chain of Custody Forms
33 Work Plan

34 Preliminary RI Field Work Reports

35 Remedial Investigation (RI) Reports

3.6 Correspondence

FEASIBILITY STUDY (FS)

4.1 ARAR Determinations

42 Feasibility Reports

43 Proposed Plan

44 Supplements and Revisions to the Proposed Plan
45 Correspondence

RECORD OF DECISION (ROD)

5.1 ROD

52. Amendments to ROD

53 Explanations of Significant Differences

54 Correspondence
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6.0 STATE AND FEDERAL COORDINATION
6.1 Cooperative Agreements/SMOAs
6.2 Federal Facility Agreement (FFA)
6.3 Coordination - State/Federal
6.4 General Correspondence
7.0 ENFORCEMENT
7.1 Enforcement History
7.2 Endangerment Assessments
7.3 Administrative Orders
74 Consent Decrees
7.5 Affidavits ‘
7.6 Documentation of Technical Discussions/Response Actions
7.7 Notice Letters and Responses
80 HEALTH ASSESSMENTS
8.1 ATSDR Health Assessments
82 Toxicological Profiles
83 General Correspondence
9.0 NATURAL RESOURCE TRUSTEES
9.1 Notices Issued
9.2 Findings of Fact
93 Reports
9.4 General Correspondence
10.0 PUBLIC PARTICIPATION
10.1 Comments and Responses
10.2 Community Relations Plan
103 ~ Public Notice(s) (Availability of the Admin.
Availability of the Proposed Plan, Public Meetings)
104 Public Meeting Transcripts
10.5 Documentation of other Public Meetings
10.6 Fact Sheets, Press Advisories, and News Releases
10.7 Responsiveness Summary
10.8 Late Comments
109 Technical Review Committee Charter
10.10 - Correspondence
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1.0 TECHNICAL SOURCES, GUIDANCE, AND PROCEDURES DOCUMENTS

11.1 EPA Headquarters Guidance
11.2 EPA Regional Guidance
113 - State Guidance
114 Air Force Guidance
115 Technical Sources
11.6 Proposed Procedures/Procedures
11.7 Correspondence
12.0 CONFIDENTIAL FILE
12.1 Privileged Documents (Extractions)
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DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECTPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

1.1 Background - RCRA azd Other Information

PEA (1.1) #1 001-031 )

"Scope of Work for the Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study”
Pease Air Force Base

EPA, NHDES

April 1991

Scope of Work for RUFS

None

ARF, IR

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\z0neS rod.ape C-6

09/09/94



1.2 Notificaticn/Site Inspection Reports

* NOTE: NO ENTRIES IN THIS SECTION AT THIS TIME

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:
TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:
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DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

. LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:
DATE:
TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

13 Preliminary Assessment (PA) Report

PEA (1.3) #1 001-068
“Phase II Problem Confirmation and Quantification Presurvey Report (Field Sampling for SI Work) "
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES, USAF Occupational and Environmental Health Lsb (OEHL), Brooks AFB, TX

June 1984
Technical Report
Noge

AR-F: IR

PEA (1.3) #2 001-182

"Installation Restoration Program Records Search”

CH2M Hill

EPA; NHDES; USAF Engineering & Services Center, Tyndall AFB; SAC, Offutt AFB, NE
January 1984 )

Technical Report

None

ARF, IR

PEA (1.3) #3 001-041

“Preliminary Assessment — Updated PA Report™*
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

20 July 1990

Letter Report

None

ARF, IR

PEA (1.3) #4 001-12

Final Preliminasy Assessment Report Portsmouth Refuse to Energy Plant
ICF Kaiser Engineers, Inc.

286 Congress Street, 7th Floor

Boston, Massachusetts 02210

USAF

November 1991

Report

None

ARF, IR

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\z00¢Srod.ape C-8 .
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1.4 Site Investigation (ST) Report

PEA (1.4) #1 001-309

“Installation Restoration Program, Phase I - Confirmation/Quantification Stage I, Volume 1 (Final Report for Period

October 1984 - July 1986)"

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

HQ SAC/SGPB, Offutt AFB, NE; EPA; NHDES
August 1986 .

Technical Report: Field Investigations

None

ARF, IR

PEA (1.4) #2 001-883

“Installation Restorstion Program, Phase II - Confirmation/Quantification Stage 1, Volume I (Appendices)*®
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

HQ SAC/SGFB, Offutt AFB, NE; EPA; NHDES

August 1987

Technical Report: Field Investigations

None

ARF, IR

PEA (1.4) #3 001-308 .

“Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3B Preliminary Assessment/Site Inspection”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA; NHDES; HQ SAC/DE, Offutt AFB, NE; AFSC HSD/YAQ, Brooks AFB, TX
February 1991

Technical Report: Also inciudes review of PA

None :

ARF, IR

PEA (1.4) #4 001-088

Final Portsmouth Refuse to Energy Plant Site Inspection Report for Pease AFB, NH
ICF Kaiser Engineers, Inc.

286 Congress Street, 7th Floor

Boston, Massachusetts 02210

USAF

July 1992

Report

None

ARF, IR

PEA (1.4) #5 001-D

Final Portsmouth Refuse to Energy Plant Site Inspection Report Appendices
ICF Kaiser Engineers, Inc.

286 Congress Street, 7th Floor

Boston, Massachusetts 02210

USAF

July 1992

Appeadices

None

ARF

PEA (1.4) #6 001-B17 :
Pease AFB Railroad Tracks (Site 46) Site Investigation Letter Report

09/09/94
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USAF

24 September 1992
Letter Report

PEA (1.6)

ARF, IR

PEA (1.4) #7 001-Acr.3 .

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pease AFB Zones 6 and 7 Site Inspection Report Text DRAFT
‘Weston

USAF

June 1993

Report

Zones 6 and 7

ARF

PEA (1.4) #8 001-Plate 2

U.S. Air Force Installstion Restoration Program Pease AFB Zones 6 and 7 Site Inspection Report Figures DRAFT
Weston

USAF

June 1993

Figures

Zones 6 and 7

ARF

PEA (1.4) # 001-H

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pease AFB Zones 6 and 7 Site Inspection Appendices A, B, C, D, E,
F, G and H DRAFT

Weston

USAF

June 1993

Appendices

Zones 6 and 7

ARF

PEA (1.4) #10 001-L.17

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pease AFB Zones 6 and 7 Site Inspection Appendices I and L DRAFT
Weston

USAF

June 1993

Appendices

Zones 6 and 7

ARF

PEA (1.4) #11 001

U.S. Air Force Instaliation Restoration Program Pease AFB Zones 6 and 7 Site Inspection AppendicesJ and K DRAFT
Weston

USAF

Jupe 1993

Appendices

Zones 6 and 7

ARF

C-10
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1.6 Correspondence

PEA (1.6) #1 001-002

*Comments Regarding the Installation Restoration Program, Phase I Record Search Report, Pease Air Force Base”
The State of New Hampshire, Water Supply and Pollution Control Commission

HQ SAC, Offutt AFB, NE

16 March 1984

Letter/Comments

None

ARF, R

PEA (1.6) #2 001004

"Comments Regarding the Installstion Restoration Program Report (09/10/86)"
State of New Hampshire, Division of Public Health Services

NH Division of Public Health Services

24 November 1986

Comments to SI (1.4)

None

ARF

PEA (1.6) #3 001-005

*Comments Regarding the Phase II, Stage 1 IRP Report (08/86 Draft)®
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services

Air Force

3 February 1987

Comments to SI (1.4)

None

ARF

PEA (1.6) #4 001-007

*Air Force Responses to Comments From the New Hampshire Department of Environmental Services on the Phase II,
Stage 1 IRP Draft Report”

Department of the Air Force

NHDES

8 May 1987

Responses to Commeants to SI (1.4)

None

ARF

PEA (1.6) #5 001-001
*Letter Regarding Water Sample Obtained from the Pease AFB Golf Course Spnng
Sute of New Hampshire, Department of Eavironmental Services
Air Force
29 June 1990
Letter
None
ARF

PEA (1.6) #6 001-004

*Letter Concerning Site Walkovers made with Members of Sherburne Civic Group”
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services

Air Force

18 July 1990

Letter

09/09/94
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None

PEA (1.6) #7 001-001

Submitta] of Site 42 Site Inspection Report

USAF
Jobanna Hunter, USEPA
28 July 1992

Letter

Site 42

ARF

PEA (1.6) #8 001-001

Railroad Track SI Letter Report

USAF

* Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES
30 September 1992
Letter

None

ARF

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod.ape
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22 Sampling and Analysis Data / Chain of Castody
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23 EE/CA Approval Memorandum (Non-Time Critical Removals)
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2.4 EE/CA (Engineering Evaluation / Cost Analysis)
* NOTE: NO ENTRIES IN THIS SECTION AT THIS TIME
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2.6 Amendments to Action Memorandum
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2.7 Removal Response Reports

PEA 2.7) #1 001452

“Informal Technical Information Report, Drum Removal at Site 5 (LF-5) — Pre-NPL Actions”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

December 1990

Technical Report

None

ARF

PEA 2.7) #2 001-070

"Informal Technical Information Report, Soil Removal at Site 8 (FDTA-2) — Pre-NPL Actions"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

December- 1990

Technical Report

None

ARF

PEA 2.7) #3 001-142

"Informal Technical Information Report, Soil Removal at Site 34 (Building 222) — Pre-NPL Actions"
Roy F. Weston, Inc. )
EPA, NHDES

January 1991

Technical Report

None

ARF

PEA 2.7) #4 001-244 :
*Informal Technical Information Report, Soil Removal at Site 32 (Building 113) — Pre-NPL Actions”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

April 1991

Technical Report

None

ARF

PEA (2.7) #5 001-900

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3A, IRP Site 8 Groundwater Treatment Plant, Pease AFB, NH - Volume II
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

November 1991

Report

None

ARF

PEA (2.7) #6 001-H.12

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3A, IRP Site 8 Groundwater Treatment Plant, Pease AFB, NH - Volume I
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

November 1991

Report

None

C-20 . 09/09/34
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PEA 2.7) #7 001-E

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4, Letter Report for the Intensive Test Pit Operation at the McIntyre Road Drum
DisposalAmforPeaseAFB,NH-Dmﬁ

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

February 1992

Letter Report

PEA (2.8)

ARF

PEA (2.7) #8 001-601

Installstion Restoration Program, Stage 3B, IRP Site 32/36, Groundwater Treatment Plant, Informal Technical Information
Report, Pease AFB, NH, AppendixK — Draft

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

October 1992

Report

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (2.7) #9 001-J.4

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3B, IRP Site 32/36, Groundwater Treatment Plant, Informal Techoical Information
Repon,PuxeAFB,NH,—TechnialReponmdAppendicesAJ :
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

October 1992

Report

None

ARF

" PEA (2.7) #10 001-D4

Installation Restorstion Program, Stage 3B, IRP Site 34, Groundwater Treatment Plant, Informal Technical Report, Pease
AFB, NH, Appendices A-D — Draft

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

November 1992

Report

None

ARF

PEA (2.7) #11 001-808

Installation Restorstion Program, Stage 3B, IRP Site 34, Groundwater Treatment Plant, Informal Technical Information
Report, Pease AFB, NH, Appendices E-G — Draft

Roy F. Weston, Inc. .

USAF
November 1992
Report
None
ARF
#
C-21 09/09/9%4



2.8 Correspondence

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (2.8) #1 001-002

LONG TITLE: "Tank Removal at Building 244"
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.
RECIPIENT: Air Force

DATE: 8 March 1989

TYPE: Letter

SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: FEA (2.8) #2 001-002

LONG TITLE: "Review Comments Regarding Site 32/36 Groundwater Remediation Pilot Contract Document and Specifications”
AUTHOR: State of New Hampshire, Departmeat of Environmental Services

RECIPIENT: Air Force .

DATE: 25 September 1990

TYPE: Letter

SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (2.8) #3 001001

LONG TITLE: "Letter Regarding Fire Training Area No. 2, Pilot Groundwater Treatment System"
AUTHOR: Department of the Air Force

RECIPIENT: Air Force

DATE: 11 October 1990

TYPE: Letter

SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA 2.8) #4 001-003

LONG TITLE: "IRP Site 32/36 Recovery Well Update”
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.

RECIPIENT: Air Force

DATE: 1 November 1990

TYPE: Letter

SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (2.8) #5 001005

LONG TITLE: “Letter Regarding Anticipated Effluent Quality from Groundwater Treatment Plants at Sites 32/36 and 34"
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.
RECIPIENT: Air Force
DATE: 5 November 1990 ’
TYPE: Letter
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (2.8) #6 001-001
LONG TITLE: "Letter Regarding Fire Training Area No. 2, Pilot Groundwater Treatment System*
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.
RECIPIENT: Air Force
DATE: 12 November 1990
TYPE: Letter

SECOND REFERENCE: Nooe

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\z00¢5rod_apc c22 09/09/94
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PEA (2.8) #7 001-004

*Corrected Tables for 5 November 1990 letter, " Anticipated Effluent Quality from Groundwater Treatment Plants at Sites
32/36 and 34.7

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

3 December 1990

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (2.8) #8 001-004

*Letter Regarding the Approval of Pease Air Force Base Groundwater Permit No. 8908-25P for the Fire Department
Training Area”

State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services

Air Force

11 September 1989

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (2.8) #9 001-002

*Letter Regarding Review of a Supplemental Proposal to Air Strip Contaminated Groundwater”
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services

Air Force

13 September 1989

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (2.8) #10 001-003

*Letter Regarding Revision of Pease Air Force Base Groundwater Permit No. 8908-25P of the Former Fire Department
Training Area No. 2, Site 8"

U.S. Air Force

State of New Hampshire

18 April 1990

Letter

None '

ARF

PEA (2.8) #11 001-001

*Letter Regarding Groundwater Discharge Permit No. 8908-25P"
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services
Air Force

S July 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (2.8) #12 001-002

“Letter to the New Hampshire Department of Environmental Services Regarding Amendments to Groundwater Treatment
System air emissions”

Air Force ¢ . . '

C-23
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M(OI\RP'I‘:OOSMG.OO‘WSM

NHDES
20 August 1990

None

PEA (2.8) #13 001041

"New Hampshire wetlands permit for National Priorities List (NPL) related work site 32/36"
Air Force

State of New Hampthire

22 August 1990

Permit

None

ARF

PEA (2.8) #14 001-002

"Request for additional information regarding pilot groundwater treatment systems for areas of concern 32/36 and 34"
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services

Air Force

11 January 1991

Request for Information

None

ARF

PEA (2.9) #15 001-001

“Letter to New Hampshire Department of Environmental Services regarding pilot groundwater trestment system for IRP
Sites 32/36 and Site 34"

Department of the Air Force

New Hampshire Department of Environmenta] Services

24 January 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (2.8) #16 001-005

“Letter Regarding Notification of Intent to Discharge Effluent From Two Pilot Groundwater Treatment Systems”
U.S.Department of the Air Force

New Hampthire Department of Environmental Services

US EPA

10 December 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (2.8) #17 001002

"Letter to U.S. EPA regarding pilot groundwater treatment systems for IRP Sites 32/36 and Site 34"
U.S.Department of the Air Force '

US EPA

24 January 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (2.8) #18 001-001
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LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
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DATE:

IRP Site 34, Groundwater Treatment Plant
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

13 August 1992

Letter

PEA (2.7); Site 34

ARF

PEA (2.8) #19 001-008
Proposal to Upgrade IRP Site 8 Pilot Groundwater Recovery and Recharge Systems
Fred Symmes
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Mark McKernzie
U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
14 September 1992
Letter with Maps :
Site 8, Pilot Groundwater Recovery and Recharge Systems
ARF
#

PEA (2.8) #20 001-001

Pease AFB Site 32/36 Groundwater Treatment Plant Informal Technical Information Report

‘Weston

USAF )

14 October 1992
Letter

PEA (2.7); Site 32/36
ARF

PEA (2.8) #21 001-001

Pease AFB Site 3¢ GWTP Informal Technical Report Advance Copy
‘Weston

USAF .

19 October 1992

Letter

PEA (2.7); Site 34

ARF

PEA (2.8) #22 001-007 .

Notification of Treatment of Extraction Water from Building 227
USAF

NHDES, Water Supply and Pollution Control Division

26 November 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (2.8) #23 001-004

Site 8 Groundwater Remediation System Update
Lee dePersis

Task Manager

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Arthur Ditto, RPM

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB

2 December 1992

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\z00¢ S rod.ape C-25
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TYPE: Letter with Maps
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3.1 Sampling and Analysis Plan (SAP)

PEA (3.1) #1 001-210

*Quality Assurance Project Plan, Integrated Installstion Restoration Program, Stage 2, to Support the Preliminary Remedial
Investigation Field Work, Labelled Stage 2 Field Work"

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA; NHDES; HQ SAC/DEPV, Offutt AFB, NE

November 1987 .

Quality Assurance Project Plan

None

ARF

PEA (3.1) #2 001-212
*Quality ‘Assurance Project Plan, Integrated Instaliation Restoration Program, Stage 3°
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

" EPA, NHDES

August 1989

Quality Assurance Project Flan
None

ARF

PEA (3.1) #3 001-286

*Installation Restorstion Program, Stage 4 Sampling and Analysis Plan"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

January 1991

Sampling and Analysis Plan

None

ARF

PEA (3.1) #4 001-045

*IRP Health Assessment Sampling and Analysis Plan (Buildings 244, 229, and 226)"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

April 1991

Sampling and Analysis Plan

None

ARF

PEA (3.1) #5 001-006

Site 39 Aquifer Test Procedure Plan for Bedrock Well 39-6080
Robert J. Casper

Project Geologist

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Mark McKenzie

U.S. Air Force/Pesse AFB

15 October 1992

Letter with Table and Map
Bedrock Well 39-6080 in Zone 3
ARF

PEA (3.1) #6 001-005
Pumping Tests at Site 32/36
Amy E. Bruckner, P.G.
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Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Arthur Ditto

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB

22 January 1991

Letter with Tables and Map

Site 32/36, Wells 6013 and 6014
ARF

PEA (3.1) #7 001-003
Locations of Background Sampling Locations
Arthur L. Ditto
RPM, U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
Johanna Huater, RPM
USEPA, Region |
and
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES
15 Juve 1992
Letter and Map
Stage 3C Background Data Base
ARF

PEA (3.1) #8 001-004
Aquifer Testing Proposed for Site 8 (Bedrock Well 08-622)
Robezrt J. Casper

Project Geologist

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Mark McKenzie

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB

28 August 1992

Letter with Table and Map

Site 8, Bedrock Well 08-622, Zone §
ARF

PEA (3.1) #9 001-001
Horizontal Drilling Technique (Video)
Lee R. dePersia

Task Manager

Roy F. Weston, Inc..

Arthur Ditto

RPM, U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

28 September 1992

Letter

"Horizontal Wellbore System”
ARF

PEA (3.1) #10 001-003
Zone 3 Pumping Tests
Robert J. Casper

Project Geologist

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Mark McKenzie

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
28 September 1992

Letter and Table
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Zone 3

PEA (3.1) #11 001-R1

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4 Sampling and Analysis Plan Addendum 3, Pease AFB, NH — Dnaft

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

October 1992
Addendum

None

ARF

PEA (3.1) #12 001-005
Site 72 Aquifer Test Proposed for Bedrock Well T72-6057
Robert J. Casper

Project Geologist

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Mark McKenzie

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
1 October 1992

Letter with Table and Map
Site 72, Zone 3

ARF

PEA (3.1) #13 001-004
Site 31 Aquifer Test Plan for Lower Sand Well 31-518
James G. Spratt

Project Geologist

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Mark McKenzie

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
1 October 1992

Letter with Table and Map
Site 31, Zone 3

ARF

PEA (3.1) #14 001-005

Site 39 Aquifer Test Plan for Lower Sand Well 39-5101
Robert J. Casper . '
Project Geologist

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Mark McKenzie

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB

15 October 1992

Letter with Table and Map

Well 39-5101/Lower Sand Unit at Site 39

ARF

PEA (3.1) #15 001-001

Analysis Using SW846 Method 8330 for Explosives
Edward S. Barnes, PE., C.1. H.

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Capt. Carl Woerhle

U.S. Air Force/Base Closure Division

Air Force Base Center for Environmental Excellence
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MKOI\R?I‘:OOGM.WWW

23 October 1992

Letter

Samples for SWB330 Analysis
ARF

PEA (3.1) #16 001-003
Recommendations to Characterize Overburden Groundwater Quality and Fiow Direction near Site 8 (Zone S5)

" Jeanifer D. Toney, P.G.

Zone Manager

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Arthur Ditto

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
5 November 1992

Letter with Map

Site 8, Zone 5§

ARF B

PEA (3.1) #17 001005
Ethylene Dibromide (EDB) Analysis using Modified Method ES04.1
Edward S. Barnes, P.E., C.LH.
Project Director
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Capt Carl Woerhle
U.S. Air Force/Base Closure Division
Air Force Center for Environmental Excellence
19 November 1992
Letter with 4 Page Attachment
Analytical Method Recommended for EDB Analysis
ARF .
#

PEA (3.1) #18 001-007
Objectives of Site 10 Aquifer Test (well 10-6048)
James J. Soukup
Seaior Hydrogeologist
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Mark McKenzie
U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
30 November 1992
Letter with Tables and Maps
Site 10, Well 106048, Zoge 2 Leaded Fuel Tank Sludge Disposal Area.
ARF
#

PEA (3.1) #19 2.24-R.1

Stage 4 Sampling and Analysis Plan, Addendum #3, QAPP Portion
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

2 December 1992

Addendum

None

ARF

PEA (3.1) #20 001-007

Letter Report - Proposed Aquifer Test of Well 6104
James Soukup, George Swedberg, Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Mark McKenzie, Pease AFB
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32 SamplingandAnalysisDatalChainomedyForms

PEA (3.2) #1 001027

Volatile Aromatics/Halocarbons by Modified 8010/8020 - Draft Data Sheets
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Pease AFB

Unknown

Data

None

ARF

PEA 3.2) #2 001.018

Volatile Aromatics/Halocarbons by Modified 8010/8020
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Pesse AFB '

Unknown'

Data

None

ARF

PEA (3.2) #3 001-009

CLP Volatile Organic Analysis, Case No. 15175, SDG No. AX086, § Water Analytical Results

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Pease AFB

Unknown
Data
None
ARF

PEA (3.2) #4 001-037

Pease AFB GWTP Summary Tables
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Unknown

Data

None

ARF

PEA (3.2) #5 001-013

Split Sampling Results Site 8 and Site 34
Richard Pease, NHDES

Art Ditto, Pease AFB

29 October 1990

Data

Site 8; Site 34

ARF

PEA (3.2) #6 001-013

Preliminary Survey of Metal Concentrations in New Hampshire Soils - Final Report
New Hampshire Division of Public Health Services, Bureau of Health Risgk Assessment

USAF
May 1991
Data
None
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PEA (3.2) #7001-D1

Background Soluble Metals Concentrations for Groundwater at Pease AFB

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

20 November 1991
Letter Report

PEA B.6)

ARF

PEA (3.2) #8 001-E.1

Tolerance Limits for Background Soils at Pease AFB, NH
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

17 April 1992

Letter Report

None

ARF

PEA (3.2) #9 001-014
Continuance of IRP Site 16 Inspection
Arthur Ditto, RPM
U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
Johanna Hunter, RPM
USEPA, Region 1
and
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES
30 Jupe 1992
Letter with Diagrams, Tables and Maps
Site 16, Building 410

ARF

PEA (32) #10 001-002

Results of Background Surface Water/Sediment Location Waikover
Arthur L. Ditto, RPM

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB

Johanna Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1

19 August 1992

Letter

Knights Brook

ARF

PEA (3.2) #11 001-004
Haven Well Test

James G. Spntt

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Mark McKenzie

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
21 August 1992

Letter

Haven Well Aquifer

ARF
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PEA (3.2) #12 001-052
Maximum Detected Concentrations for Unfiltered Groundwater st Pease AFB, NH
Lee dePersia
Task Manager
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Arthur Dito, RPM
U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
25 August 1992
Letter with Attachments (Tables and Graphs)
Charncterization of Inorganic Background Levels for Groundwater st Pease AFB
ARF
#

PEA (3.2) #13 001-007
Haven Well Pumping Test Data
Jim Spratt

Project Geologist

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Mark McKenzie

U.S. Air Force/Peasc AFB
16 September 1992

Letter with Tables

Haven Well (597)

ARF

PEA (3.2) #14 001-009
Nev}ingtonWamerQuaﬁtySmlingonIuly 18, 1992 and Analysis Performed on August 28, 1992 (NHDES Sample
#210239-210241)

Scott Doane

Hydrogeologist

NHDES

Wayne Wood

428 Newington Road

Newington, NH 03803

21 September 1992

Letter with Chain of Custody and Tables

Bedrock Well Serving

428 Newington Road

Tax Map 51, Lot 09

ARF

PEA (3.2) #15 001-009
Tissue Sample Letter Report for Great Bay, Bass Pond and Mclntyre Brook
LeeR. dePersia '
Task Manager
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Through U.S. Air Force
Johanna Hunter, RPM
U.S. EPA, Region 1
and
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES
9 Octwober 1992
Routing Letters and Letter Report with Map and Table
Great Bay, Bass Pond
Meclntyre Brook
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PEA (3.2) #16 001-009

Thomas Drinking Water Well Sample Analytical Result
Kenneth W. Teague, President

Analytics Environmental Laboratory, Inc.

Through U.S. Air Force/Arthur Ditto

Evelyn Thomas ’

509 Newington Road

Newington, NH 03801

23 November 1992

Transmittal Letters with Attachments (Tables, Questionnaire and Map)
Artesian Well

st 509 Newington Rd.

ARF

PEA (3.2) #17 001-005

Results of Sampling Frink Estate Well and Spring
USAF

Peggy Lamson, Newington Board of Selectmen
15 January 1993

Letter with Attachment

None

ARF (Section 3.2 Binder)

PEA (3.2) #18 001-007

Zone 1 Groundwater Model Caliberation
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

17 May 1993

Letter Report

Zone 1

ARF (Section 3.2 Binder)
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3.3 Work Plan

PEA (3.3) #1 001-144

"Work Plan for the Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

August 1989

Work Plan

None

ARF

PEA (3.3) #2 001-019

"Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Treatability Study Work Plan: IRP Sites 8 and 34"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

May 1991

Work Plan

None

ARF

PEA (3.3) #3 001-028

"Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Action Plan”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

May 1991

Operations Plan

None

ARF

PEA (3.3) #4 001-258

“Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4 Work Plan”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

January 1991

‘Work Plan

None

ARF

PEA (3.3) #5 001-213

"Work Plan for the Integrated Installation Restoration Program, Stage 2, Labelled Stage 2 Work Plan”

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
EPA, NHDES
September 1987
Work Plan

None

ARF, R

PEA (3.3) #6 001-GL 2

Instaliation Restoration Program, Stage 4 Work Plan Addendum 1, Pease AFB, NH -~ Dnft
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

September 1991

Addendum

None
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ARF, IR

PEA (3.3) #7 001-G5

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4 Work Plan Addendum Number 2 for Pease AFB, NH — Draft
Roy F. Weston, Inc. .

USAF

March 1992

Addendum

None

ARF, IR

PEA (3.3) #3 001-B4

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Operstions Plan for Pease AFB, NH - Dnaft
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

May 1991

Plan

None

ARF, R

PEA (3.3)#9 001-3.5

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4, Work Plan Addendum 3, Pease AFB, NH
Roy F. Weston, Inc. :

USAF

June 1992

Addendum

None

ARF, IR

PEA (3.3) #10 iii-R2
Suge4}{uhhmdSAfetyPhnAddmdum-Secﬁon9PnimCanDispotdAmTestPitandDmmHmdlinngeedum
Roy F. Weston, Inc. .
USAF

22 June 1992
Addendum

None

ARF, IR

PEA (3.3) #11 001-003
Conversion of Well 06-608 to a Fi d Bedrock Monitor Well
Lee dePersia

Task Manager

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Arthur Dito, RPM

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
8 September 1992
Letter and Disgram
LF-6 and Well 06-608
ARF, IR

PEA (3.3) #12 001-004

Groundwater Modeling Process Outline
Lee dePersia

Task Manager

C-37 09/09/94
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Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Arthur Ditto, RPM

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB
2 October 1992

Letter

Groundwater Modeling
ARF, IR

PEA (3.3) #13 001-C.31

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 5 Health and Safety Plan, Pease AFB, NH — Draft

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

October 1992

Health and Safety Plan
Groundwater Modeling
ARF, R

PEA (3.3) #14 001-036

US. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pease AFB Landfill 5 Remedial Design Work Plan DRAFT

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

April 1993

Work Plan

LF-S

ARF, R

PEA (3.3) #15 001-F

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pease AFB Interim Monitoring Plan

USAF

Pease AFB

January 1994
Monitoring Plan
Groundwater Monitoring
ARF (Zone 7 Shelf)

PEA (3.3) #16 0014.1

Work Plan to Evaluate the Sediments of Mclntyre Brook and Flagstone Brook, Pease AFB, NH

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
October 27, 1993
Work Plan

McIntyre Brook; Flagstone Brook

ARF (Section 3.3 Binder)
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3.4 Preliminary RI Field Work Reports

PEA (3.4) #1 001-173

*Interim Technical Report No. 1 for the Installation Restoration Program, Stage 2, Volume I"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

February 1988

Technical Report

None

ARF, IR

PEA (3.4) # 001-147

*Interim Technical Report No. 1 for the Installation Restoration Program, Stage 2, Volume II - Appeadices”
Roy F. Weston, Inc. :

EPA, NHDES

" January 1988

Technical Report - Appendices
None .
ARF, IR

PEA (3.4) #3 001-214

*Interim Technical Report No. 2 for the Instaliation Restoration Program, Stage 2, Volume I"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

August 1988

Technical Report

None

ARF, IR

PEA (3.4) #4 001-696

*Interim Technical Report No. 2 for the Installstion Restoration Program, Stage 2, Volume 1l - Appendices (Sample
Tracking Information, Analytical Results)”

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

August 1988

Techmical Report - Appendices (Sample Tracking Information, Analytical Results)

None

ARF, IR

PEA (3.4) #5001-838

“Interim Technical Report No. 2 for the Instaliation Restoration Program, Stage 2, Volume III - Appendices (Analytical
Results)”

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

August 1988

Technical Report - Appendices (Analytical Results)

Nope

ARF, IR

PEA (3.4) #6 001-722

*Interim Technical Report No. 2 for the Installation Restoration Program, Stage 2, Volume IV - Appendices (Analytical
Results)*

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

09/09/94
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August 1988

Technical Report - Appendices (Analytical Results)
None

ARF, IR

PEA (3.4) #7 001-289

“Interim Technical Report No. 2 for the Instaliation Restoration Program, Stage 2, Volume V - Appendices (Field

Geological, Geotechnical, and Hydrogeological Data)"

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
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Letter Report

None

ARF
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ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (3.5) #90 001-D 26
U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report Appendices A, C and
D—-DRAFT FINAL : &

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF
September 1993
Appendices

Zone 3

ARF (Zooe 3 Shelf)

C-62 09/09/94



DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:
TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\z00¢Srodapc

PEA (3.5) #91 001-B

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report Appendix B Part 1
of 2 DRAFT

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

April 1993

Appendix

Zone 3

ARF

PEA (3.5) #92 001-B

U.S. Air Force Installation Restorstion Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Repart Appendix B Part 2
of 2 DRAFT

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF .

April 1993

Appendix

Zone 3

ARF

PEA (3.5) #93 001-1000

U.S. Air Force Instaliation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report Appendices B, E,
F, G, L and M—DRAFT FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

September 1993

Appendices

Zooe 3

ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (3.5) #34 001-H.4

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report Appendix H Part 1
of 3-DRAFT FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

September 1993 (same as DRAFT 4/93)

Appendix

Zone 3

ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (3.5) #95 001-H

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report Appendix H Part 2
of 3-DRAFT FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

September 1993 (same as DRAFT 4/93)

Appeadix

Zone 3

ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (3.5) #96 001-H

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report Appendix H Part 3
of 3-DRAFT FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF
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September 1993 (same as DRAFT 4/93)

Appendix

Zone 3 o
ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (3.5) #97 0012388

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report Appendix I Part 1
of 2-DRAFT

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

April 1993

Appendix

Zone 3

ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (3.5) #98 2424-5307 ) . -
us. AirFoxceInmlhﬁonReuonﬁoangﬁm, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedis! Investigation Report Appendix I Part 2
of 2-DRAFT

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

April 1993

Appendix

Zone 3

ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (3.5) #99 001-J.1

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report Appendices I and J
Part 1 of 2-DRAFT FINAL } ) :

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

September 1993

Appendix

Zone 3

ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (3.5) #100 001-J.2

U.S. Air Force Instalistion Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report Appendix J Part 2
of 2—-DRAFT FINAL . :

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

September 1993

Appeadix

Zone 3

ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (3.5) #101 001-K.7

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report Appendix K—-DRAFT

F]NAL o
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

September 1993

Appeadix

Zone 3

ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

09/09/94
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PEA (3.5) #102 001-R.7 :

U.S. Air Force Installstion Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 4 Remedial Investigation Report DRAFT Section
6

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

April 1993

Report

Zone 4

ARF

PEA (3.5) #103 001-L.7

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 4 Remedial Investigation Report
DRAFT Appendix L

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

April 1993

Appendix.

Zone 4

ARF

PEA (3.5) #104 001-G.1

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Landfill S Remedial Design Excavation/Relocation Plan for
Waste, Soil and Sediment Text DRAFT (90% Submittal)

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

July 1993

Remedial Design

LF-5

ARF

PEA (3.5) #105 001-13250-8

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Remedial Design Excavation/Relocation Plan for Waste,
Soil and Sediment Landfills 2, 4 and S Technical Specifications DRAFT (90% Submittal)

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF ’

July 1993

Specifications

LF-2, LF4, LF-5

ARF .

PEA (3.5) #106 ES.1-ACR-3 .
U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 7 (also known as Site 45, Old Engine Test Stand)
Remedial Investigation/ Feasibility Study-Text—DRAFT
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
September 1993
Repont
Zone 7, Site 45
ARF, PEA (4.2) #36 ES-1-ACR.3 on Zope 7 Shelf-Filed as Feasibility Report
#

PEA (3.5) #107 001-9.2-6

U.S. Air Force Instaliation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 7 (also known as Site 45, Old Engine Test Stand)
Remedial Investigation/ Feasibility Study-Figures~DRAFT

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

09/09/94
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USAF

September 1993

Figures

Zore 7, Site 45 :

ARF, PEA (4.2) #37 001-9.2-6 on Zone 7 Shelf-Filed as Feasibility Report
#

«r

PEA (3.5) #108 001-F
U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 7 (also known as Site 45, Old Engine Test Stand)
Remedial Investigation/ Feasibility Study-Appendices A, B, C, D, E and E-DRAFT
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
September 1993
Appendices
Zome 7, Site 45
ARF, PEA (4.2) #38 001-F on Zone 7 Shelf-Filed a3 Feasibility Report
P

PEA (3.5) #109 001-J (K.6-1) .
U.S. Air Force Instaliation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 7 (also known as Site 45, Old Engine Test Stand)
Remedial Investigation/ Feasibility Study-Appendices G, H, J, and K-DRAFT
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
September 1993
Appendices
Zone 7, Site 45 .
ARF, PEA (4.2) #39 001-J (K.6-1) on Zone 7 Shelf-Filed as Feasibility Report
#

PEA (3.5) #110 ES.1-ACR 3 . . : ‘ :
U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 7 (also known as Site 45, Old Engine Test Stand)
Remedial Investigation/ Feasibility Study-Appeadix I-DRAFT
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
September 1993
Appendix
Zone 7, Site 45
ARF, PEA (4.2) #40 001-700 on Zone 7 Shelf-Filed as Feasibility Report
: #

PEA (3.5)#111L.1-Q2 ) .
uUs. Ai:FomelnmlhﬁonRecouﬁoangum, Pease AFB, Zone 7 (also known as Site 45, Old Engine Test Stand)
Remedial Investigation/ Feasibility Study-AppendicesL, M, N, O, P and Q-DRAFT -
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
September 1993
Appendices
Zone 7, Site 45
ARF, PEA (4.2) #41 L..1-Q.2 on Zone 7 Shelf-Filed as Feasibility Report
#

PEA (3.5) 112 001 K.52
US. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, -Pesse AFB, Mclntyre Brook/Lower Newfields Ditch Remedial
Investigation/Feasibility Study—DRAFT FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

November 1993

Report

Zone 3 !

ARF, PEA (4.2) #24001-K.5-2 on Zone 3 Shelf-Filed as Feasibility Report
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3.6 RI Correspondence

PEA (3.6) #1 001-001

"Comments Regarding the Work Plan for the IRP Stage 2"

State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services
Air Force

27 July 1987

Comments Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)
None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #2 001-006

"Letter Regarding IRP, Stage 2°

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

11 November 1987

Letter Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)
None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #3 001-001
"Letter Stating Conformance of the Stage 2, Quality Assurance Project Plan With Air Force IRP Practices”
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services

Air Force

12 November 1987

Letter Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)

None
ARF

PEA (3.6) #4 001-001

"Letter Regarding the Suspect Fire Training Area®

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

16 December 1987

Letter Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)
None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #5 001-003

"Letter Concerning Short-Duration Pumping Tests of the Haven and Harrison Water Supply Wells”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

14 June 1988

Letter Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)

None '

ARF

PEA (3.6) #6 001-001

"Letter Concerning Drilling Program*

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

20 October 1988

Letter Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)

None
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PEA (3.6) #7 001-002

"Review of Work Plan Removal of Source Contamination at Building 244"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

8 March 1989

Letter Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #8 001-001

"Letter Regarding Technical Review of Building 244 Solvent Tagk Removal and Off-Site Contaminant Migration”
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services

Air Force .

3 May 1989 ‘

Letter/Comments Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #9 001-002

“Letter Concerning Disposal of Drill Cuttings From Stage 2 IRP Investigations”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force :

2 October 1989

Letter Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #10 001-003

"Review Comments on the Phase I, Stage 2 IRP, Draft Final Report”

State of New Hampshire, Department of Eavironmental Services

Air Force

28 February 1990 .

Review Comments on Phase II, Stage 2, IRP Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)
None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #11 001-011

"Review Comments for the Pease AFB, Phase II, Stage 2 IRP Draft Final Report”
US.EPA

Air Force

7 March 1990

Review Comments Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)

None

ARF

" PEA (3.6) #12 001010

"Review Comments Regarding the IRP, Stage 2 Draft Final Report (December 1989)°
U.S. Department of Commerce, National Oceanic and Atmospheric Administration
Air Force via EPA

7 March 1990

Review Comments Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)

None
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PEA (3.6) #13 001-020

*Review Commeants to the IRP Stage 2 RUFS Draft Report”
Department of the Air Force

Roy F. Weston, Inc./Air Force

15 March 1990

Review Comments Serving 3.4 (Preliminary RI Field Work Reports)

Nozne
ARF

PEA (3.6) #14 001-004
*Sampling Data for Off-Site Sampling at Pease AFB"

State of New Hampshire, Water Supply and Pollution Control Division

Air Force

5 July 1990
Sampling Data
None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #15 001-010

“Pease AFB, Site 8 Sampling Data”

State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services
Air Force, EPA

September 1990

Sampling Date

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #16 001003

*Off-Base Sampling at Pesse AFB"

State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services
Air Force

25 October 1990

Sampling Results

None
ARF

PEA (3.6) #17 001013

*Split Sampling Results, Site 8 and Site 34"

State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services
Air Force

29 October 1990
Sampling Results
None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #18 001-065

*Sampling Results from Pease AFB, Newington, Portsmouth®
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services
Air Force

17 January 1991

Sampling Data

None
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PEA (3.6) #19 001-002

“Instailation Restoration Program (IRP) at Pease AFB, NH"
Department of the Air Force

Air Force

8 March 1989

Memorandum — Pertaining to RI

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #20 001002

"Work Plan for the IRP Stage 3 and ITR #4"
Department of the Air Force

Air Force :

3 April 1989
Memorandum — Pertaining to RI

None

ARF

PEA (.6) #21 001-007

"Consolidated Comments to the IRP Stage 3 Work Plan for Pease Air Force Base, NH"

Department of the Air Force

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

1 June 1989

Review Comments — Pertaining to RI
None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #22 001-001

"Review Comments Regarding the Work Plan and QAPP - Stage 3"
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services
Air Force

16 June 1989

Review Comments — Pertaining to RI

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #£23 001-008

"Stage 3 Work Plan - Response to Comments™
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

29 June 1989

Response to Comments — Pertaining to RI
None

ARF

PEA (3.6) 124 001-008

“Consolidated Commeats to the IRP Stage 3 Quality Assurance Project Plan (QAPP) for Pease Air Force Base, NH"

Department of the Air Force

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

29 June 1989

Review Comments — Pertaining to RI
Noge
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PEA (3.6) #25 001-009

*Special Notification concerning the results of sampling monitor Well 562A at Site 8"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

1 February 1990

Letter — Pertaining to RI

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #26 001-002

*Followup to Special Notification (1 February 1990) concerning groundwater samples from Well 562A at Site 8"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

16 February 1990

Letter — Pertaining to RI

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) 227 001-002

*Letter summarizing discussions between Roy F. Weston, Inc. and the New Hampshire Department of Environmental
Services concerning on-site handling and disposal of soil and water generated during drilling, development, purging, and
pump testing of wells”

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

12 March 1990

Letter — Pertaining to 3.4

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #28 001-004

" “Letter regarding recent and scheduled fisture activity in the bulk fuel storage area”

Department of the Air Force
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

10 May 1990

Letter — Pertaining to RI
None

ARF

PEA (3.6) £29 001-007

"Review comments on the Stage 3 Work Plan for the IRP"
US. EPA

Air Force

7 June 1990

Review Comments — Pertaining to RI

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #30 001-002

*Letter concerning proposed drilling locations, Stage 3B"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

12 June 1990
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Letter — Pertaining to RI

None

PEA (3.6) #31 001-002

"Letter regarding well installation modification®
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

S July 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #32 001-004
'Leuqrmgudingpmedumuaedininﬂﬂingmdnbuﬂoningmnimwen 632"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

8 August 1990

Letter "

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #33 001-001

"Letter regarding June 1990 Pickering Spring sampling results”
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services
Peggy Lamson, Selectman & Town Health Officer, Newington, NH
15 August 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #34 001-004

“Letter regarding the disposal of clean water, drilling mud and soil*
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

25 September 1990

Letter '

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #35 001-002

"Letter mgudingprocedwforhmdling:olidsmdﬁquids during well construction and soil borings®

Smeochw}hmpuhi:e,Depmof&vtonmuSerku
Air Force

25 September 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #36 001-006

"Letter regarding Pease Air Force Base well installation - IRP Site 8"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

26 September 1990
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None

PEA (3.6) #37 001-002

*Letter regarding testing of IRP Site 32/36 well”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

27 September 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #38 001-002

*Information Letter 3 - Documenting discussion on 25 October 1990"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

29 October 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #39 001-002

"Letter regarding the disposal of clean soil cuttings and drilling mud*
Department of the Air Force

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

1 November 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #40 001-007

*Stage 3, Landfill 5 Site Characterization Summary Informal Technical Information Report; review comments”
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services

Air Force

30 January 1991

Review Comments

PEA (3.4) #32 001-338

ARF

PEA (3.6) #41 001-008

"Response to Comments - Draft Final Stage 4 Work Plan and Sampling And Analysis Plan"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

PEA (3.6) #42 001-017
“EPA review comments on the Stage 3, Landfill 5 Site Characterization Summary Informal Technical Informstion Report”
U.S.EPA
Air Force
14 February 1991
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Review Comments
PEA (3.4) # 32 00]-338
ARF

PEA (3.6) #43 001-004

"Issues Needing Resolution Prior to the Upcoming Field Efforts”
U.S. EPA

Air Force

10 April 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #44 001-030

“Response to Comments. Land§ll 5 Site Characterization Summary - Informal Technical Information Report”
Roy F. Weston, Inc. .

Air Force

7 June 1991

Response to Comments

PEA (3.4) #32 001-338

ARF

PEA (3.6) #45 001-030

"(Revised) Response to Comments. Land6li S - Site Characterization Summary, Informal Technical Information Report”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

17 July 1991

Letter

PEA (3.4) #32 001-338

ARF

PEA (3.6) #46 001-038

"Response to Comments - Stage 4 Work Plan and SAP”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

28 September 1990

Response to Comments

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #47 001-011
'Reviewcommonﬂ:elnﬁdhﬁonllmmionl’hn (IRP) Stage 4 Work Plan and Sampling and Analysis Plan"
State of New Hampshire, Department of Exnvironmental Services

Air Force

16 October 1990

Review Comments

None

PEA (3.6) #48 001-017

"The Town ofNewingtonwviewoommmonthemPSuge4 Work Plan”
The Town of Newington

Air Force

29 October 1990
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Review Comments
None
ARF

PEA (3.6) #49 001-076

*EPA technical review of the Draft IRP Stage 4 Work Plan and Sampling and Analysis Plan for Pease Air Force Base”
U.S. EPA

Air Force

2 November 1990

Review Comments

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #50 001-002

*Response to Air Force questions on state comments to the Stage 4 Work Plan”
State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services

Air Force

3 December 1990

Response to Air Force questions on State of New Hampshire comments

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #51 001007

*Response to EPA comments on the Pease AFB Stage 4 Work Plan/Sampling and Analysis Plan”
U.S. Air Force

EPA

10 December 1990

Air Force responses to EPA comments

None -

ARF

PEA (3.6) #52 001-008

*Air Force Response to NHDES Comments - Draft Final Stage 4 Work Plan and Sampling and Analysis Plan"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

PEA (3.6) #53 001-008

*EPA initial approval of the IRP Stage 4 Work Flan and Sampling and Analysis Plan®

U.S. EPA

Air Force

13 March 1991

Letter concerning EPA initial approval of Stage 4 Work Plan and Sampling and Analysis Plan
None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #54 001058

*Air Force Response to EPA comments on the Stage 4 Work Plan and Sampling and Analysis Plan*
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA

1991
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Response to Comments

Nope

PEA (3.6) #55 001-003

Off-Base Sampling at Pease Air Force Base
Richard Pease, NHDES

Art Ditto, Pease AFB

25 October 1990

Letter

Nope

ARF

PEA (3.6) #56 001-001

EPA Concerns

U.S. Air Force - Internal Note
Art Ditto/USAF/Pease AFB

8 April 1991

Internal Record of Phone Conversation with EPA and NHDES
None
ARF

PEA (3.6) #57 001-004

Issues Needing Resolution Prior to Upcoming Field Efforts
Johanna Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1

Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF, Pease AFB

10 April 1991

Letter

Stage 3 and 4 Work Plan (3.3)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #58 001-002

Review of Risk Assessment Data and Sampling Procedures
Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

16 April 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #59 001-067

Concerns about Axalytical Methods
USAF

USAF

Johanns Huater, USEPA

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

23 April 1991

Fax with Attachments

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #60 001-001 ,
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Surface Water and Sediment Sampling Locations
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

Johanna Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1

24 April 1991

Letter (Transmittal)

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #61 001-008
Field Oversight Coordination
Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

29 April 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #62 001-004

Preliminary Sampling Schedule for Stage 3C IRP Sites through November 1991

USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Richard Pease, NHDES
02 May 1991

Fax

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #63 001-003

Review of April 25, 1991 Revised Analytical Methods

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Art Ditto, Pease AFB
08 May 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #64 001-002

Review of April 25, 1991 Revised Analytical Methods

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Art Ditto, Pease AFB
08 May 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #65 001-005

Field Performance Review of Weston Activities, Pease Air Force Base, New Hampshire

Mitre Corporation

Dennis Lundquist

Human Systems Division

IRP Program Office
HSD/YAQ

Brooks AFB, TX 78235-5000
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14 May 1991
Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #66 001-002

Revised Analytical Methods for Pease AFB
Logan VanLeigh, Capt., USAF, BSC
Technical Program Manager

Johanna Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1

31 May 1991

Letter

Sampling and Analysis Plan (3.1)

ARF .

PEA (3.6) #67 001-00S '

Procedure for Establishing Background Metal Concentrations for Groundwater and Soil
Edward S. Barnes, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

03 June 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #68 001-012

Information to Assist Interpretation of Data Submitted by EPA to the Air Force
Johanna Huater, USEPA .
Art Ditto, Pease AFB

06 June 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #69 001-004

Resolution Letter for Procedures for 8260 for VOC Analysis of Water
Mark McKenzie, Pease AFB

Richard Pesase, NHDES

Cari Gysler, Earth Technology, San Bemardino, CA

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

06 June 1991

Fax

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #70 001-001
Background Determination Protocols
USAF '

Richard Pease, NHDES '

07 June 1991

Letter

None

ARF
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PEA (3.6) #71 001-001
Background Determination Protocols
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

07 June 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #72 001-003

Revised Analytical Methods for Pease AFB GC/MS Method 8260 for VOA
Edward S. Barnes, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF '

11 June 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #73 001-001
Laborstory Services
Richard Pease, NHDES
Art Ditto, Pease AFB
13 June 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #74 001-004

Pease AFB Feedback on Site 8 Sampling - June 1991
Richard Pease, NHDES

Art Ditto, Pease AFB

19 June 1991

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (3.6) #75 001-002
EPA Pump Test Information Request to be Provided by Air Force
Johanna Hunter, RPM
U.S. EPA Region 1
Art Dito, RPM

USAF

Pease AFB

27 June 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #76 001-002

Roy F. Weston, Inc., Proposed Methods for Determining Background Concentrations at Pease Air Force Base, New

Hampshire

George Rice, Mitre Corporation

Dennis Lundquist

Human Systems Division IRP Program Office
HSD/YAQ
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ARF

PEA (3.6) #77 001-001

Transmittal Letter for Protocols for Baseline Risk Asseasments

Arthur Dito, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES

18 July 1991

Transmittal Letter
Baseline Risk Assessments
ARF

PEA (3.6) #78 001-001

Transmittal Letter for Protocols for Baseline Risk Assessments

Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB
Johanna Hunter, RPM
U.S. EPA, Region 1

18 July 1991

Transmittal Letter
Baseline Risk Assessments
ARF .

PEA (3.6) #79 001-001

Submittal of Secondary Document
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

18 July 1991

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (3.6) #30 001-002

Exploratory Boring Soil Sampling Procedures
Edward S. Barnes

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Capt. Logan Van Leigh

U.S. Air Force

Air Force Center for Environmental Excellence
26 July 1991

Letter

None

PEA (3.6) #31 001-001

Veated Monitoring Wells

Scott Doane, Hydrogeologist
Groundwater Technology Section
Groundwater Protection Bureau
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NHDES

Mark McKenzie
USAF/Pease AFB
31 July 1991
Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) £82 001-006

Review of the Proposed Procedure for Background Determination Protocols for Pease Air Force Base, Portsmouth, NH

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Art Ditto, Pease AFB
02 August 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #33 001-001

Vented Monitoring Wells - Response to July 31, 1991 Letter on same Issue Form NHDES

Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB
Scott Doane
NHDES

26 August 1991

Letter
None
ARF

PEA (3.6) #34 001-001

Split Sampling Results

Arthur Ditto, RPM

U. 8. Air Force/Pease AFB

Johanna Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region1
and

Richard Pease, RPM

NHDES

9 September 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #85 001-002

Field Oversight - September 1991

Richard Pease, NHDES
Arthur Dito, USAF RPM
28 October 1991

Letter

RI Field Work (3.4) -
ARF

PEA (3.6) #86 001001

Transmittal Letter for Data Collected on Surface Water and Sediment Background Concentration

Johanna Hunter, RPM
U.S. EPA, Region 1

MKO01\RPT:00628026.004\zonc5rod.apc

C-81

09/05/94



DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:
TYPE:

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\z00eSrod.apc

Ed Barnes )
Project Manager
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
2 December 1991
Transmittal Letter
None

PEA (3.6) #37 001-002

Regional Literature Search to Assist Development of the Sediment and Surface Water Background Determination for Pease

AFB, Portsmouth, NH
Jobanna Hunter, USEPA
Arnt Ditto, Pease AFB

2 December 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #88 001-001
Fugitive Dust Pathway in the Baseline Risk Assessment
Arthur Ditto, RPM, USAF
Pease AFB
Johanna Hunter RPM
U.S. EPA Region 1
3 January 1992
Letter
Baseline Risk Assessment (3.5) - RI Reports
ARF
#

PEA (3.6) #39 001-001

Evaluation of the Air Pathway in Baseline Risk Assessment
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

11 February 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #90 001-001 .
Evaluation of the Air Pathway in Baseline Risk Assessment
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

11 February 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #91 001-002

IRP Site 32/36 Source Area ‘Remedial Investigation Report
Edward S. Barnes, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

14 February 1992

Letter
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Site 32/36

PEA (3.6) #92 001-001

IRP Site 32/36 Source Area Remedial Investigation Report
Edward S. Bames, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Richard Pease, NHDES

14 February 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (3.6) #93 001-001

IRP Site 32/36 Source Area Remedial Investigation Report
Edward S. Barnes, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Jobanna Hunter, USEPA

14 February 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (3.6) #94 001001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Site 32/36 RI Report
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

25 February 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (3.6) #95 001-001
Transmittal Letter for Submittal of Baseline Risk Assessment Protocols
Arthur Ditto, RPM

" USAF/Pease AFB

Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES

25 February 1992
Transmittal Letter
Baseline Risk Assessment
ARF

PEA (3.6) #96 001001

Transmittal Letter for Revised Baseline Risk Assessment Protocols
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

Johanna Hunter, RPM

USEPA, Region 1

25 February 1992

Transmittal Letter

Revised Baseline Risk Assessment

ARF

PEA (3.6) #97 001-001
Submittal of Dreft Primary Document, Site 32/36 RI Report
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USAF
Jobanna Hunter, USEPA
25 February 1992

Site 32/36

PEA (3.6) #98 001-003

Request for EPA Split Sampling Results
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

Johanna Huater, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1

9 March 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #99 001-D1

Letter Report of Results of Statistical Comparison of Stage 3C Samples to the 66 Other Background Samples
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

9 March 1992

Letter Report

PEA 3.5)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #100 001-001
Transmittal Letter for Submittal of Stage 4 Work Plan Addendum Number 2 on the Draft Stage 4 Sampling and Analysis
Plan Addendum Number 2
Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB
Johanna Hunter

U.S. EPA, Region 1

24 March 1992
Transmittal Letter

PEA (3.1), PEA (3.3)
ARF ’

PEA (3.6) #101 001-001
Transmitta] Letter for Submittal of Stage 4 Addendum Number 2 Work Plan and Sampling and Analysis Plan

Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

Richard Pease, RPM '

NHDES

24 March 1992

Transmittal Letter

PEA (3.1), PEA (3.3)

ARF (22

PEA (3.6) #102 001-001

Dats You May Be Able to Provide
Thomas R. Marks, Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Mark McKenzie, Pease AFB

26 May 1992
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Letter
None
ARF

PEA (3.6) #103 001-022

Evaluation of Air Pathway in Baseline Risk Assessments
Richard Pease, NHDES

Art Ditto, Pease AFB

13 April 1992

Letter with Attachments

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #104 001-004

Pease Air Force Base Site 34 Source Area Draft Final RI Report
Edward S. Barnes, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Jobanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

07 May 1992

Letter

Site 34

ARF

PEA (3.6) #105 001-003

Pease Air Force Base Zone 4 Draft Site Charscterization Summary
Edward S. Bames, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

08 May 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #106 001-002

Oversight Role of Regulatory Agencies at Pease AFB
Michael Daly, USEPA

Mark McKenzie, Pease AFB

26 May 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #107 001-003

Submittal of Draft Secondary Documeant, Zone 3 Site Characterization Summary
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

26 May 1992

Letter

None

ARF
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PEA (3.6) #108 001-002
Pease Air Force Base Site lRP32/36801meAmDnﬁanl RIReport and Response to Comments for the IRP Site 32/36
Draft RI Report

Lee dePersia, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Jobanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

05 June 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (3.6) #109 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Site 32/36 Remedial Investigation Report
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

16 June 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (3.6) #110 001-001

Submittal of Draft Fina] Primaty Document, Site 32/36 Remedial Investigation Report
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

16 June 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (3.6) #111 001-001

PEA (3.6) #112 001-00]

Submittal of Draft Secondaty Documents, Stage 4 Work Plan Addendum 3 and Stage 4 Health and Safety Plan Addendum
USAF

Johaons Hunter, USEPA

24 June 1992

Letter

None:

ARF

PEA (3.6) #113 001-002
Additional Field Oversight
USAF

Michael Daly, USEPA

8 July 1992

Letter

None
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ARF

PEA (3.6) #114 001-001

Submittal Letter for Draft Site Characterization Summary for IRP Site 32/36
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

Johanns Hunter, RPM

USEPA, Region 1

18 July 1992

Transmittal Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (3.6) #115 001-003

Pease Air Force FDTA-2 Draft RI Report
Lee dePersia, Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

29 July 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #116 001-021

Pease Air Force Base Groundwater Modeling Letter Report
Lee dePersia, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Johanns Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

29 July 1992

Letter with Report

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #117001-001 )
Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Site 8 Remedial Investigation Report
USAF ’

Johanna Huster, USEPA

30 July 1992

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (3.6) #118 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Site § Remedial Investigation Report
USAF :

Richard Pease, NHDES

30 July 1992

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (3.6) #119 001001
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Transmitta] Letter for Summary of Groundwater Treatment Plant Influent/Effluent Results
Arthur Ditto, RPM .
USAF/Pease AFB

Johanna Hunter, RPM

USEPA, Region 1

and

Richard Pease, RPM

NHDES

11 August 1992

Letter

PEA Q.7)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #120 001-001

Monitor Well Inveatory and Inspection Report
USAF

Johanns Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

18 August 1992

Letter

None

ARF .

PEA (3.6) #121 001-002

Base Support Requirements for Haven Well Pumping Test
USAF

James Winder

Pat Hamel

E.L. Hamm

21 August 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #122 001-002

Results of Background Surface Water Sediment Location Walkover
Richard Pease, RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, RPM, Pease AFB

27 August 1992

Letter

PEA (6.9)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #123 001-005
Risk Assessment Issues for Pease AFB
Lee dePersia

Task Manager

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Arthur Ditto, RPFM
USAF/Pease AFB

28 August 1992

Letter Report

PEA G3.5)

ARF
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PEA (3.6) #124 001-001

Transmittal Letter for Submittal of Groundwater Background Letter Report

Mark McKenzie for Arthur Ditto
USAF/Pease AFB
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES

and
Johanna Hunter
U.S. EPA, Region 1
1 September 1992
Letter
None
ARF

PEA (3.6) #125 001-002
Policy on Data Transfer During Pumping Tests
Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES

and

Johanna Hunter, RPM
U.S. EPA, Region 1

9 September 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #126 001-001

Transminal Letter for Submital of Draft Primary Document, Site 3 No Funher Action Decision Document (NFADD)

Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB
Johanna Hunter, RFM
U.S. EPA/Region 1

9 September 1992
Letter

Site 3
ARF

PEA (3.6) #127 001-001

Transmittal Letter for Submittal of Draft Pmmry Documem, Site 3 No Further Action Decision Document (NFADD)

Arnthur Ditto, RFM
USAF/Pease AFB
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES

9 September 1992
Letter

Site 3

ARF

PEA (3.6) #128 001-003

Summary of Risk Issues Meeting of August 19, 1992

Johanna Hunter, RPM
U.S. EPA, Region 1
Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB

'
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16 September 1992

None

PEA (3.6) #129 001-001

Extension of Draft Final Report Submittal Date, Site 8 Remedial Investigation Report
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

6 October 1992

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (3.6) #130 001-002
Field Oversight - Mid-August-Mid-September
Richard Pease, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, RPM  Pease AFB

7 October 1991

Letter

PEA (3.9)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #131 001-001

Pease AFB Zore 1 Site Characterization Summary
Lee dePersia

Task Manager

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Cept. Carl Woerhle

U.S. Air Force

Base Closure Division

Air Force Center for Environmental Excellence
21 October 1992

Transmittal Letter

Zone 1

ARF

PEA (3.6) #132 001-001

Pease AFB Zone S Site Characterization Summary
Lee dePersia, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Jobanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

22 October 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #133 001-001

Transmittal Letter for Pease AFB Zone 2 Site Characterization Study
Lee dePersia

Task Manager

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Capt. Carl Woerhle
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U.S. Air Force Base Closure Division

Air Force Center for Environmental Excellence
22 October 1992

Letter

Zone2

ARF

" PEA (3.6) #134 001-001

Transmittal Letter for Submittal of Zone 2 Site Characterization Summary Report
Lee dePersia

Task Manager

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Richard Pease, RPFM

NHDES

22 October 1992

Letter

Zone 2

ARF

PEA (3.6) #135 001-001
Transmittal Letter for Submittal of Zone 2 Site Characterization Summary Report
Lee dePersia

Task Mansger

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Johanna Hall

TRC Member

Boott Mills South of Foot Street
Lowell, MA

22 October 1992

Leter

Zone 2

ARF

PEA (3.6) #136 001-001
Transmittal Letter for Submittal of Zone 2 Site Characterization Summary Report
Lee dePersia

Task Manager

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Johanna Hunater, RPM
U.S. EPA, Region 1

22 October 1992

Letter

Zone 2

ARF

PEA (3.6) #137 001-001 .

Submittal of Draft Secondary Documents, Zones 1, 2, and 5 Site Characterization Summaries

USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES
26 October 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #138 001-001
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Submittal ofDnﬂSeoondaxyDowmenu,Zonec 1,2, and 5 Site Characterization Summaries
USAF

Johanns Hunter, USEPA

26 October 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #139 001-001

Submittal of Stage 4 Sampling and Analysis Plan Addendum 3
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

26 October 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #140 001-001

Submittal of Stage 4 Sampling and Analysis Plan Addendum 3
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

26 October 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #141 001-002
Pease Air Force Base Draft Final IRP Site 8 RI Report
Lee dePersia, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

13 November 1992

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (3.6) #142 001-001
Transmittal Letter for Submittal of Stage § Huldundsmphn
Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB
Johanns Hunter, RPM
U.S. EPA, Region 1
and
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES
17 November 1992
Letter
None
ARF

PEA (3.6) #143 001-001

Transmittal Letter for Submittal of Draft Final Primary Document, Site 8 RI Report
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF, Pease AFB
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Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES
17 November 1992

Site 8

PEA (3.6) #144 001-001

Transmital Letter for Submittal of Draft Final Primary Document, Site 8 RI Report

Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF, Pease AFB
Johanna Hunter, RPM
U.S. EPA, Region 1
17 November 1992

Letter
Site 8
ARF

PEA (3.6) #145 001-004

No Further Action Decision for Site 3
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF, Pease AFB

Johapna Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1

1 December 1992

Letter

Site 3

ARF

PEA (3.6) #146 001001

Application of the Reasonsble Maximum Exposure (RME) in Risk Assessments
Arthur Ditto, RFM

USAF, Pease AFB

Richard Pease, RPM

NHDES

1 December 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (3.6) #147 001001

Explanation of Off-Base Well Inventory Report
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF, Pease AFB

Richard Pease, RPM

NHDES

4 December 1992

Letter .
Off-Base Well Inventory Letter Report of 17 September 1992
PEA (3.9)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #148 001-001

Transmittal Letter for Submittal of Quality Assurance Project Plan (QAFPP) Portion of the Stage 4 Sampling and Analysis

Plan (SAP) Number 3
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Arthur Dinto, RPM

USAF, Pesse AFB

Johanna Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1
and

Richard Pease, RPM

NHDES

11 December 1992

Letter

PEA B.1)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #149 001-002

Request for Deadline Extension

Arthur Ditto, REM

USAF, Pease AFB

Johanna Huater, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1
and

Richard Pease, RFM

NHDES

23 December 1992

Letter

PEA (6.3)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #150 001-001

Transmittal of EPA Maximum Risk CalcuhtionAdgiend.no Site 5, 8, 3

Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF, Pease AFB
Johanna Hunter, RPM
U.S. EPA, Region 1
and
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES
29 December 1992
Letter

Sites 5, 8, 32/36 and 34; PEA 3.5

ARF

PEA (3.6) #151 001-002

Selection of Remediation Action Alternative for Site 8, FDTA #2

USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Richard Pease, NHDES
08 January 1993

Letter

Site 8; PEA (4.6)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #152 001-002

MULTIMED as a Replacement for the Summers Model

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Art Ditto, AFBDA
11 March 1993
Letter
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PEA (4.5

PEA (3.6) #153 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Zone 4 Remedial Investigation Report
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

9 March 1993

Letter

PEA (3.5); Zone 4

ARF

PEA (3.6) #154 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Zone 4 Remedial Investigation Report
USAF

Johanna Hunter, EPA

9 March 1993

Letter

PEA (3.5); Zone 4

ARF

PEA (3.6) #154 001-006

IRP Site 34 Contaminant Levels
NHDES

An Ditto, AFBDA

3 March 1993

Letter

PEA (3.5); Site 34

ARF

PEA (3.6) #156 001-002
Request for Deadline Extension

. USAF

Johanna Hunter, EPA
Richard Pease, NHDES
19 March 1993

Letter

PEA (3.5)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #157 001-001

Submittal of Responses to Comments of the Zone 4 Site Characterization Summary
USAF

Johanna Hunter, EPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

18 March 1993

Letter

Zome 4

ARF

PEA (3.6) #158 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Zone 5 Remedial Investigation Report
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES
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9 March 1993
Letter

PEA (3.5); Zone 5
ARF

PEA (3.6) #159 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Zone 5 Remedial Investigation Report

USAF

Johanna Hunter, EPA
Undated

Letter

PEA (3.5); Zone 5
ARF

PEA (3.6) #160 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Documeat, Landfill S Record of Decision
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

21 April 1993

Letter

LF-5

ARF

PEA (3.6) #161 001-001
Submittal of Draft Documents
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

21 April 1993

Letter

Zone 3, Zone 4, LF-S

ARF

PEA (3.6) #162 001-001
Submittal of Draft Documents
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

21 April 1993

Letter

Zone 3, Zone 4, LF-5

ARF

PEA (3.6) #163 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Landfill 5 Record of Decision
USAF

Jobanna Hunter, EPA

21 April 1993

Letter

LF-5

ARF

PEA (3.6) #164 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Zone 1 Remedial Investigation Report

USAF
Richard Pease, NHDES
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28 April 1993
Letter

Zone 1, PEA (B.5)
ARF

PEA (3.6) #165 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Zone 1 Remedial Investigation Report
USAF .

Johanna Hunter, EPA

28 April 1993

Letter

Zone 1, PEA (3.5)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #166 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Zone 2 Remedial Investigation Report . -
USAF

Johanna Hunter, EPA

21 May 1993

Letter

Zone 2, PEA (3.5)

ARF

PEA (3.6) #167 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Zone 5 Draft Final Remedial Investigation Report
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Michael Daly, EPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

5 August 1993

Letter

Zone 5

ARF (Section 3.6 Binder)

PEA (3.6) #168 001-002

Zone 3 Remedia! Investigation Report, Draft Final, Outstanding Risk Assessment Concern
NHDES

USAF .

5 November 1993

Letter

Zone 3

ARF (Section 3.6 Binder)

PEA (3.6) #169 001-002

Review of the Draft Final Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report, Pease AFB
EPA

USAF

8 November 1993

Letter

Zone 3

ARF (Section 3.6 Binder)

PEA (3.6) #170 001-008
Locations of Surface Waters of the State of New Hampshire in the Vicinity of Former Pease AFB
Arthur Ditto, ’Puse AFB
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Richard Pease, NHDES
16 November 1993

Letter with Attachment
None

ARF (Section 3.6 Binder)

PEA (3.6) #171 001-002

Zone 1 Draft Final Remedial Investigation Report

NHDES

USAF

24 November 1993

Letter

Zone 1

ARF (Section 3.6 Binder)

PEA (3.6) #172 001-001

Draft Final Zone 3, 4, and S Remedial Investigation Reports, Pease AFB, NH

EPA

USAF

30 November 1993
Memorandum

Zone 3; Zone 4; Zone S
ARF (Section 3.6 Binder)

PEA (3.6) #173 001-013

Work Plan for Site 32/36, RECLAIM Pilot Test

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

6 December 1993

Letter with Attachments
Site 32/36

ARF (Section 3.6 Binder)

PEA (3.6) #174 001-061

Work Plan for Site 32/36, RECLAIM Pilot Test

Arhur Ditto, Pease AFB
Michael Daly, EPA
Richard Pease, NHDES
8 December 1993

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF (Section 3.6 Binder)

PEA (3.6) #175 001-002

Zone'1 Draft Final Remedial Investigation Report

NHDES

USAF

27, November 1993
Letter

Zone 1

ARF (Section 3.6 Binder)

PEA (3.6) #176 001-003

Zone | Draft Final Remedial Investigation Report

MKO!\RPI‘:W.WWSM
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NHDES

USAF

15 December 1993
Letter

Zone 1

AREF (Section 3.6 Binder)
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4.1 ARAR Determinations

PEA (4.1) #1 001-024

New Hampshire ARAR List Update
Richard H. Pease, P.E.

NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM, U S. Air Force/Pesse AFB
13 April 1992

Letter and Tables

None

ARF

PEA (4.1) #2 001-B.3

Installation Restoration Program Stage 4, Basewide ARARs, Pease Air Force Base, NH 03803 — Draft
Roy F. Weston, Inc. ‘

USAF

January 1993

ARARs

None

ARF, IR

PEA (4.1) #3 001-002

Waivenability of Env-WS$ 430, Surface Water Quality Regulations, as an ARAR
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Richard Pease, NHDES

21 December 1993

Letter

None

ARF (Section 4.1 Binder)

PEA (4.1) #4 001025

New Hampshire ARAR List Update
NHDES

USAF

23 December 1993

Letter with Attachment

None

ARF (Section 4.1 Binder)
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42 Feasibility Reports

PEA (4.2) #1 001-B.39 )

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Initial Screening of Alternatives for IRP Site S, Pease AFB, NH
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

October 1991

Report

Site 5

ARF

PEA (42) #£2 001-D.30

Installstion Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Initial Screening of Alternstives for IRP Site 34, Pease AFB, NH Dnaft
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

January 1992

Report

Site 34

ARF

PEA (42) #3 001-C.38

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Initial Screening of Alternatives for IRP Site 32/36, Pease AFB, NH Draft
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

January 1992

Report

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (4.2) #4 001-D .45

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Initial Screening of Alternatives for IRP Site 8, Pease AFB, NH Technical
Report and Appendices - Draft

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

June 1992

Report

Site 8

ARF

PEA (42) #5001-C.5

Installstion Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Initial Screening of Alternatives for IRP Site 8, Pease AFB, NH Figures -
Dnaft

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

June 1992

Figures

Site 8

ARF

PEA (4.2) #6 001-ACR 3

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Feasibility Study for IRP Site 5, Pease AFB, NH - Technical Report — Draft
Fimal '

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

" USAF
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MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\200¢Srod. apc

August 1992

Site 5

PEA (4.2) #7001-5.2.14

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Feasibility Study for IRP Site S, Pease AFB, NH - Figures — Draft Final
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

August 1992

Figures

Site §

ARF

PEA (4.2) #8 001-1.3 . ] .
Instaliation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Feasibility Study for IRP Site 5, Pease AFB, NH - Appendices A-1. Draft
Final

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

August 1992

Appeadices

Site 5

ARF

PEA (4.2) #9 001-B21

Installation Restorstion Program, Stage 3C, IRP Site 8, Soil Vapor Extraction Treatability Study Work Plan for Pease
AFB, NH —Draft ' .

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

September 1992

Treatability Study Work Plan

Site 8

ARF

PEA (4.2) #10 001-L.4

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Feasibility Study for IRP Site 8, Pease AFB, NH — Appendices A-L — Draft
Roy F. Weston, Inc. ' .

USAF ’

October 1992

Appendices

Site 8

ARF

PEA (42) #11 001-5.2.16

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Feasibility Sudy for IRP Site 8, Pease AFB, NH, Figures ~ Draft
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

October 1992

Figures

Site 8

ARF

PEA (42) #12 001-5.126
Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Feasibility Stmdy for IRP Site 8, Pease AFB, NH, Technical Report — Draft
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Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

October 1992
Report

Site 8

ARF

PEA (4.2) #13 001-5.2.9 .

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Feasibility Study for IRP Site 34, Pease AFB, NH, — Figures — Dnft Final
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

November 1992

Report

Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.2) #14 001-J

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Feasibility Study for IRP Site 34, Pease AFB, NH, — Appendices — Dnaft
Final

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

November 1992

Report

Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.2) #15001-ACR.3 .

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Feasibility Study for IRP Site 34, Pease AFB, NH, — Technical Report —
Dnft Final ' ' . '

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

November 1992

Technical Report

Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.2) #16 0014.2.12

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C, Feasibility Study for IRP Site 32./36, Pease AFB, NH, — Figures — Revised
Dnaft Final ' : ' ,

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

October 1993

Figures

Site 32/36

ARF (Site 32/36 Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #17 001-ACR.3

US. Air Force Instaliation Restoration Program, Site 32/36 Feasibility Study Report Pease AFB, NH, — Revised Dnft
Final

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

October 1993

Report

Site 32/36

ARF (Site 32/36 Shelf)
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PEA (4.2) #18 001-].155
U.S. Air Force Installation Restorstion Program, Site 32/36 Feasibility Smudy Report, Pease AFB, NH, Appendices —
Revised Draft Final
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
October 1993
Appendices
Site 32/36
ARF (Site 32/36 Shelf)
#
PEA (4.2) #19 001-Acr.1
United States AirFotceImall.tionReﬂonﬁoangnm,PaseAFB, Zone 5 Initial Screening of Alternatives Report —
Dnft : :
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
March 1993
Report
Zope S
ARF
#
PEA (4.2) #20 001-E.4
Instalistion Restoration Program, Stage 4 No Further Action Decision Document for IRP Site 11, Pease AFB, NH 03803
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
February 1993
Report
Site 11
ARF
#
PEA (4.2) #21 001-Acr.3
Instailation Restoration Program, Stage 3C Feasibility Study for IRP Site 8, Pease AFB, NH 03803, Technical Report —
Draft Final
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
January 1993
Report
Site 8
ARF

PEA (4.2) #22 001-5.2-16 .
Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C Feasibility Study for IRP Site 8, Pease AFB, NH 03803. Figures — Draft Final
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
January 1993
Figures
Site 8
ARF
#
PEA (42) #23 001-L.6
Mﬂaﬁonkeaonﬁon?&ognm, Stage 3C Feasibility Study for IRP Site 8, Pease AFB, NH 03803. Appendices A
through L — Draft Finai
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF
January 1993
Appendices
Site 8 '
ARF

09/09/94
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PEA (4.2) £24 001-K.5-2

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pesse AFB Mclntyre Brook/Lower Newfields Ditch Remedial
Investigation/Feasibility Sudy— DRAFT FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

November 1993

Report
PEA (3.5) 112 001-K.5-2
ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #25 001-MM4B-7

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Progrem Pease AFB Zone 3 Initial Screening of Alternatives DRAFT
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

May 1993

Feasibility Study

Zone 3

ARF

PEA (4.2) #26 001-MM3-9

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pease AFB Zone | Initial Screening of Alternatives Report DRAFT
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

May 1993

Feasidility Smudy

Zone 1

ARF

PEA (4.2) #27 001-BA1-4B-2

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pease AFB Zone 2 Initial Screening of Alternatives (Preliminary Draft
Feasibility Study) DRAFT '

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

June 1993

Feasibility Study

Zone2

ARF

PEA (4.2) #28 001-MM3B-3

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pease AFB Zone 4 Initial Screeaing of Alternatives Report DRAFT
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

April 1993

Feasibility Study

Zone 4

ARF (Zone 4 Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #29001-A.8

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pease AFB Zone S Feasibility Sudy Report — Draft Final
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

October 1993

Feasibility Study
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LOCATION: ARF (Zone 5 Shelf)
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (4.2) #30 001-ACR 3
LONG TITLE: U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program Pease AFB Zone 4 Feasibility Study Text — DRAFT FINAL
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.
RECIPIENT: . USAF
DATE: November 1993
TYPE: Feasibility Smdy
SECOND REFERENCE: Zone 4
LOCATION: ARF (Zone 4 Shelf)
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (4.2) #31 001-L.11
LONG TITLE: U.S. Air Force Instaliation Restoration Program Pease AFB Zone 4 Feasibility Sudy Appendices DRAFT FINAL
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc. .
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: November 1993
TYPE: Appendices
SECOND REFERENCE: Zone 4
LOCATION: ARF (Zons 4 Shelf)
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (4.2) #32 ES-1-ACR-3 -
LONG TITLE: U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Feasibility Study Report Text—DRAFT FINAL
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: _ November 1993
" TYPE: : Report
SECOND REFERENCE: Zope 3
LOCATION: ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (4.2) #33 A-1-L-6
LONG TITLE: U.S. Air Force Insullation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 3 Feasibility Smudy Report Appendices~DRAFT
FINAL
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: November 1993
TYPE: - Appendix
SECOND REFERENCE: Zone 3
LOCATION: ' ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (4.2) 34 1-1-TH-5
LONG TITLE: Haven Pumping Test Letter Report for Pease AFB, NH
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: January 8, 1993
TYPE: Transmittal Letter, Letter Report
SECOND REFERENCE: Zone 3
LOCATION: ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)
: #
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (4.2) 35 1.1-250
LONG TITLE: Installation Restoration Program, Hangar 227 Treatability Test-Final Report, Pease Air Force Base, NH
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: July 1993
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Report
Zone 3
ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #36 iii-ACR-3

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease Air Force Base, Zone 7 Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study
(also known as Site 45, Old Jet Engine Test Stand)-Text—DRAFT FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

December 1993

Report
PEA 3.5 #106 ES.1-ACR. 3
ARF (Zone 7 Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #37 iii-9.2-6

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease Air Force Base, ZUne7Remedanvesugmon/Feuibmty8mdy
Figures—DRAFT FINAL (also known as Site 45, Old Jet Engine Test Stand)

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

. USAF

December 1993

Figures
PEA 3.5 #107 001-9.2-6
ARF (Zone 7 Shelf)

PEA (42) #384.1-G
U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease Air Force Base, Zone 7 Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study
(also known as Site 45, Old Jet Engine Test Stand) Appendices A, B, C, D, E, F and G-DRAFT FINAL

" Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

December 1993
Appendices

PEA 3.5 #108 001-F
ARF (Zone 7 Shelf)

PEA 42) 9 H.I-R
U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease Air Force Base, Zone 7 Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study
(also known as Site 45, Old Jet Engine Test Stand) AppendicesH, and I Part 2 of 2-DRAFT FINAL

" Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

December 1993
Appendices

PEA 3.5 #109 001-J (K.6-1)
ARF (Zone 7 Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #40 001-700
U.S. Air Force Instaliation Restoration Program, Pease Air Force Base, Zone 7 Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study
(also known as Site 45, Old Jet Engine Test Stand) Appendix 1 Part 1 of 2 -DRAFT FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

December 1993

Appendix .

PEA (3.5) #110 ES.1-ACR 3
ARF (Zone 7 Shelf)

.C-107

05/09/94



DOCUMENTNUMBER:‘

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:
TYPE:

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\z00¢5r0d.apc

PEA (42)#41)
U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease Air Force Base, Zone 7 (also known as Site 45, Old Jet Engine
Test Stand) Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study Appendix J~DRAFT FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

December 1993

Appendices

PEA (3.5 #111L.1-Q.2

ARF (Zone 7 Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #42001-A .

Performance of the Site 32/36 Pilot Groundwater Treatment Plant Modified Interim Remedial Measure Between July 26
and September 16, 1993 :

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

11 November 1993

Letter Report '

Site 32/36

ARF (Site 32/36 Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #43 001-047 )

32/36 DNAPL Detection Well, Pease AFB, NH
Roy F. Weston, Inc. .
USAF

20 December 1993

Treatability Sudy Letter Report

Site 32/36

ARF (Site 32/36 Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #44001-R.4

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 1 Feasibility Study Report, Text — DRAFT FINAL
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

December 1993

Feasibility Study

Zone 1

ARF (Zone | Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #45001-J.7 :
U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zope 1 Feasibility Study Report Appendices —~ DRAFT
FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

December 1993

Feasibility Study

Zone 1

ARF (Zone 1 Shelf)

PEA (42) #46 K-Q :
U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease Air Force Base, Zone 7 Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study
(also known as Site 45, Old Jet Engine Test Stand) Appendices K, L, M, N, O, P and Q — DRAFT FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

December 1993

Appeadices
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Zone 7
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PEA (4.2) #47 iii-ACR-3

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease Air Force Base, Zone 2 Feasibility

FINAL

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

December 1993
Text

Zone2

ARF (Zone 2 Shelf)

PEA (4.2) #43 A.1K.13

Study Report, Text, DRAFT

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Zone 2 Feasibility Study Report Appendices

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

December 1993
Appendices

Zone2

ARF (Zone 2 Shelf)
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4.3 Proposed Plan

PEA (4.3) #1 001-220
"Proposed Plan for Landfill 3, Field MaimzmneeSquadmnEquipmmcmningSite, Fire Department Training Area 1*
Roy F. Weston, Inc., Inc

EPA, NHDES

October 1990

Work Plan

None

ARF

FEA (43) 2 1.1-Figure 4
ReviudepoledPhnformPsiteS, Landfill § Source Area — Revised Draft Final
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF, EPA, NHDES, Public

July 1993

Proposed Plan

Landfill 5

ARF (LF-5 Shelf), R

PEA (4.3) #3 001-Figure 5

Installation Restoration Program, Proposed Plans for IRP Sites 32/36 and 34. Pease Air Force Base, NH 03803-0157 —
Draft Final .

USAF

USAF,

EPA, NHDES

March 1993

Proposed Plan

Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.3) %44 001-Figure 5 :
Installation Restoration Program, Proposed Plans for IRP Sites 32/36 and 34. Pease Air Force Base, NH 03803-0157 -
Draft Final

USAF

USAF,

EPA, NHDES

March 1993

Proposed Plan

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (4.3) #5 001-G4
hmlhﬁonkeﬂon&on?rogum,?mpowd?hnforIRPShesSZBG,Punm,NH—Duﬁ
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

January 1994

Proposed Plan

Sites 32/36

ARF (Site 32/36 Shelf)

PEA (4.3) #6 001-R1
Installation Restoration Program, Proposed Plan for Zope 3, Pease AFB, NH
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
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USAF

Janusry 1994
Proposed Plan
Zone 3

ARF (Zone 3 Shelf)

PEA (4.3) #7 001-G.3

Installation Restoration Program, Proposed Plan for Zone 5, Pease AFB, NH-DRAFT

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

October 1993
Proposed Plan

Zone 5

ARF (Zooe 5 Shelf)

PEA (4.3) #8 001-G.4

Installation Restoration Program, Proposed Plan for Zone 4, Pease AFB, NH-DRAFT

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

November 1993
Proposed Plan
Zone 4

ARF (Zone 4 Shelf)

PEA (4.3) #9 001-R.1

Installation Restoration Program, Proposed Plan for IRP Zone 1, Pease AFB, NH

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

January 1994
Proposed Plan

Zone 1

ARF (Zone 1 Shelf)
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45 Conspondai:e

PEA (4.5) #1 001-006

*IRP Proposed Plan for Landfill 3, Field Maintenance Squadron Equipment Cleaning Site, Fire Department Training Area
1 (October 1990, draft) Review Comments”

State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services

Air Force
27 November 1990
State of New Hampsghire Review Comments
None
ARF

#
PEA (4.5 £2 001-016

*EPA Region I comments on the IRP Proposed Plan for Landfill 3, Field Maintenance Squadron Equipment Cleaning Site,
Fire Department Training Area 1 (October 1990, draft)” :

U.S.EPA

Air Force

28 November 1990

EPA Review Comments

None

ARF

PEA (4.5) #3 001-008

*EPA Region 1 additional comments on the IRP proposed plan for Landfill 3, field maintenance squadron equipment
cleaning site, Fire Department Training Ares 1 (October 1990, draft); review comments® .
U.S. EPA

Air Force

3 December 1990

Review Comments

None

ARF

PEA (4.5) #4 001-001

Submital of Draft Final Primary Document, Landfill 5 Feasibility Study Report
USAF

Ricbard Pease, NHDES

Unkriown

Letter

Landfill §

ARF

PEA (4.5) #5 001-002

Applicable or Relevant and Appropriate Requirements (ARARS)
Richard Pease, NHDES

Art Ditto, Pease AFB

25 November 1991

Letter

Pea (6.4)

ARF

PEA (4.5) # 001-001

Submittal of Secondary Document
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

09/05/94
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09 January 1992
Letter

Site 32/36; Site 34
ARF

PEA (4.5) #7 001-001

Submittal of Secondary Document
USAF

Johanns Hunter, USEPA

09 January 1992

Letter

Site 32/36; Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.5) #3 001-001
Landfill 3 Decision Document
USAF

Edward S. Barnes

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

1 Weston Way

West Chester, PA 19380
03 February 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (4.5) #9 001-004

Jet Engine T:<x Cell Source Area Feasibility Study Report
Edward S. t:-aes, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Johanns Hunter USEPA

Richard Pesse, NHDES

04 May 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (4.5) #10 001-005

Pease AFB Site 32/36 Feasibility Study Report
Edward S. Barnes, Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

15 May 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (4.5) #11 001001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Site 32/36 Feasibility Study Report

USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
19 May 1992

Letter

Site 32/36
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PEA (4.5) #12 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Site 32/36 Feasibility Study Report
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

19 May 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (4.5) #13 001-001.

RequestforDeadlineEnmsionfoxReviewofﬂanﬁRPSiteSFasibilityReponDatedApﬁl 1992

Jobanne M. Huater, USEPA
Ar Ditto, Pease AFB

22 May 1992

Letter

Site 5

ARF

PEA (4.5) #14 001-001
Document Submittals
USAF

Jobanna Hunter, USEPA
Richard Pease, NHDES
26 May 1992

Letter

Pea (10.1); Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.5) #15 001-002

Selection of Remedial Action Alternative for JETC, IRP Site 34
USAF

Johanna Huater, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

28 May 1992

Letter

Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.5) #16 001-001

Submittal of Draft Secondary Document, Site 8 Initial Screening of Alternatives
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

24 June 1992

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (4.5) #17 001-001

Submittal of Draft Secondary Documeat, Site 8 Initial Screening of Alternatives
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

24 June 1992

MKOL\RPT:00628026.004\zaneS10d.2pc C-115

09/05/94



SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMRER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:
SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

" DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMRBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT: .

.DATE:
TYPE:
SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

PEA (4.5) #18 001-002
Feasibility Study Reports
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Richard Pease, NHDES
10 August 1992

Letter

Sites 5, 34, and 32/36
ARF

PEA (4.5) #19 001001 .
Submittal of Landfill 5 Draft Proposed Plan
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

12 August 1992

Letter

Landfill 5

ARF

PEA (4.5) #20 001-001

Submittal of Landfill S Draft Proposed Plan
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

12 August 1992

Letter

Landfill 5

ARF

PEA (4.5) #21 001-003

Landfill 5 Source Area Draft Final Feasibility Study Report
Edward S. Barnes, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Jobanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

14 August 1992

Letter

Landfill 5

ARF

PEA (4.5) #22 001001
Submittal of Draft Final Primary Documeat, Landfill § Feasibility Suudy Report
USAF '

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

18 August 1992 :

Letter

Landfill 5

ARF

PEA (4.5) #23 001-001
Submittal of Draft Final Primary Document, Landfil] 5 Feasibility Study Report
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USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES
18 August 1992

Letter

Landfill §

ARF

PEA (4.5) #24 001-004 )

Pease Air Force Base Site 8 Draft Feasibility Study
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

NHDES

USEPA

29 October 1992

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (4.5) #25 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Site 8 Feasibility Study Report
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

3 November 1992

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (4.5) #26 001-001 ]

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Site 8 Feasibility Study Report
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

3 November 1992

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (4.5) #27 001-001
Landfill 5 Draft Proposed Plan
USAF

Johannas Hunter, USEPA
Richard Pease, NHDES

17 November 1992

Letter

Landfill 5

ARF

PEA (4.5) #28 001-002

Pease Air Force Base Draft Final IRP Site 34 FS Report
Edward S. Barnes, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

20 November 1992

Letter

Site 34
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PEA (4.5) #29 001-001

Submittal of Draft Final Primary Document, Site 34 Feasibility Study Report
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

24 November 1992

Letter

Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.5) #30 001-001

Submittal of Draft Final Primary Document, Site 34 Feasibility Study Report
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

24 November 1992

Letter

Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.5) #31 001-001

Determination of Site Boundaries at the Time of Remedial Action Implementation (Will Migrate to Proposal)

USAF

Johanns Hunter, USEPA
Richard Pease, NHDES
2 December 1992
Letter

None

ARF

PEA (4.5) #32 001-002
Request for Deadline Extension
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Richard Pease, NHDES

4 December 1992

Letter

Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.5) #33 001001
Site 34 GWTP ITR
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Richard Pease, NHDES
9 December 1992
Letter

Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.5) #34 001002

Pease Air Force Base Draft Final IRP Site 32/36 FS Report
Lee dePersia, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Jim Snyder, USAF
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10 December 1992

Site 32/36

PEA (4.5) #35 001-001

Submittal of Draft Final Primary Document, Site 32/36 Feasibility Study Report
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

14 December 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (4.5) #36 001-001

Submittal of Draft Final Primary Document, Site 32/36 Feasibility Study Report
USAF )

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

14 December 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (4.5) #37 001-001

Submittal of Buildings 113/119 and Building 222 Draft Proposed Plan
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

16 December 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (4.5) #38 001-001

Submittal of Buildings 113/119 and Building 222 Draft Proposed Plan
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

16 December 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (4.5) #39 001-001
Submittal of the Draft Site 8 Proposed Plan
USAF ‘

" Richard Pease, NHDES

JoHanns Hunter, USEPA
23 March 1993

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (4.5) #40 001-001
Submittal of Draft Secondary Document, Zone 5 Initial Screening of Alternatives
USAF
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Richard Pease, NHDES
12 March 1993

Zone 5

PEA (4.5) #41 001-001

Submittal of Draft Secondary Document, Zone 5 Initial Screening of Alternatives
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

12 March 1993

Letter

Zone S

ARF

PEA (4.5) #42 001-001

Submittal of the Sites 32/36 and 34 Draft Final Proposed Plan
USAF

Jobanna Hunter, USEPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

9 March 1993

Letter

Site 32/36; Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.5) #43 001-004

Selection of Remedial Action Alternatives for Site 8, FDTA-2
NHDES

Art Ditto, AFBDA

12 February 1993

Letter

PEA (6.3)

ARF

PEA (4.5) #44 001-002

Submittal of the Sites 32/36 and 34 Draft Final Proposed Plan
USAF

Johanna Hunter, EPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

03 February 1993

Letter

PEA (6.3); Sites 32/36; Site 34

ARF

PEA (4.5) #45 001-001

Submittal of Draft Final Primary Documeat, Site § Feasibility Study Report
USAF

Johanna Hunter, EPA

29 February 1993

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (4.5) #46 001-001
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Submittal of Draft Final Primary Document, Site 8 Feasibility Study Report
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

29 Japuary 1993

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (4.5) #47 001-002

Site 32/36 and Sit 34 Draft Final Proposed Plans
NHDES

Arnt Ditto, AFBDA

12 February 1993

Letter

Sites 32/36; Site 34; Pea (4.3)

ARF

PEA (4.5) #48 001-001
SubmimlofDnﬁSwondnryDocumem,Zone4lniﬁalSaemingofAhumﬁves
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Jobanna Hunter, EPA Region 1

S April 1993

Letter

Zone 4

ARF

PEA (4.5) #49 001-001

Submittal ofDnﬁSecondnyDowmenLZone@lniﬁalScneningofAlmnﬁves
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Richard Pease, NHDES

S April 1993

Letter

Zone 4

- ARF

PEA (4.5) #50 001-001

Submittal of Draft Secondary Document, Zone 3 Initial Screening of Alternatives
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Johanna Hunter, EPA Region 1

17 May 1993 '

Letter

Zone 3

ARF

PEA (4.5) #51 001-001

Submittal of Draft Secondary Document, Zone 3 Initial Screening of Alternatives
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB '

Richard Pease, NHDES

17 May 1993

Letter

Zone 3

ARF

PEA (4.5) #52 001-001
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SubmiﬂdofDnﬁSeeonduyDocuw,ZonelIniﬁalScmeningofAkmaﬁvu
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Richard Pease, NHDES

3 June 1993

Letter

Zone 1

ARF

PEA (4.5) #53 001-001
SubmindofDnﬁSeeondaryDowmem,ZomllxﬁﬁdScmningofAnemﬁvea
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Mike Daly, EPA Region 1

3 June 1993

Letter

Zone 1

ARF

PEA (4.5) #54 001-001

Submittal of Proposed Plans for Landfills 2 and 4 and Land§ill §
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Mike Daly, EPA Region 1

Richard Pease, NHDES

25 June 1993

Letter

LF-2, LF-4, LF-S

ARF

PEA (4.5) #55 001001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Zone 5 Draft Feasibility Study
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB ’

Richard Pease, NHDES

14 July 1993

Letter

Zone 5

ARF

PEA (4.5) #56 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Zoze 5 Draft Feasibility Study
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Mike Daly, EPA Region 1

14 July 1993

Letter

Zone S

ARF .

PEA (4.5) #57 001-002 :
Submittal of the Revised Site 8 Proposed Plan
Athur Ditto, Pease AFB

Mike Daly, EPA Region 1

Richard Pease, NHDES

28 July 1993

Letter

Site 8

ARF
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PEA (4.5) #58 001-003

Former Pease AFB, Surface Water Issues
Richard Pease, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

29 November 1993

Letter

Nope

ARF (Section 4.5 Binder)

PEA (4.5) #59 001-001

Site 8, Fire Department Training Area #2, Chemicals of Concern for Metals

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
Michael Daly, EPA

29 November 1993
Letter

Site 8

ARF (Section 4.5 Binder)

PEA (4.5) #60 001-012

Construction - Phase Water Treatment and Disposal at LF-6
Ed Shorely, CH2M Hill

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

3 December 1993

Memorandum with Attachments

LF-6

ARF (Section 4.5 Binder)

PEA (4.5) #61 001011

Request for Deadline Extension, Zone 2 Proposed Plan
Aurthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Michael Daly, EPA Region I

Richard Pease, NHDES

3 February 1994

Letter

Zone 2

ARF (Section 4.5 Binder)

PEA (4.5) #62 001007

Groundwater Treatment Plant Influent/Effiuent Results, Quarterly Reporting

Aurthur Ditto, Pease AFB
Bill Wandle, EPA Region I
Jeff Andrews, NHDES

24 January 1994

Letter Report

Site 32/36; Site 34

ARF (Section ___ Binder)

PEA (4.5) #61 001-001

Groundwater Treatment Plant Influent/Effluent Results, Quarterly Reporting

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
Bill Wandle, EPA

Jeff Andrews, NHDES

9 December 1993

Letter

Site 32/36; Site 34; Site 39

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod.apc C-123
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LOCATION: ARF (Section 4.5 Binder)
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DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:
TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

PEA (5.1) #1 001-12.1

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Record of Decision for a Source Ares Remedial Action at

Site 34

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

September 1993
ROD

Site 34

ARF (Site 34 Shelf)

PEA (5.1) # 001-12.1

U.S. Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Pease AFB, Record of Decision for a Source Area Remsdial Action at

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

_ USAF

September 1993
ROD

LF-§

ARF (LF-5 Shelf)

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod.apc

5.1 ROD

C-125

09/09/94



* NOTE: NO ENTRIES IN THIS SECTION AT THIS TIME

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

MEKOI\RPT:00628026.004\z0neSr0d. apc

52 Amendments to ROD
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53 Explanations of Significant Differences
* NOTE: NO ENTRIES IN THIS SECTION AT THIS TIME

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:
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DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

. DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

54 Correspondence

PEA (5.4) #1 001-001

Region 1 ROD Model Language
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Usnknown

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (5.49) #2 001-001

Submittal of Draft Primary Documeat, Site 34 Record of Decision
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Mike Daly, EPA Region 1 -

17 June 1993

Letter

Site 34

ARF

PEA (5.4) #3 001001

Submittal of Draft Primary Document, Site 34 Record of Decision
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Richard Pease, NHDES

17 June 1993 ’

Letter

Site 34

ARF

PEA (5.4) #4 001-002

Pease AFB IRP ROD Review Process
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
AFBCA/NE

15 December 1993

Letter

None

ARF (Section 5.4 Binder)

PEA (5.4) #5 001-002

Getting to & ROD, Revised Milestones
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Michael Daly, EPA Regionl

Richard Pease, NHDES

4 February 1994

Letter '

Zone 1; Zone 2; Zone 3; Zone 4

Site 32/36

ARF (Section 5.4 Binder)

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod. apc ' . C-128
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6.1 Cooperative Agreements / SMOAs

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.1) #1 001013

LONG TITLE: *Memorandum of Understanding Executed Between the Town of Newington, NH, and Pease Air Force Base, NH"
AUTHOR: Town of Newington/Pease Air Force Base ’

RECIPIENT: Air Force ’

DATE: 22 August 1980

TYPE: Memorandum of Understanding .

SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.1) #2 001-004

LONG TITLE: *Memorapdum of Understanding (MOU) betweea the U.S. Air Foree Occupational and Environmental Health Laboratory
(USAFOEHL) and Pease Air Force Base relating to procedures for conducting the IRP*

AUTHOR: U.S. Department of the Air Force

RECIPIENT: Air Force

DATE: © 31 July 1987

TYPE: Memorandum of Understanding

SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF
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DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT: .

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:
TYPE:

" SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

' DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:
TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:
TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

62 Federal Facility Agreement (FFA)

PEA (6.2) #1 001-097

"Federa] Facility Agreement under CERCLA Section 120"
U.S. EPA, Region|, State of New Hampshire and the U.S. Department of the Air Force*

EPA, NHDES, Air Force
24 April 1991

Federsl Facility Agreement
None

ARF

PEA (6.2) # 001-003

"Remedial Project Mansgers Meeting Minutes”

Pease Air Force Base
See Distribution List
16 January 1991
Meeting Minutes
None

ARF, R

PEA (6.2) #3 001-003

"Remedial Project Managers Meeting Minutes”

Pease Air Force Base
See Distribution List
20 February 1991
Meeting Minutes
None

ARF, IR

PEA (6.2) #4 001-003

"Remedial Project Mansgers Meeting Minutes”

Pease Air Force Base
See Distribution List
20 March 1991
Meeting Minutes
None

ARF, IR

PEA (62) #5 001-002

"Remedial Project Managers Meeting Minutes"

Pease Air Force Base
See Distribution List
17 April 1991
Meeting Minutes
None

ARF, IR

PEA (6.2) #6 001-002

"Remedial Project Managers Meeting Minutes®

Pease Air Force Base
See Distribution List
21 May 1991
Meeting Minutes

Noane

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\z00e5rod.apc
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LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMEBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

ARF, R

PEA (6.2) #7 001002

*Remedial Project Managers Meeting Minutes®
Pease Air Force Base

See Distribution List

24 June 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF, IR

PEA (6.2) # 001-11.4

Modification 1 to Pease AFB Federal Facilities Agreement
USAF -

Michsel Daly, EPA Region I

8 September 1993

FFA Modification

None

ARF, (Section 6.2 Binder)
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DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE: :
SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:
TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:
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63 Coordination - State / Federal

PEA (6.3) #1 001-003

"Meeting minutes from Air Force meeting with state officials concerning Pease Air Force Base IRP®
U.S. Air Force

See Distribution List

11 March 1987

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #2 001-002
"Agenda for Meeting with State DES, Air Force, and EPA Technical Team”
Pease Air Force Base

See Distribution List

26 April 1990

Agends '

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #3 001-031

"Completed Applications for Department of the Army Permit (ENG Form 435) and New Hampshire Wetlands Board
Permit”

Department of the Air Force

Army Corps of Engineers, New England Division

31 August 1989

Letter and Attachments

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #4 001-002

"Letter regarding emergency discharge exclusion from the requirement for a permit under the National Pollutant Discharge
Elimination System (NPDES)"

US EPA

Air Force

29 September 1989

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #5 001-002

"Letter in response to Air Force question regarding necessity of & permit for the prop
Department of the Army

Air Force

17 October 1989

Letter

None

ARF

d landfill cf

PEA (6.3) #6 001-001

"Agenda and Notes for Working Meeting with U.S. EPA and Stte of New Hampshire”
US Air Force

See Distribution List

21 November 1989

C-132 '

09/09/94



SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

" DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMEBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod.apc

Agenda and Meeting Notes
None

PEA (6.3) #7 001025

"Letter response to Air Force letter of 22 August 1990 regarding CERCLA remedial actions at Pease Air Force Base, 404
permit not required”

Department of the Army

Air Force

3 October 1990

Response Letter

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #8 001-033

'PointPaperon[nmmﬁmkeﬂonﬁoangnm(PuuAFB)mdAmchmem(Pmpamd for & meeting of J. Coit and
M. Aldrich, of Seaator Humphrey’s office, with Pease, NHDES, ‘WESTON, and OEHL)"

Pease Air Force Base

J. Coit & M. Aldrich of Seaator Humphrey's Office

31 March 1989

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #9 001-003

*Recommendation to Place Pease AFB on the National Priority List (NPL)"
Department of the Air Force

US EPA

27 Jupe 1989

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #10 001-004

Remedial Project Managers’ Meeting Minutes of January 16, 1991
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees

Meeting Date: 16 January 1991

Meeting Minutes

Nope

ARF

PEA (6.3) #11 001-004

Remedial Project Managers’ Meeting Minutes of February 20, 1991
Arthur Ditto, RPFM

USAF/Peasc AFB

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees

Meeting Date: 20 February 1991

Meeting Minutes
None
ARF
¥
PEA (6.3) #12 001-004
C-133 0910994



LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMRBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\zoaeSrod_apc

Remedial Project Managers’ Meeting Minutes
USAF

See Distribution

20 March 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #13 001-004

Remedial Project Managers’ Meeting Minutes of April 17, 1991
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees

17 April 1991

Meeting Minutes

Noae

ARF

PEA (6.3) #14 001-003

Remedial Project Managers® Meeting Minutes of May 21, 1991
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees

21 May 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #15 001-004
Notification of Additional Investigative Work in a Wetland
USAF

NHDES

Wetlands Board

P.O. Box 2008

Concord, NH 03301-3406

14 June 1991

Letter '

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #16 001-003

Remedial Project Managers’ Meeting Minutes of July 24, 1991
Arthur Ditto, RPM ’
USAF/Pease AFB

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees

24 Junpe 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #17 001-003

Remedial Project Managers® Meeting Minutes of August 26, 1991
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees
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DATE: 24 July 1991

TYPE: Meeting Mioutes
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.3) #18 001-004

LONG TITLE: Remedial Project Mansgers® Meeting Minutes of September 26, 1991
AUTHOR: Arthur Ditto, RPM :
USAF/Pease AFB
RECIPIENT: U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees
DATE: 21 August 1991
TYPE: Meeting Minutes
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.3) #19 001-004

LONG TITLE: Remedial Project Managers® Meeting Minutes
AUTHOR: Arthur Ditto, REM
USAF/Pease AFB
RECIPIENT: U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees
DATE: 26 September 1991
TYPE: ) Meeting Minutes
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.3) #20 001-004

' LONG TITLE: Remedial Project Managers® Meeting Minutes
AUTHOR: Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB
RECIPIENT: U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees
DATE: 27 October 1991
TYPE: Meeting Minutes
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.3) #21 001-003

LONG TITLE: Remedial Project Managers® Meeting Minutes
AUTHOR: ‘Arthur Ditto, RPFM
USAF/Pesase AFB
RECIPIENT: U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees
DATE: 20 November 1991
TYPE: Meeting Minutes
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.3) #22 001003

LONG TITLE: Remedial Project Managers® Meeting Minutes of January 27, 1992
AUTHOR: Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB
RECIPIENT: U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees
DATE: 19 December 1991
TYPE: Meeting Minutes
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\zon¢Srod-ape C-135



DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

PEA (6.3) #23 001-003

Remedial Project Managers’ Meeting Minutes
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees

27 January 1992

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #24 001003

Remedial Project Managers’ Meeting Minutes
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees

25 February 1992

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #£25 001-002

Remedial Project Managers® Meeting Minutes
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees

07 April 1992

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #26 001-004

NH Wetlands Permit for National Priorities List Related Work

USAF

NHDES

‘Wetlands Board

P.O. Box 2008

Concord, NH 03301-2008
24 April 1992

Letter

None
ARF

PEA (6.3) #27 001-002

Remedial Project Managers’ Meeting Minutes
USAF

See Distribution

22 April 1992

Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #28 001-008

Remedial Project Managers’ Meeting Minutes, June 3, 1992

Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB

MKONRPT:00628026.004\z0ncSrod.pc C-136

09/09/94



RECIPIENT:
DATE:
TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

MXO01\RPT:00628026.004\z00eSrod.apc

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees
3 June 1992

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #29 001-003

Remedial Project Managers’ Meeting Minutes of August 21, 1991
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB ]

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees

Meeting Date: 21 August 1992

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #30 001-003

Remedial Project Managers® Meeting Minutes - September 10, 1992
Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF/Pease AFB

U.S. EPA/NHDES/USAF Attendees

10 September 1992

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #31 001-002
New Hampshire Sites Where SVE is Used for NAPL Removal
John Regan, NHDES
Art Ditto, Pease AFB
Mike Daly, USEPA
Richard Pease, NHDES
Scott Doane, NHDES
30 September 1992
Letter

None

ARF

PEA (6 3) #32 001-002

Remedial Project Managers® Meeting Minutes - October 20, 1992
Arthur Ditto, RFM

EPA, NHDES, USAF

Antendees

20 October 1992

Minutes

None

ARF

PEA (6.3) #33 001-003

Application of the Reasonsble Maximum Exposure (RME) in Risk Assessments; Request for Site Specific Justification for
Using the "Average Maximum*®

Richard Pease, NHDES

At Ditto, Pease AFB

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Capt. Woerthle, AFCEE
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DATE: 22 October 1992

TYPE: Letter
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.3) #34 001-001

LONG TITLE: Guidebook for Environmental Permits in New Hampshire
AUTHOR: Richard Pease, NHDES
RECIPIENT: Art Ditto, Pease AFB
Jobanna Hunter, USEPA
DATE: 4 November 1992
TYPE: Letter
SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF

‘ DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.3) #35 001-004

LONG TITLE: NcwingmthterQunlitySamplingonOmberM, l992mdAmlysisPufomedonanber28, 1992, NHDES Sample
#220009

AUTHOR: Scott Doane, NHDES

RECIPIENT: Wayne Wood, Newington, NH

Richard Pease, NHDES
Mark McKenzie, Pease AFB

DATE: 11 December 1992
TYPE: Letter

SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.3) #36 001-Attachment 6

LONG TITLE: Quarterly Report, Second Quarter 1991
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.

RECIPIENT: EPA, NHDES, USAF

DATE: 19 July 1991

TYPE: Quarterly Report

SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF, Art Ditto’s office files

DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (6.3) #37 001-034

LONG TITLE: Quarterly Report, Third Quarter 1991
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.

RECIPIENT: EPA, NHDES, USAF

DATE: 24 October 1991

TYPE: Quarterly Report, Transmittal Letters
SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF, Art Ditto’s office files

DOCUMENT NUMEER: PEA (6.3) #38 001-030

LONG TITLE: Quarteriy Report, Fourth Quarter 1991
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.

RECIPIENT: EPA, NHDES, USAF

DATE: 14 January 1992

TYPE: Quarterly Report

SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF, Art Ditto’s office files

' #
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DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

TYFE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TIILE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:
TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

PEA (6.3) #39 001-020

Quarteriy Report, First Quarter 1992

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES, USAF

15 April 1992

Quarterly Report

None

ARF, At Ditto’s office files

PEA (6.3) #40 001-032

Quarteriy Report, Secand Quarter 1992

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES, USAF

14 July 1992

Quarterly Report

None

ARF, Art Ditto’s office files

PEA (6.3) #41 001-043

Quarterly Report, Third Quarter 1992

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES, USAF

20 October 1992

Quarterly Report

None

ARF, An Ditto’s office files

PEA (6.3) #42001-Q4

Transmittal Letter for Quarterly Progress Report, Fourth Quarter 1992

Art Ditto, RPM, Pease AFB

Johanns Hunter, RPM, USEPA Region 1

Richard Pease, RPM, NHDES

19 January 1993

Transmittal Letter and Quarterly Report

None
ARF, Art Ditto’s office files

PEA (6.3) #43 001-E.1

Quartery Progress Report for Pease AFB

Art Ditto, RPM, Pease AFB

Johanns Husnter, RPM, USEPA Region 1

Richard Pease, RPM, NHDES

26 April 1993
Report

None
ARF

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\z0nc5 rod.apc
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DOCUMENT NUMBER:
- LONG TITLE:

AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SH:OND RE!-ER.ENCE
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBEER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBRER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMRER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\z00s5r0d . apc

6.4 General Correspondence

PEA (6.4) #1 001-003

"Wetlands Application No. 89-1805"

State of New Hampshire, Department of Environmental Services, Water Supply and Pollution Control Division
State of New Hampshire

14 September 1989

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (6.4) #2 001-001

"Request for information for wetlands permit”®

State of New }kmpdm'e,Depnmnemot'Envqu!Servxm
Air Force

18 September 1989

Letter

None

PEA (6.4) #3 001-001
"Letter regarding the approval of permit No. WPP-3348 for Landfill § remedistion®
State of New Hampashire, Department of Environmental Services
Air Force
11 October 1989
Letter
None
ARF

PEA (6.4) #4 001-005

"Air Force Letter to the Wetlands Board regarding a request for spproval for a modxﬁcauontoﬂxewedmdspemnmed
scope of work”

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Delbert Downing, Wetlands Board, Concord, NH

2] November 1989

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (6.4) #5 001-010

"Letter to EPA regarding background information on Pease Air Force Base”
US Department of Commerce

Air Force via US EPA

7 March 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (6.4) #6 001-001

File # 92-679; CEICLARehtedTempomryFmonOOOSqmmeor Wells at Pease AFB, NH
Keaneth N. Kettearing

NHDES

Wetlands Board

P.O. Box 2008

C-140

09/09/94
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Concord, NH 03302-2008
Art Ditto, Pease AFB

26 May 1992

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (6.4) #7 001-002

State Review Comments to Site 8 Initial Screening of Alternatives; Clarification of TSCA Regulation of PCBs

Richard Pease, NHDES
Art Ditto, Pease AFB

11 August 1992

Letter

PEA (10.10); PEA (4.2)
ARF

PEA (6 4) #8 001-019

Lab results of groundwater samples from monitoring wells 05-5113, 05-6101, and 08-6024.

NHDES

Art Ditto, Pease AFB
11 February 1993
Letter w/ attachment
None

ARF

PEA (6.4) #9 001-041

Quarterly Progress Report, Period of Performance July, August and September 1993

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

October 1993

Report

None

ARF (Section 6.4 Binder)

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004 \zoneSrod.apc
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7.1 Enforcement History
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MIKO1\RPT:00628026.004\zoncSrod. apc C-142



7.2 Endangerment Assessments
* NOTE: NO ENTRIES IN THIS SECTION AT THIS TIME
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73 Administrative Orders

PEA (7.3) #1 001-1L.3
Pease AFB Federal Facilities Agreement Modification
USAF

Pease AFB

EPA Region 1

NHDES

NH Attorney General

January 1993

FFA Modification

none

ARF

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\z0nc Srod.ape C-144
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7.4 Consent Decrees
* NOTE: NO ENTRIES IN THIS SECTION AT THIS TIME
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MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod.apc

7.5 Affidavits
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+ NOTE: NO ENTRIES IN THIS SECTION AT THIS TIME
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MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\zoncS5rod.apc

7.6 Documentation of Technical Discussions / Response Actions
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7.7 Notices, Letters, and Responses

* NOTE: NO ENTRIES IN THIS SECTION AT THIS TIME
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AUTHOR:
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DATE:
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PEA (8.1) #1 001-B1

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 3C Health Assessment, Pease AFB, NH, Volume I Draft

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
USAF

September 1991
Health Assessment
None

ARF

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\zoncSrod.apc

8.1 ATSDR Health Assessments

C-149

09/09/94



82 Toxicological Profiles
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (3.2) #1 001-ZN4

LONG TITLE: Installation Restoration Program Stage 4 Toxicity Profiles, Pesse Air Force Base, NH 03803
AUTHOR: Roy F. Weston, Inc.

RECIPIENT: USAF

DATE: January 1993

TYPE: Toxicity Profiles

SECOND REFERENCE: None

LOCATION: ARF, R
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8.3 General Correspoodence

PEA (8.3) #1 001-001

Health Assessment Split Sample
NHDES

Ant Ditto, Pease AFB

26 July 1991

Letter

PEA (6.9

ARF

PEA (8.3) #2 001-001
Health Assessment Report for Pease AFB
USAF -

Leslie Camp

ATSDR '

Mail Stop E-32

1600 Clifton Road
Atlanta, GA. 30333
26 June 1992

Letter

None

ARF
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9.1 Notices Issoed
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9.2 Findings of Fact
s NOTE: NO ENTRIES IN THIS SECTION AT THIS TIME
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DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

LOCATION:

9.3 Reports

PEA (9.3) #1 001-015

Landfill 5 Closure Wetlands Assessment and Mitigation Report
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

November 1993

Repornt

Landfill 5

ARF (LF-5 Shelf)

MEKO1\RPT:00628026.004\z00e Srod.apc : C-154
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SECOND REFERENCE:
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AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
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9.4 General Correspondence

PEA (9.4) #1 001001

Landfill S Wetlands Assessment and Mitigation Report
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Michael Daly, EPA

Richard Pesase, NHDES

3 December 1993

Letter

LF-5

ARF (Section 9.4 Binder)
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LONG TITLE:
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LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:
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SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

10.1 Comments and Responses

PEA (10.1) #1 001-005

"Response to Comments - Draft Final Community Relations Plan”
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

7 February 1991

Letter/Response to Commeants

None

ARF

PEA (10.1) #2 001-003

Draft Community Relations Plan Comments
Richard Pease, P.E.

RPM, NHDES,

Arthur Ditwo, P.E.

RPM, U.S. Air Force

30 November 1990

Letter Comment Report

Community Relstions

ARF

PEA (10.1) #3 001-010 .
EPA Region 1 Comments to IRP Draft Commurity Relations Plan; Pease AFB
Douglas S. Gutto

U.S. EPA Region 1

Superfund Community Relations

Arthur Ditto, RPM

U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

7 December 1990

Letter Commeat Report

Community Relations

ARF

PEA (10.1) #4 001011

EPA Comments on Pease AFB Community Relations Plan with Air Force’s Responses
Individual Unknown (From Air Force) '

U.S. Air Force

January 1991

Comment Report

Community Relations

ARF

PEA (10.1) #5 001-004

NHDES Comments on Pease AFB Community Relations Plan with Air Force Responses
Individual Unknown (Through Air Force)

U.S. Air Force

January 1991

Comment Report

Community Relations

ARF

PEA (10.1) #6 001002

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\z0n¢S r0d..apc C-156
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. Preliminary A

Review of Draft (Revised) Final Report IRP Community Relations Plan
Johanna Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1

Arthur Ditto, RPM

U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

25 March 1991

Letter

Community Relations

ARF

PEA (10.1) #7 001-003 .
Comments Remaining Unresotved for Stage 4 Work Plan Analysis Meth:
Mark McKenzie, Pease AFB

Lee dePersia, Roy F. Weston, Inc.

05 May 1991

Comments

PEA (3.1)

ARF

PEA (10.1) #38 001-002
Oversight Comments on the Soil Boring/Piezometer Instalistion Program
Scott Doane

John Regan

NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.
RPM, U.S. Air Force
Pease AFB

13 April 1992

Letter

CRD-1

ARF

PEA (10.1) #9 001-002
imi nt/Site Insp

Richard Pease, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

17 April 1992

Comments

PEA (10.6); PEA (6.3)

ARF

Draft Fact Sheet Comments

PEA (10.1) #10 001-002
Review of Zone 2 Monitoring Well Installation Modifications
Richard Pease

RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto

RPM, U.S. Air Force
Pease AFB

28 April 1992

Letter

Zone 2

ARF

PEA (10.1) #11 001-021

C-157

09/09/94
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RupomtoCommonZone4, Site ChtnctcrinﬁonforMAFB, Portsmouth, NH
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

USAF

EPA

May 1992

Response to Comments

PEA (3.6)

ARF

PEA (10.1) #12 001-003
Review Comments for Stage 4 Work Plan Addesdum Number 2
Richard H. Pease, P.E.

RPM, NHDES

Arthur Dinto, P.E.

RPM, USAF

Pease AFB

08 May 1992

Letter

PEA G.3),

ARF

PEA (10.1) #13 001014

Review Comments for Stage 4 Work Plan and Sampling and Analysis Plan Addendum Number 2
Michael Daly :
U.S. EPA Region |

Federal Facilities Superfund Section

Arthur Ditto, RPM

U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

14 May 1992

Transmittal Sheet, Letter and Comment Report

PEA (3.1); PEA (3.3)

ARF

PEA (10.1) #14 001-013
Review of Stage 4 Work Plan and Sampling and Analysis Plan Addendum Number 2 for Pease AFB
Michael J. Daly

U.S. EPA Region 1

Federal Facilities Superfund Section
Arthur Ditto, RFM

U.S. Air Force/Pease AFB

14 May 1992

Letter with Comment Report

PEA (3.1); PEA (33)

ARF

PEA (10.1) #15 001-006 ) o
Zone 4 Site Characterization Summary, May 1992 Review Comments
Richard Pease, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

02 June 1992

Comments

PEA (6.3); Zone 4

ARF

09/09/94
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AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DbCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
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PEA (10.1) #16 001-006

Zone 3 Site Characterization Summary, May 1992 Review Commeants

Richard Pease, NHDES
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
11 June 1992

Comments

PEA (6.3); Zone 3

ARF

PEA (10.1) #16 001-006

Zone 3 Site Characterization Summary, May 1992 Review Comments

Richard Pease, NHDES
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
11 June 1992

Comments

PEA (6.3); Zone 3

ARF

PEA (10.1) #17 001-009

Review of the Zone 3 Site Characterization Summary for Pease Air Force Base, Portsmouth, NH - May 1992

Michael Daly, USEPA
Asthur Ditto, Pease AFB
11 June 1992

Comments

Zone 3

ARF

PEA (10.1) #18 001003

Site 32/36 Letter Report Comments

Richard Pease, NHDES
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
15 June 1992

Comments

PEA (6.3); Site 32/36
ARF

PEA (10.1) #19 001-015

Review of the Stage 3C Feasibility Sudy for IRP Site 34

Michael J. Daly, USEPA’
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
18 June 1992

Comments

Site 34

ARF

PEA (10.1) #20 001-012

Pease Air Force Base, Portsmouth, NH May 1992

Review of the Draft Stage 3C Feasibility Study for IRP Site 32/36, Pease AFB, Portsmouth, NH - May 1992

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
01 July 1992

Comments

Site 32/36

ARF

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\zoncSrod.apc
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PEA (10.1) #21 001-003

AOC 32/36 Draft Final Remedial Investigation June 1992, Review Comments
Richard Pease, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

08 July 1992

Comments

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (10.1) #22 001-006

Issues Needing Resolution for the Draft Final Remedial Investigation Report for Landfill 5, Dated April 1992

USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
28 July 1992

Response to Comments
Landfill 5

ARF

PEA (10.1) #23 001-011
Review of Draft Zone 4 Site Characterization Summary Report
Jobanna Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1

Arthur Ditto

RPM, USAF

Pease AFB

1 August 1992

Transmittal Letter with Comment Report
Zone 4; PEA 3.5

ARF

PEA (10.1) #24 001-003
Comments cn Haven Pump Test Design and Piezometer Installations
Richard Pease, NHDES ’

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

7 August 1992

Comments

PEA (6.3

ARF

PEA (10.1) #25 001-007

Stage 3C Review of Initial Screening of Alternatives for IRP Site 8 Fire Training
Draft, June 1992

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

10 August 1992

Comments

Site 8

ARF

PEA (10.1) £26 001-002

Haven Well Pump Test at Pease Air Force Base, NH
Johanna Hunter, USEPA

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

11 August 1992

Comrments

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\z0neSrod. apc C-160
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None

PEA (10.1) #27 001-002

Stage 4 Work Plan Addendum 3 Review Comments
Richard Pease, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

14 August 1992

Comments

PEA (6.3)

ARF

PEA (10.1) #28 001-006

Haven Well Test Response to Comments
James G. Spnatt, Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Mark McKenzie, Pease AFB

17 August 1992

Response to Comments

None

ARF

PEA (10.1) #29 001-026

Response to Comments on Zone 3 Site Characterization Summary
Lee dePersia : .
Task Manager

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Capt. Carl Woerhle

U.S. Air Force

Base Closure Division -

Air Force Center for Environmental Excellence

1 September 1992

Letter with Comment Report

Zone 3; PEA 3.9

ARF ’

PEA (10.1) #30 001-002

Review Comments of Draft Landfill 5 Source Area Proposed Plan -

Richard H. Pease, P.E.
RPM,; NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.
RPM, USAF

Pease AFB

10 September 1992
Letter

LF-5; PEA (43)

ARF

PEA (10.1) #31 001-003

Review of Letter Report Re: Addition of Bedrock Wells to Groundwater Extraction System st Site 32/36

Johanna Huater, RPM
U.S. EPA, Region 1
Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB

22 September 1992
Letter

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\z00¢570d.pc C-161
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MKOI\RFI':OO&SOZS.WWM.IPG

Site 32/36; PEA (2.7)
ARF

PEA (10.1) #32 001-023
Response to Comments on Zone 4 Site ChanmiznﬁonSummny
Roy F. Weston, Inc.
Through U.S. Air Force (Art Ditto
Johanns Hunter, RPM :
U.S. EPA, Region 1
and
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES
30 September 1992
Transmittal Letters with Letter Report
Zone 4; PEA (3.5)
ARF

PEA (10.1) £33 001-006
RMwofSupscsmerEmcﬁonTmnbﬂitySmdyWorklefoﬂPSiu 8 - September 1992
Micheel J. Daly

U.S. EPA Region 1

Federal Facilities Superfund Section

Arthur Ditto

RPM, USAF

Pease AFB

30 September 1992

Letter with 2 Attachments

Site 8; PEA (2.0)

ARF

PEA (10.1) #34 001-002
Review Comments on Stage 3C, Letter Report for IRP Site 34 Groundwater Remediation System
Richard H. Pease, P.E.

RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM, USAF

Pease AFB

1 October 1992

Letter

Site 34; PEA 2.7)

ARF

PEA (10.1) #35 001-001

Review Comments for Landfill 3 - No Further Action Decision Document
Richard H. Pease, P.E.

RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E. L

RPM, USAF T

Pease AFB

- 2 October 1992

Letter
Zone |
ARF

PEA (10.1) #36 001-001
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Review Comments for Landfill 3 (IRP Site 3)
Richard H. Pease, P.E.

RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM, NHDES

Pease AFB

2 October 1992

Letter

Zone 1

ARF

PEA (10.1) #37 001-002
Proposed Locations for Additional Monitoring Wells at Site 8
Scott Doane, Hydrogeologist NHDES
. and
John Regan, Supervisor NHDES

. Arthur Ditto, RPM, USAF

Pease AFB

9 October 1992
Letter

Site 8; PEA 3.1)
ARF

PEA (10.1) #38 001-032
Response to Comments; Site 8 Initial Screening of Alternatives
Roy F. Weston, Inc. :
through U.S. Air Force (Arthur Ditto)
Johanna Hunter, RFM
U.S. EPA, Region |

and
Richard Pease
RPM, NHDES
13 October 1992
Transmitta] Letters with 2 Attachments
Site 8; PEA (B.5)
ARF

PEA (10.1) #39 001-003

NHDES Response to Comments to Site 42 Final Site Inspection Report, ICF Kaiser Engincers Portsmouth Waste to Energy

Plant, dated July 1992
Richard H. Pease, P.E.
RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E
RPM, USAF

22 October 1992
Letter

Site 42; PEA (1.4)
ARF

PEA (10.1)-#40 001-006

Response to Comments, Stage 4 Work Plan and Sampling and Analysis Plan Addendum 2

Arthur Ditto, RPM
U.S. Air Force
Pease AFB

Johanna Hunter, RFM
us. E?A, Region 1
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and
Richard Pease, RPM
NHDES
3 November 1992
Letter
PEA (3.3); PEA 3.1)
ARF

PEA (10.1) #41 001-002
EPA Review of IRP Stage 4, No Further Action Decision Document (NFADD) for Site 3
Johansa Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA Region 1

Arthur Ditto, RPM

U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

5 November 1992

Letter

Site 3

ARF

PEA (10.1) #42 001-003
Comments on Pease Off-Base Well Inventory Letter Report
Richard H. Pease, P.E.

RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM, U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

12 November 1992

Letter

Zone 2; Zone S; Site 8

ARF

PEA (10.1) #43 001-003 .
Review Comments for Stage 3B, Informal Technical Information Report for IRP Site 32/36
Richard H. Pease, P.E.

RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM, U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

13 November 1992

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (10.1) #44 001-002
Review of Stage 4 Sampling and Analysis Plan Addendum 3, Pease AFB
Michael J. Daly

U.S. EPA, Region 1

Federal Facilities Superfund Section

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM, U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

23 November 1992

Letter

None

ARF
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PEA (10.1) #45 001-001
Commeats on Zone 2 Site Characterization Study
Michael J. Daly

U.S. EPA, Region 1
Federal Facilities Section
Mark McKenzie

USAF

Pease AFB

24 November 1992
Letter (Fax)

Zone 2

ARF

PEA (10.1) #46 001-005
Revjew Comments of Stage 4, Site Characterization Summary, IRP Zone 2
Richard H. Pease, P.E.
RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.
RPM, U.S. Air Force
Pease AFB

30 November 1992
Letter

Zone 2

ARF

PEA (10.1) #47 001-002 )
Review Comments of Stage 4, Site Characterization Summary, IRP Zone 5
Richard H. Pease, P.E. ’
RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM, U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

1 December 1992

Letter

Zone 5

ARF

PEA (10.1) #48 001-003
Review Commeats of Stage 4, Site Charscterization Summary, IRP Zone 1
Richard H. Pease, P.E.
RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.
RPM, U.S. Air Force
Pease AFB

1 December 1992

Letter Comment Report
LF-4; Zone |; LF-2
ARF

PEA (10.1) #49 001-008

Review of Zone 2 and Zone 5, Site Characterization Summaries for Pease AFB
Michael J. Daly

U.S. EPA, Region 1

Federal Facilities Superfund Section
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Arthur Ditto, P.E.
U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

4 December 1992

Letter with Comment Reports
Zone 2; Zone 5

PEA (10.1) #50 001-004
Review of Zone 1, SizeChAnau'iuﬁonSumuyforPuseAr-‘B,Omber 1992
Michael J. Daly

U.S. EPA, Region 1

Federal Facilities Superfund Section

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM, USAF

Pease AFB

9 December 1992

Letter

Zone 1; PEA (3.5)

ARF

PEA (10.1) #51 001-004
Review of the Zone 1 Site Characterization Summary for Pease AFB
Michael J. Daly

U.S. EPA, Region 1

Federal Facilities Superfund Section
Arthur Ditto, RPM

U.S. Air Force

Pease AFB

9 December 1992

Letter with Comment Report

Zone 1

ARF

PEA (10.1) #52 001-001
Comments on Zone 2 Pumping Test Letter Report
Michael J. Daly

U.S. EPA, Region 1
Federal Facilities Section
Arthur Ditto, RPM
USAF/Pease AFB

10 December 1992

Fax

Zone 2

ARF

PEA (10.1) #53 001-004

EPA Review of IRP LF-5, Drnaft Proposed Plan, November 1992
Johanna Hunter, RPM

U.S. EPA, Region 1

Arthur Ditto, RPM

USAF, Pease AFB

17 December 1992

Letter

LF-5; PEA (4.3)

ARF .
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PEA (10.1) #54 001-002
Review Comments/Pease AFB Railroad Track (Site 46) Site Investigation Letter Report
Richard H. Pease, P.E.
RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM , U.S. Air Force
Pease AFB

4 Japuary 1993

Letter Report

Site 46

ARF

FEA (10.1) #55 001002

Response to Comments, LF-5 Draft Proposed Plan and Fact Sheet
Arthur Ditto, RPM

U.S. Air Force

Johanna Hunter, RFM

U.S. EPA, Region ]

5 January 1993

Letter

LF-5

ARF

PEA (10.1) #56 001-004

Comments on Stage 3C Feasibility Study for Site 32/36 Draft Final December 1992
Richard H. Pease, P.E.

NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM, USAF

11 January 1993

Letter

Site 32/36

ARF

PEA (10.1) #57 001-004

Review Comments for Draft Proposed Plans for IRP Sites 32/36 and 34, December 1992
Richard H. Pease, P.E.

NHDES

Arthur Ditto, P.E.

RPM, USAF

14 January 1993

Letter

Sites 34, 32/36

ARF

PEA (10.1) #58 001-006

EPA Review of Draft Final Feasibility Study for IRP Site 32/36 - December 1992
Johanna Hunter, RPM, USEPA Region 1

Arthur Ditto, RPM, USAF, Pease AFB

19 January 1993
Letter
Site 32/36
ARF
#
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PEA (10.1) #59 001-005

EPA Review of USAF IRP, Draft Proposed Plans for IRP Sites 32/36 and 34 - December 1992
Johanna Hunter, RPM, USEPA Region 1

Arthur Ditto, RPM, USAF, Pease AFB

21 January 1993

Letter

Sites 34, 32/36

ARF

PEA (10.1) #60 001-004

Additional Review Comments on Draft Proposed Plans for IRP Sites 32/36, Draft Final Feasibility Study for IRP Site 34,
Draft Final Feasibility Study for IRP Site 32/36

Richard Pease, RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, RPM, USAF, Pease AFB

25 January 1993

Letter

Sites 34, 32/36*

ARF

PEA (10.1) #61 001-002 ) ’
RcviewCommemofPanAFBPreﬁnﬁmryF‘mdings- Fish and Shellfish Tissue Analysis
Richard Pease, RPM, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, RPM, USAF, Pease AFB

21 January 1993

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (10.1) #62 001-002
Review of the Air Force Selection of Remedial Action Alternative Letter for Site 8, FDTA #2, dated Japuary 8, 1993
EPA, Region 1
Arthur Ditto, AFBDA
26 February 1993
Letter
Site 8
ARF
#
PEA (10.1) #63 001-004 )
Review of Site 8 Draft Firial Feasibility Study IRP Pease Air Force Base, NH 03801, Draft January 1993
EPA, Region 1
Arthur Ditto, AFBDA
26 Februery 1993
Letter and Comments
Site 8
ARF

PEA (10.1) #64 001-003

EPA Review of the Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Revised Draft Final Proposed Plans for IRP Sites 32/36
and 34, Pease Air Force Base — March 1993

EPA, Region 1

Arthur Ditto, AFBDA

10 February 1993

Letter and Comments

Sites 32/36; Site 34

ARF

05/09/94
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PEA (10.1) #65 001-001 .

Submittal of Responses to Comments for the Zone 2 Site Characterization Summary

USAF

Johanna Hunter, EPA
Richard Pease, NHDES
February 1993

Letter

Zone 2

ARF

PEA (10.1) #66 001012

Response to Comments, Zope 2 SCS - EPA Comments

USAF

EPA

2 February 1993
Response to Comments
Zone 2

ARF

PEA (10.1) #67 001-009
Response to Comments, Zone 2 SCS - NHDES Comments

USAF

NHDES

2 February 1993
Response to Comments
Zone 2

ARF

PEA (10.1) #68 001-004

Stage 3B IRP Site 34 Groundwater Treatment Plant ITIR Draft, November 1992

NHDES

Art Ditto, AFBDA
25 January 1993
Comments

Site 34

ARF

" PEA (10.1) #69 001-018

Response to EPA Comments on Site 8 Draft FS
USAF

EPA

27 January 1993

Response to Comments

Site 8

ARF .

PEA (10.1) #70 001021

Response to NHDES Comments on Site 8 Draft FS
USAF

NHDES

28 January 1993

Response to Comments

Site 8

ARF
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PEA (10.1) #71 001-006
Response to NHDES Comments on Zone 5 FS
USAF
NHDES
07 January 1993
Response to Commeants
Zone §
ARF
#
PEA (10.1) #72 001-009
Response to EPA Comments on Site 8 Draft FS
USAF
EPA
11 January 1993
Response to Comments
Site 8
ARF

PEA (10.1) #73 001-001

Sierra Club Comments on Cleanup of Site 5 at Pesse Air Force Base
Scott Drummey, Sierra Club

USAF

15 February 1993

Comments

Landfills

ARF

PEA (10.1) #74 001-002

Proposed Plan for IPR Site S, Landfill 5, Source Area
Seacoast Citizens Overseeing Pesse Eavironment (SCOPE)
USAF

22 January 1993

Comments

Landfills

ARF

PEA (10.1) #75 001-002

DES Review of Site 8 Dratt Final Feasibility Study, January 1993 and Air Force’s Response to Comments to DES Review

Comments to Site 8 Draft Feasibility Stdy
NHDES

Art Ditto, AFBDA

01 March 1993

Comments

Site §

ARF

PEA (10.1) #76 001-009

EPA Review of Air Force Instalistion Restoration Program, Draft Remedial InvestigationReport, Zone 5, Pease Air Force

Base - February 1993
EPA

Art Ditto, AFBDA
26 March 1993
Comments

Zone 5

ARF
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PEA (10.1) #77 001011

IRP Stage 4 Zone 5 Remedial Investigation, February 1993 — Draft

NHDES

Art Ditto, AFBDA
26 March 1993
Comments

Zone S

ARF

PEA (10.1) #78 001-002
Comments on Proposed Plan for IRP Sites 32/36 and 34
Robert J. Mack, Director

Office of Real Property Management

U.S. Department of State

Art Ditto, AFBDA

29 March 1993

Letter with attachment

Sites 32/36 and 34

ARF

PEA (10.1) #79 001-003

Proposed Plans for IRP Sites 32/36 and 34, March 1993, Draft Final

George C. Jones, Executive Director PDA
Art Ditto, AFBDA

15 April 1993

Comments

Sites 32/36 and 34

ARF

PEA (10.1) #80 001-003

SCOPE Comments on Proposed Plans for Sites 32/36 and 34

Bradley M. Lown, Chairman, SCOPE
Art Ditto, AFBDA

26 April 1993

Comments
Sites 32/36 and 34
ARF

PEA (10.1) #81 001-005

Response to EPA Comments on the Draft Zone 5 ISA
USAF

EPA Region 1

14 June 1993

Response to Comments

Zope 5

ARF

PEA (10.1) #82 001-025

Response to NHDES Comments on the Draft Zone 5 ISA
USAF

NHDES

14 June 1993

Response to Comments

Zone 5

ARF
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PEA (10.1) #83 001-023

Review of the Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Zone 1, Initial Screening of Alternatives Report, Pease AFB
USEPA, Region 1

USAF

27 August 1993

Comments

PEA (10.10); Zone 1

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #84 001-018
Response to EPA Comments on the Zone 1 Draft Remedial Investigation Report
USAF

EPA

15 October 1993
Response to Commeats
Zoae 1

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #85 001-018

Response to NHDES Comments on the Zope 1 Dnaft Remedial Investigation Report
USAF

NHDES

15 October 1993

Response to Comments

Zone 1; PEA (10.10)

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #86 001015
Response to the EPA Comments on the Zone 1 Draft FS Report
USAF

EPA

29 November 1993
Response to Comments
Zone 1

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #87 001-018

Response to NHDES Comments on the Zone | Draft FS Report
USAF .

NHDES

30 November 1993
Response to Comments
Zone 1

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #88 001-007 .

Review of the Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Draft Remedial Investigation Report, Zone 2, Pease AFB
Michael Daly, EPA Region 1

Arthur Ditto, USAF, Pease AFB

9 July 1993

Comments

Zone 2; PEA (10.10)
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ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #89 001-008

Response to EPA Commeants on the Draft Zone 2 RI Report
USAF

EPA

30 November 1993

Response to Comments

Zope 2

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #90 001-027

Response to NHDES Comments on the Draft Zone 2 RI Report
USAF

NHDES

30 November 1993

Response to Comments

Zone 2

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #91 001-004

Response to EPA Comments on the Zone 2 ISA Report
USAF ‘

EPA

13 September 1993

Response to Commeats

Zone 2

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder) -

PEA (10.1) #92 001-012 .
Response to NHDES Comments on the Zone 2 ISA Report
USAF

NHDES

13 September 1993
Response to Comments
Zone 2

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #93 001-006

Response to EPA Comments on the Zore 2 Draft FS Report
USAF

EPA

2 December 1993

Response to Comments

Zone 2

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #94 001-019

Response to NHDES Comments on the Zone 2 Draft FS Report
USAF

NHDES

2 December 1993

Response to Comments
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Zone 2
ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #95 001-007

Response to EPA Comments on the Zone 4 RI
USAF

EPA

13 September 1993

Response to Comments

Zone 4

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #96 001-015

Response to NHDES Comments on the Draft Zone 4 RI
USAF

NHDES

13 September 1993

Response to Comments
Zone 4

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #97 001-011

Response to the EPA Comments on the Zone 4 Drnaft FS Report
USAF

EPA

3 November 1993

Response to Comments

Zone 4

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #98 001-008

Recpomtoﬂ:eNHDESCommmontheZone4DnﬁFSRepon

USAF

NHDES

2 November 1993
Response to Comments
Zone 4

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #99 001-019

Response to EPA Comments on the Draft Zone § RI Report
USAF

EPA

4 August 1993

Response to Commeants

Zone 5

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #100 001-020

RetponsetotheNH])FSCommemsontheDnﬂZoneSRIRepon

USAF

NHDES

5 August 1993

Response to Comments ,
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Zone S
ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #101 001-006

Response to Comments on the Draft Zone 5 RI Report Addendum 1
USAF

EPA

NHDES

5 August 1993

Response to Comments

Zope 5

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #102 001-006

Response to NHDES Comments on the Draft Zone 5 FS
USAF

NHDES . .

10 October 1993 (Attached letter is dated August 27, 1993)
Response to Comments

Zone 5

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #103 001033

Response to EPA Comments on the Draft Zone 5 RI Report
USAF :

EPA

28 September 1993

Response to Comments

Zone 3 '

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #104 001-024

Response to NHDES Comments on the Dreft Zone 3 RI Report
USAF

NHDES

29 September 1993

Respbnse to Comments

Zone 3

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #105 001-D.3

Pease AFB Response to NHDES and EPA Commeants on the Zones 6 and 7 Site Inspection Report

USAF

EPA

NHDES

30 November 1993
Response to Comments
Zone 6; Zone 7

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #106 001-013

Response to EPA Comments on the Draft Zone 7 (OJETS) RUFS Report

USAF
EPA

‘
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17 December 1993
Response to Comments
Zone 7

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #107 001-001

Response to NHDES Comments on the 30% Submittal of the Remedial Design for the Landfill S Final Closure System
USAF

NHDES

3 November 1993

Response to Comments

Landfill 5

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #108 001-004 .

Response to EPA Comments on the 30% Submittal of the Remedial Design for the Land§ill 5 Final Closure System
USAF

EPA

3 November 1993

Response to Comments

Landfill 5

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #109 001-006

Response to NHDES Comments on the 90% Submittal of the Remedial Design for the Excavation/Relocation Plan for
Waste, Soil and Sediments; Landfills 2, 4, and §

USAF

NHDES

3 November 1993

Response to Comments

Landfill 2; Landfill 4; Landfill §

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #110 001-017

Respoase to NHDES Comments on the Draft Fina! Site 8 RI Report
USAF

NHDES

13 April 1993

Response to Comments

Site 8

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #111 001-010

Response to EPA Comments on the Draft Final Site 8 RI Report
USAF

EPA

13 April 1993

Response to Comments

Site 8

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #112 001008
Draft Response to EPA Comments on the Mclntyre Brook/Lower Newfields Ditch Draft RIFS Report
USAF

09/09/94
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EPA

9 November 1993

Response to Comments

McIntyre Brook; Lower Newfields Ditch
ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #113 001-014

Draft Response to NHDES Comments on the Mclntyre Brook/Lower Newfields Ditch Draft RUFS Report
USAF

NHDES

8 November 1993

Response to Comments

McIntyre Brook; Lower Newfields Ditch

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #114 001-003 -

Remedial Technology Peer Review, Pease International Tradeport and Air National Base, New Hampshire, Peer Review
Fred Price, Mitre Corporation

Major Charles Howell, AFCEE

13 April 1993

Letter

Zone S

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #115 001-002

Peer Review of Initial Screening Altermnatives, Zone 4, Pease International Tradeport, NH
Fred Price, Mitre Corporation

Major Charies Howell, AFCEE

7 May 1993

Letter

Zone 4

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #116 001-003

Review of U.S. Eavironmental Protection Agency Comments on Background Data for Pease AFB, NH
Fred Price, Mitre Corporstion ’

Major Charles Howell, AFCEE

11 Jupe 1993

Letter

None

ARF (Section 10.] Binder)

PEA (10.1) #117 001-003

Peer Review of Initial Screening of Alternatives, Zone 3, Pease AFE, NH
Fred Price, Mitre Corporstion

Major Charles Howell, AFCEE

2 July 1993

Letter

Zone3

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #118 001-004

Peer Review of Initial Screening of Alternatives, Zone 1, Pease AFB, NH
Fred Price, Mitre Corporation
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Major Charles Howell, AFCEE
16 July 1993

Letter

Zone 1

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #119 001-003
Peer Review of Initial Screening of Alternatives, Zone 2, Pease AFB, NH
Fred Price, Mitre Corporation
Major Charies Howell, AFCEE
10 August 1993

Letter

Zone 2

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #120 001-005 :

Review of the Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Zone 1 Initial Screening of Alternatives Report, Pease AFB,
NH

EPA

USAF

27 August 1993

Letter with Attachment

Zone 1

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #121 001-012

Pease AFB Zone 1 Draft Feasibility Study Review Comments
NHDES

USAF

1 October 1993

Letter with Attachments

Zone 1

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #122 001-003

Genenal Review of September 1993 Draft Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study, Zone 7, Pease AFB, NH
Fred Price, MITRE Corporation

Major Charles Howell, AFCEE '

21 October 1993

Letter

Zone 7

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #123 001-009

Review of the Air Force Installation Restoration Program Draft Zone 7 Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Sudy Report,
Pease AFB, NH

EPA

USAF

4 November 1993

Letter with Attachment

Zone 7

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #124 001-008

05/09/94
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Pease AFB Zone 7 Draft Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study Review Comments

NHDES

USAF

5 November 1993

Letter

Zone 7

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #125 001-002
Zone 4 Feasibility Study Report Comments and Responses
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
Michael Daly, EPA

10 November 1993

Letter

Zone 4

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #126 001-002

EPA Review of Mclatyre Brook and Flagstone Brook Sediment Evaluation Work Plan

EPA

USAF

16 November 1993

Fax

None

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #127 001-003 .
Response 1o EPA Commeants Zone 3 Dreft FS
USAF

EPA

22 November 1993

Response to Comments

Zone 3

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #128 001-012

State Response to Comments Zone 3 Draft Feasibility Study
USAF ) : '
NHDES

22 November 1993

Response to Comments

Zone 3

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #129 001-010

Pease AFB Zone 1 Draft Final Remedial Investigation Review Comments
NHDES

USAF .

29 November 1993

Comments

Zone 1

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

MKO1\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrodapc C-179

09/09/94



DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMRBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\z00¢Sr0d.apc

PEA (10.1) #130 001-003

Zone S Draft Final Feasibility Study and the Zone 5 Draft Proposed Plan Review Comments
NHDES

USAF

29 November 1993

Comments

Zone S5

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #131 001-002

Work Plan to Evaluate the Sediments of McIntyre Brook and Flagstone Brook Review Comments
NHDES

USAF

29 November 1993

Comments

Zone 3

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #132 001-010

Pease AFB Zone 2 Draft Final Remedial Investigation Review Comments
NHDES

USAF

30 December 1993

Comments

Zone 2

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #133 001-004
ZoneSandSiteSDnﬁFuuSheeufoerposedthReviewComm
NHDES

USAF

30 December 1993

Commeants

Zone §; Site 8

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #134 001-003° ) .

Pease AFB Zone 1 Feasibility Stuy Report Draft Final Review Comments
NHDES

USAF

3 January 1994

Comments

Zone |

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)

PEA (10.1) #135 001-004

Zone 3 Draft Final Feasibility Smudy Report Review Comments
NHDES ‘

USAF

3 January 1994

Comments

Zone 3

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)
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PEA (10.1) #136 001-010 .
Pease AFB, Zone 1 Draft Final Remedial Investigation
NHDES

USAF

29 November 1993

Review Comments

Zone 1; PEA (3.6)

ARF (Section 10.1 Binder)
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102 Commrunity Relations Plan

PEA (10.2) #1 001-040

'lnsnlhﬁonkmmioangnmCommnityRehﬁomPhn'

Roy F. Weston, Inc.
EPA, NHDES, USAF
January 1991

Community Relations Plan
None

ARF, IR

PEA (10.2) #2 001-080

U.S.AkFomhmﬂaﬁonRenonﬁoangnmComunitdelﬁomlefoerem,NH Interim Final

Dynamac Corporation

230 Peachtree St., N.W., Ste. 500

Atlanta, GA 30303
USAF

July 1993

CRP

None

ARF
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103 Public Notices

PEA (10.3) #1 001-001

Paid Advertisement of January 27, 1993 Public Hearing on Proposed Plan for Landfill 5 Source Area
USAF

Foster's Daily Democrat; Public

23 Japuary 1993

Public Notice

None

ARF, IR

PEA (10.3) #2 001-001

Paid Advertisement of January 27, 1993 Public Hearing for Proposed Plan for Landfill 5 Source Area
USAF

Porssmouth Herald; Public

24 January 1993

Public Notice

Nozne

ARF, R

PEA (10.3) #3 001-001

Paid Advertisement in Portsmouth Herald, for Sites 32/36 and 34 Proposed Plan Public Hearing and Comment Period.
USAF

Portsmouth Herald; Public

28 March 1993

Public Notice

Site 32/36; Site 34

ARF

PEA (10.3) #4 001-001

Paid Advertisement in Foster’s Daily Democrat for Sites 52/36 and 34 Proposed Plan Public Hearing and Comment Period
USAF .

Foster's Daily Democrat Public

27 March 1993

Public Notice

Site 32/36; Site 34

ARF

PEA (10.3) #5 001-001

Paid Advertisement in Foster's Daily Democrat for Landfill S Revised Proposed Plan Public Comment Period and Public
Hearing

USAF

Foster’s Daily Democrat, Public

31 July 1993

Public Notice

LF-2, LF4, LF-5

ARF

PEA (10.3) #6 001-001

Paid Advertisement in Porssmouth Herald for Landfill S Revised Proposed Plan Public Comment Period and Public
Hearing .

USAF

Portsmouth Herald, Public

1 August 1993
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Public Notice
LF-2, LF-4, LF-5
ARF
#
PEA (10.3) #7 001-001

PaidAdvetﬁxemminl’ormnoudxliemldforZoneSlm!SiteBPmpoaedPhnmbﬁcCommemPeriodmdPublicHeuing

USAF

Portsmouth Herald, Public
6 February 1994

Public Notice

Zone 5; Site 8

ARF (Section 10.3 Binder)

PEA (10.3) #8 001-001

Paid Advertisement in Foster's Daily Democrat for Zone 5 and Site 8 Public Comment Period and Public Hearing
USAF .

Foster's Daily Democras; Public

5 February 1994 )

Public Notice

Zope 5; Site 8

ARF (Section 10.3 Binder)

PEA (10.3) #9 001-001

Paid Advnu'aememinFo:rer’:DainDemocmforZoneS and Site 8 Public Comment Period and Public Hearing
USAF

Foster’s Daily Democrat; Public

26 February 1994 .

Public Notice

Zone 5; Site 8

ARF (Section 10.3 Binder)

PEA (10.3) #10 001-001 )
Paid Advertisement in the Portsmouth Herald for Zone 5 and Site 8 Public Comment Period and Public Hearing
USAF

Portsmouth Herald; Public

27 February 1994

Public Notice

Zone 5; Site 8

ARF (Section 10.3 Binder)

09/09/94
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10.4 Public Meeting Transcripts

PEA (10.4) #1 001-052

Pease Air Force Base, New Hampshire Official Transcript of Public Hearing for Proposed Plan for Landfill 5 Source Area

R & R Associates
P.O. Box 863
Exter, NH 03833
USAF

27 January 1993
Transcript
Landfill 5

ARF

PEA (10.4) #2 001-7.4

Public Hearing Summary of Pease Air Force Base Public Hearing on Landfill 5 Source Ares Proposed Plan
Dynamac Corporation .
230 Peachtree St., N.W.

Suite 500

Atlanta, Georgia 30303

USAF

27 January 1993

Hearing Summary

Landfill 5

ARF, R

PEA (10.4) #3 001-025
Pease Air Force Base Public Workshop and Information Meeting: Installation Restorstion Program
Dynamac Corporation
230 Peachtree St., N.W.
Suite S00

Atlanta, Georgia 30303
USAF

12 January 1993
Meeting Summary

None

R

PEA (10.4) #4 001-038 '
PnseAFBOfﬁdnl‘!‘nnscﬁptofhlblicHuﬁngfoerpoudleforlRPSites32/36an'd34
R&R Associates, Inc.

USAF

30 March 1993

Transcript

Sites 32/34 and 36

ARF

PEA (10.4) #5 001-7.4
SummnryofPuseAFBthcHanngontberposedPhnsformPSm 32/36 and 34
Dynamac Corporation

USAF

30 March 1993

Hearing Summary

Sites 32/34 and 36

ARF

]
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PEA (10.4) #6 001-034

PunAFBOﬁciﬂTnnmiptofPubﬁcHuﬁngforReviudepoudleforhndﬁﬂS

R&R Associates, Inc.
USAF

5 August 1993
Transcript

LE-5

ARF (LF-S Shelf)

PEA (10.4) #7 001-8.3

Final SummryofPunAFBMﬁcHetﬁngontheRevisedeposedPhnfor
Consolidation of Landfills 2 and 4 Within Landfill §

Dynamac Corporation
USAF

S August 1993
Hearing Summary
LF-5

ARF (LF-S Shelf)

monnrr:ooszsozs.omwsm:w

C-186

the Landfill 5 Source Area and the

09/09/94



DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION;

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

10.5 Documentation of Other Public Meetings

PEA (10.5) #1 001-007

Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

30 July 1991

Meeting Minutes

Noae

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #2 001-007

Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

27 August 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #3 001-010
Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee

_USAF

See Distribution List

01 October 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #4 001-003

Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

29 October 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #5 001-013

Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

26 November 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #6 001-005

Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

07 January 1992

Meeting Minutes

None
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ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #7 001-003

Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

31 March 1992

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #8 001-002 )

Meeting Mimutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

28 April 1992

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #9 001-003

Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

20 May 1992

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #10 001-005
Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #11 001-013

Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

27 October 1992

Meeting Minutes

Noae

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #12 001-004

Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

16 December 1992

Meeting Minutes

None ’

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\z0ne Srod.pc C-188

09/09/94



LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:"
DATE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

- DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:
‘RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:

LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #13 001-004

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List -

22 February 1990

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #14 001-013 :
Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

30 March 1990

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #15 001-004
Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
USAF

27 April 1990

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #16 001-010

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

See Distribution List

30 May 1990

Meeting Minutes

Noge

AREF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #17 001-008

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

See Distribution List

27 June 1990

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) 18 001-005

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

See Distribution List

25 July 1990

Meeting Minutes

None

MKOI\RPT:00628026.004\zoneSrod.apc C-189

09/05/94



LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION: '

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

DOCUMENT NUMBER:
LONG TITLE:
AUTHOR:

RECIPIENT:

DATE:

TYPE:

SECOND REFERENCE:

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #19 001-005

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

See Distribution List

29 August 1990

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #0 001-012

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

26 September 1990

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #21 001-008

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

31 October 1990

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #£22 001-004

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

See Distribution List

29 November 1990

Meeting Minutes

Nooe ’

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #23 001-003

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

See Distribution List

31 January 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #24 001-003

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

See Distribution List

27 March 1991
Meeting Minutes
None
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ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #25 001-006

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

See Distribution List

24 April 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #26 001-003

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

See Distribution List

28 May 1991

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #27 001-006

Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
Department of the Air Force

See Distribution List

25 June 1991

Meeting Minutes

Nore

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #28 001-008
Meeting Minutes of the Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

31 August 1993

Meeting Minutes

Nope

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #29 001-011

Technical Review Committee Meeting Minutes
USAF

See Distribution List

30 November 1993

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #30 001-009

Meeting Minutes of Technical Review Committee
USAF

See Distribution List

28 September 1993

Meeting Minutes

None
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ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #31 001-010

Technical Review Committee Meeting Minutes
USAF

See Distribution List

26 October 1993

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)

PEA (10.5) #32 001-002

Technical Review Committee Meeting Minutes
USAF

18 January 1994

Meeting Minutes

None

ARF (Section 10.5 Binder)
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10.6 Fact Sheets, Press Advisories, and News Releases

PEA (10.6) #1 001-003

"News release regarding the investigation of 22 sites on Pease AFB”
U.S. Air Force

Media

30 September 1987

News Release

None

ARF

PEA (10.6) #2 001-002

*News release regarding presentation of the second interim technical report”
U.S. Air Force

Media'

21 September 1988

News Release

None

ARF

PEA (10.6) #3 001-003

*News release regarding the underground water sampling program”
U.S. Air Force

Media

29 November 1988

News Release

None

ARF

PEA (10.6) #4 001-002

*News release regarding the reiease of the third interim technical report”
U.S. Air Force

Media

22 March 1989

News Release

None

ARF

PEA (10.6) #5 001004

*News release regarding off-base well water sampling results”
U.S. Air Force

Media

7 June 1989

News Release

None

ARF

PEA (10.6) #6 001-002

*News release regarding drum removal at Landfill 5°
U.S. Air Force

Media

1989

News Release

None
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PEA (10.6) #7 001-003
"Superfund Program Draft Interagency Agreement Fact Sheet”
U.S. EPA, Region]

December 1990

Fact Sheet

None

ARF

PEA (10.6) #8 001-008

Pease Air Force Base Installation Restoration Program Update: Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study ]
USAF

See Distribution List

October 1991

Fact Sheet

None

ARF

PEA (10.6) #9 001-011

Pease Air Force Base Installation Restoration Program Update: Information Update
USAF

See Distribution List

December 1992

Fact Sheet

None

ARF

PEA (10.6) #10 001-004

Pease Air Force Base Installation Restoration Program Update: Interim G dw
USAF

See Distribution List

January 1993

Fact Sheet

Sites 8, 34, 32736

ARF

Treatment - Sites 8, 32/36 and 34

PEA (10.6) #11 001-005 .

Pease Air Force Base Insullation Restoration Program Update: Underground Storage Tank Program Overview
USAF

See Distribution List

January 1993

Fact Sheet

"Noge

ARF

PEA (10.6) #12 001-008

Pease Air Force Base Installation Restoration Program Update: Proposed Plan for Landfill 5 Source Area
USAF

See Distribution List

Januery 1993

Fact Sheet

LF-§

09/09/94
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PEA (10.6) #13 001-006

Pease Air Force Base Installation Restoration Program Update: Preliminary Assessment/Site Investigation
USAF

See Distribution List

Jaguary 1993

Fact Sheet

None

ARF

PEA (10.6) #14 001-002

News Release 93-01- Comment Period Opens for Proposed Plan on Landfill 5 Source Area
USAF

All Local News Media - Radio, Press, TV

15 January 1993

News Release

PEA (4.3)

ARF, R

PEA (10.6) #15 001-009

Proposed Plan for IRP Site 34 (Bldg. 222) Fact Sheet
USAF

See Mailing List

March 1993

Fact Sheet

Site 32/36; Site 34

ARF

PEA (10.6) #16 001-011
Proposed Plan for IRP Site 32/36 (Bldgs. 113/119) Fact Sheet
USAF i

March 1993

Fact Sheet

Site 34; Site 32/36
ARF

PEA (10.6) #17 001-001

News Release, Comment Period Opeas for IRP Sites 32/36 and 34
USAF

Media

16 March 1993

News Release

Site 32/36; Site 34

ARF (Section 10.6 Binder)

PEA (10.6) #18 001-008 ' ,

Revised Proposed Plan for Landfill 5 SoumAmnndﬁePhanomolidmLmdﬁﬂs2md4Wiﬂﬁn'hndﬁll5

USAF

July 1993

Fact Sheat

LF-2, LF4,LF-5
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ARF (Section 10.6 Binder)

PEA (10.6) #19 001-002

News Release, Fina! Plans Issued for Cleanup of Two Sites at Pesse AFB
USAF

Media

27 September 1993

News Release

LF-5; Site 34

ARF (Section 10.6 Binder)

PEA (10.6) 20 001-004
PunAFBEnvhvnmmlRmVolum 1, Number 1
USAF
January 1994
Newsletter
None .
ARF (Section 10.6 Binder)
#
PEA (10.6) £21 001-004
Pease AFB Installation Restorstion Program Update, Proposed Plan for IRP Site §
USAF
January 1994
Fact Sheet
Site 8
ARF (Section 10.6 Binder)

PEA (10.6) #£22 001-004

Pease AFB Installation Restoration Program Update, Proposed Plan for IRP Zone 5 (Site 9 and 11)
USAF '

January 1994

Fact Sheet

Zone S

ARF (Section 10.6 Binder)

PEA (10.6) #23 001-001

News Release Regarding Postponement of Site 8/Zone 5 Public Hearing
USAF

Media

9 February 1994

News Release

Site 8; Zone 5

ARF (Section 10.6 Binder)

09/09/94
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10.10 Correspondence

PEA (10.10) #1 001-001

"Letter regarding concern about the hazardous waste sites at Pease AFB*
Gordon J. Humphrey, U.S. Senste .

James F. McGovern, Acting Secretary of the Air Force

24 March 1989

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (10.10) #2 001-002
“Letter regarding the migration of Air Force hazerdous waste beyond the Pease AFB perimeter”
Town of Newington

PEA (10.10) 3 001008
"Letter regarding groundwater sampling conducted on private property”
Department of the Air Force

Will Gilbert, Newington, NH

6 June 1989

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (10.10) #4 001-001 .
Submittal Letter for Draft Community Relations Plan for the Massachusetts Military Reservation (MMR) on Cape Cod,
Massachusetts

Douglas S. Gutro, USEPA

Karen Cowden,

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

19 June 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (10.10) #5 001-002

Impact of Base Closure on Personnel Responsible for the Installation Restoration Program and Publi¢c Affairs
Merrill S. Hohman, USEPA

Col. James R. Wilson

Pease AFB, NH

27 August 1990

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (10.10) #6 001-001

Impact of Base Closure on Personnel Responsible for the Installation Restoration Program and Public Affairs (Your Letter,
August 27, 1990)

USAF

Merrill S. Hohman, USEPA ¢

095/09/94
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11 October 1990

None

PEA (10.10) #7 001-001

Submittal of Primary Documents (Community Relations Plan)

USAF

Jim Brown, USEPA
24 October 1990
Letter

PEA (102)

ARF

PEA (10.10) #8 001-001

Submittal of Primary Documents (Community Relations Plan)

USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES
24 October 1990

Letter

PEA (10.2)

ARF

PEA (10.10) #9 001-001

Community Relations Plan Development Extension
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA

17 January 1991

Letter

PEA (10.2)

ARF

PEA (10.10) #10 001-001

Community Relations Plan Development Extension
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

17 Japuary 1991

Letter '

PEA (10.2)

ARF

PEA (10.10) #11 001-001

Submittal of Draft Final Primary Documents
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES

5 February 1991

Letter

PEA (3.1); PEA (3.3)

Pt

PEA (10.10) #12 001-001

Submittal of Draft Final Primary Documents
USAF

Johanua Hunter, USEPA
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5 February 1991
Letter

PEA (3.1); PEA (3.3)
ARF

PEA (10.10) #13 001-001
Community Relations Plan
USAF

Johanna Hunter, USEPA
12 April 1991

Letter

PEA (10.2)

ARF

PEA (10.10) #14 001-004

Basewide ARARs Pease AFB, NH 03803, January 1993, DRAFT — Review Comments

Richard Pease, NHDES
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
1 April 1993

Letter

PEA (4.1)

ARF

PEA (10.10) #15 001-002

Installation Restoration Program, Stage 4, No Further Action Decision Document for IRP Site 11, February 1993 —

Review Comments
Richard Pease, NHDES
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
2 April 1993

Letter

Site 11

ARF

PEA (10.10) #16 001-005

Zone 4 Draft Remedial Investigation Review Comments
Richard Pease, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

16 April 1993 ‘

Letter

Zone 4

ARF

PEA (10.10) #17 001-010

ZoneSIniﬁdScmningofAlwmﬁvesReponDRAFrMnch 1993 ~ Review Comments

Richard Pease, NHDES
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
23 April 1993

Letter

Zone S

ARF

PEA (10.10) #18 001-003
Zone 4 Draft Remedial Investigation — Review Comments
Richard Pease, NHDES
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Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
29 April 1993

Letter

Zone 4

ARF

PEA (10.10) #19 001-005

Draft Record of Decision for Landfill 5 Source Area Remedial Action, April 1993 — Review Comments
Richard Pease, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

11 May 1993

Letter

LF-5

ARF

PEA (10.10) #20 001-002

Pease AFB Review of Landfill 5 Draft Record of Decision
Johanna Hunter, EPA Region 1

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

13 May 1993

Faxed Letter

LF-S

ARF

PEA (10.10) #21 001-012

Proposed Plan for IRP Site 8, Fire Department Training Area 2, March 1993, DRAFT — Review Comments
Richard Pease, NHDES : '

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

14 May 1993

Letter

Site 8

ARF

PEA (10.10) #22 001-011

Pease AFB Zone 3 Remedial Investigation Report DRAFT, April 1993 — Review Commeats
Richard Pease, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

20 May 1993

Letter

Zone 3

ARF 1

PEA (10.10) #23 001-008

Mclntyre Brook/Lower Newfields Ditch RI/FS DRAFT, April 1993 - Review Comments
Richard Pease, NHDES

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

24 May 1993

Letter

Zone 3

ARF

PEA (10.10) #24 001-013
Zone 4 Initial Screening of Alternatives Report, DRAFT 1993 — Review Comments
Richard Pease, NHDES
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AUTHOR:
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SECOND REFERENCE:
LOCATION:

Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
24 May 1993

Zone 4

PEA (10.10) #25 001-004

Review of the Air Force Installstion Restoration Program, Draft Remedial Investigation Report, Zone 4, Pease AFB,

March 1993

Mike Daly, EPA Region 1
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
25 May 1993

Faxed Letter

Zone 4

ARF

PEA (10.10) #26 001-006

Rcviewofd:eAirFomInmﬂaﬁoannﬁonhognm,lniﬁd Screening of Alternatives (ISA) Report, Zone 4, Pease

AFB, April 1993

Mike Daly, EPA Region 1
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
25 May 1993

Faxed Letter

Zone 4

ARF

PEA (10.10) #27 001-015

Review of the Air Force Installation Restoration Program, Draft Remedial Invesﬁptionkepon, Zt;nes, Pease AFB, April

1993

Mike Daly, EPA Region 1
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
26 May 1993

Faxed Letter

Zomne 3

ARF

PEA (10.10) #28 001-004

Review of the Air Force Instaliation Restoration Program, Draft MclIntyre Brook/Lower Newfields Ditch Remedial

Investigation/Feasibility Swdy, April 1993

Mike Daly, EPA Region 1
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB
26 May 1993

Faxed Letter

Zone 3

ARF,

PEA (10.10) #29 001-001

Proposed Plan Fact Sheet for Zone 4
Arthur Ditto, Pease AFB

Michae! Daly, EPA

Richard Pease, NHDES

14 January 1994

Letter

Zone 4 ,

ARF (Section 10.10 Binder)
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11.1 EPA Headquarters Guidance

* NOTE: Guidance documents listed as bibliographic sources for a document already included in the Administrative Record arenot listed
separately in this index.
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.1) #1 001-003 )
LONG TITLE: Risk Assessment Issue Paper for Carcinogenicity Characterization for Trichloroethylene (CASRN 79-01-6),
Tetrachloroethylene (CASRN 127-18-4), and Styrene (CASRN 100-42-5)
AUTHOR: USEPA
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: 14 July 1992
TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.1) 2 001-G.2
LONG TITLE: Draft Guidance on Preparing Superfund Decision Documents: The Proposed Pian and Record of Decision
AUTHOR: Office of Emergency & Remedial Response, EPA, Washington, DC
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: March 1988
TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: Art’s Office
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER PEA (11.1) #3 001-B.9
LONG TITLE: The RPM Primer: An Introductory Guide to the Role and Responsibilities of the Superfund Remedial Project Manager
AUTHOR: Office of Emergency and Remedial Response, EPA, Washington, DC
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: September 1987
TYPE: Guidance
' SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: Art’s Office
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.1) #4001-11.1
LONG TITLE: CERCLA Site Discrepancies to POTWs Guidance Manual
AUTHOR: Office of Emergency and Remedial Response, EPA, Washington, DC
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: August 1990
TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: Art’s Office
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.1) #5 001-041
LONG TITLE: Framework for Ecological Risk Assessment
AUTHOR: EPA
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: February 1992
TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: Art’s Office
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.1) #6 001-E.1
LONG TITLE: Preliminary Assessment Guidance Fiscal Year 1988
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DOCUMENT NUMBER:

Office of Emergency and Remedial Response, EPA, Washington, DC

USAF
January 1988
Guidance
None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #7 001-G.1

Community Relations in Superfund: A Handbook (Interim Version)
Office of Emergency and Remedial Response, EPA, Washington, DC

USAF

1988
Guidance
None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #8 001-H.6

Summary Report on Issues in Ecological Risk Assessment

EPA

USAF
February 1991
Guidance
None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #9 001-127

Technology Screening Guide for Treatment of CERCLA Soils and Sludges

EPA

USAF
September 1988
Guidance

None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #10 001-F.19

Guidance for Conducting Remedial Investigations and Feasibility Studies Under CERCLA — Interim Final
Office of Emergency and Remedial Response, EPA, ‘Washington, DC

USAF
October 1988
Guidance
None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #11 001-103

anlGuidanceonAdminismﬁveRecoxdsforSdeoﬁngCERCLARupomeAcﬁons
Office of Solid Waste and Emergency Response, EPA, ‘Washington, DC

USAF
1190/91
Guidance
None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #12 001-B.2
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Implementing EPA's Groundwater Protection Strategy for the 1990°s: Draft Comprehensive State Groundwater Protection
Program Guidance

EPA

USAF

1992

Guidance
None
Art's Office

PEA (11.1) #13 001-021

A Handbook for State Groundwater Managers
Office of Water, EPA, Washington, DC
USAF

May 1992

Guidance

Noae

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #14 001-3.40

Conducting Remedial Investigations/Feasibility Studies for CERCLA Municipal Landfill Sites
Office of Emergency and Remedial Response, EPA, Washington, DC

USAF

February 1991

Guidance

Noane

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #15001-F.2

Guidance on Preparing Superfund Decision Documents: The Proposed Plan, The Record of Decision, and Explanation
of Significant Differences, The Record of Decision Amendment

Office of Emergency and Remedial Response, EPA, Washington, DC

USAF

~ July 1989

Guidance
None
Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #16 001-B.12

Risk Assessment Guidance for Superfund Volume I: Human Health Evaluation Manual (Part A) Interim Final
Office of Emergency and Remedial Response, EPA, Washington, DC

USAF

December 1989

Guidance

None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #17 001-057

Risk Assessment Guidance for Superfund Volume I: Envnmmedevahuuoanmd Interim Final
Office of Emergency and Remedial Response, EPA, Washington, DC

USAF

March 1989

Guidance

None

Art’s Office
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PEA (11.1) #18 Deleted

PEA (11.1) #19 001-B2

Superfund Removal Procedures Action Memorandum Guidance
EPA

USAF

December 1990

PEA (11.1) #20 001-G
RCRA Orientation Manual
EPA

USAF

1990

Guidance

None '

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #21 001-295

The Superfund Innovative Technology Evaluation Program: Technology Profiles
EPA

USAF

November 1991

None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #2 001-017

Accessing Federal Data Bases for Contaminated Site Clean-Up Technologies
EPA

USAF

May 1991

Guidance

None .

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #23 001-023

Bibliography of Federal Repoiu and Publications Describing Alternatives and Innovative Tmﬁnem

Corrective Action and Site Remedistion

EPA .
USAF

May 1991

Guidance

None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.1) #24 001-111

Synopses of Federal Demonstrations of Innovative Site Remediation Technologies
EPA

USAF

May 1991
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TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: Art’s Office
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112 EPA Regional Guidance

* NOTE: Guidancedocmentsl'stedsbihﬁomphkmforadocmmmhchdedhﬁeAdmhhuaﬁveRmrdmww
separately in this index.
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.2) #1 001-C.1
LONG TITLE: Land Disposal Restrictions Summary of Requirements
AUTHOR: EPA, Region 1
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: August 1990
TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: Art’s Office
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.2) #2 001-107
LONG TITLE: Supplemental Risk Assessment Guidance for the Superfund Program
AUTHOR: EPA, Region 1
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: June 1989
TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: Noge
LOCATION: Art’s Office
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11.3 State Guidance

¢ NOTE: Guidance documents listed as bibliographic sources for a document already included in the AdministrativeRecord are not listed
separately in this index.
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.3) #1 001-001
LONG TITLE: ENC-WS 410 Groundwater Protection Rules
AUTHOR: NHDES
RECIPIENT: Art Ditto, AFBDA
DATE: February 18, 1993
TYPE:" Letter
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: ARF
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.3) #2 001-B.8
LONG TITLE: Interim Policy for the Managemeat of Soils Contaminated from Spills/Releases of Virgin Petroleum Products
AUTHOR: NHDES : '
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: September 1991
TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: Art’s Office
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: " PEA (11.3) #3 001048
LONG TITLE: G dwater Protection Rules
AUTHOR: NHDES
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: February 1993
TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: Nooe
LOCATION: Art’s Office
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.3) #4 001-37.3
LONG TITLE: New Hampshire Ruies for the Control of Radiation
AUTHOR: NHDES
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: April 1983
TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: Art’s Office
#
DOCUMENT NUMBER PEA (11.3) #5 001-C.15
LONG TITLE: Guidance Document for the Closure of Solid Waste Landfills in New Hampshire
AUTHOR: NHDES
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: May 1990
TYPE: Guidance
SECOND REFERENCE: None
LOCATION: Art’s Office
#
DPOCUMENT NUMBER: PEA (11.3) #6 001-D.7
LONG TITLE: Guidebook for Environmental Permits in New Hampshire
AUTHOR: NHDES
RECIPIENT: USAF
DATE: 1992
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LOCATION: Art’s Office
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11.4 Air Force Guidance

PEA (11.4) #1 001-024

"Ecological Risk Assessment Guidance for Pease AFB, New Hampshire”

Mitre Corporation, Civil Systems Division
Air Force

20 June 1990

Letter Report

None

ARF

PEA (11.4) #2 001-016

“Implementation of Department of Defense (DOD) pohcygmdnnoeoanP Policy No. 1°

Department of the Air Force
See Distribution List

11 December 1981
Policy/Guidance Document
None

ARF

PEA (11.4) #3 001-002

*Implementation of DOD policy guidance on Installation Restoration Plan (IRP), Policy No. 1*

Department of the Air Force
See Distribution List

5 March 1982
Policy/Guidance Document
Noge

ARF

PEA (11.4) #4 001003

"Relationship of the IRP to RCRA enforcement actions

Department of the Air Force”
See Distribution List

26 December 1985

Policy Document

None

ARF

PEA (11.4) #5 001-002

"Guidance for Air Force Installation Compliance with Volatile Organic Compound Regulstions”

Department of the Air Force”
See Distribution List

8 October 1986

Guidance Document

None

ARF

PEA (11.4) #6 001-003

"IRP Decision Documentation Policy”
Department of the Air Force"

See Distribution List

25 May 1988

Policy Letter

None'
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PEA (11.4) #7 001-003

"RCRA Facility Assessment Guidance to Installation”
Department of the Air Force”

3 August 1988

Guidance

None

ARF

PEA (11.4) #3 001-003

"Guidance on base map construction and digitization D.O. 006 Pease AFB”
Department of the Air Force”

Roy F. Weston, Inc.

6 March 1989

Guidance Document

None

ARF

PEA (11.4) #9 001-1.3

Handbook to Support the Installation Restoration Program Statements of Work for Remedial. Investigation/Feasibility
Studies Version 3.0

Air Force Occupational and Environmental Health Laboratory Technical Services Division

Pease AFB

May 1989

Handbook

None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.4) #10 001-B1.3

United States Air Force Environmental Restoration Program NFRAP Guide: Making, Documenting and Evacusating No
Further Response Action Planned Decisions — Final Draft

USAF

Pease AFB

February 1993

Guidance

None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.4) #11 001-087

Air Force Logistics Command Public Affairs Environmental Guidance
USAF

Pesse AFB

March 31, 1989

PEA (11.4) #12 001-IX.A1.3

Recommended Sampling Procedures

Air Force Occupational and Environmental Health Laboratory
Pease AFB

March 1989
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DOCUMENT NUMBER:

Guidance
None
Axt’s Office

PEA (11.4) #13 001-J2

Report of the Defense Environmental Response Task Force
Department of Defense

Pesse AFB

October 1991

Guidance

None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.4) #14 001-1.5

Ihitiatives for Accelersting Cleanup at BRAC Installations
Department of Defense

Pease AFB

June 1992

Guidance

None

Art’s Office

PEA (11.4) #15 — Deleted
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115 Technical Sources

PEA (11.5) #1 001022

Trichloroethylene in the Groundwater Supply of Pease Air Force Base Portsmouth, NH
U.S. Geological Survey

USAF

1982

Technical Source

None

Art’s Office

FPEA (11.5) #2 001-080

Geology and Groundwater Resources of Southeastern New Hampshire
U.S. Geological Survey

USAF

1964

Techaical Source

None '

Art’s Office

PEA (11.5) #3 001-010

Preliminary Wetiand Delineation and Evaluation Report for Pease Air Force Base, NH — Draft
The Smart Associstes, Environmenta] Consultants, Inc.

USAF

April 1990

Technical Source

Nope

Art’s Office

PEA (11.5) #4 001-22

The Ecology of the Great Bay Estuary, New Hampshire and Maine: An Estuarine Profile and Bibliograpby
Jackson Estusrine Laboratory, Dutham, NH

USAF

October 1992

Technical Source

None

- Art’s Office
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11.6 Proposed Procedures / Procedures

PEA (11.6) #1 001-005 .
"Risk Assessment Data Needs and Sampling Procedures Letter Report”™
Roy F. Weston, Inc

EPA, NHDES

& March 1991

Letter Report

None

ARF

PEA (11.6) #2 001-051

"Analytical Methods Letter Report” — Supplemema]lnfommonm Stage 4 Sampling and Analysis Plan
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

23 April 1991

Letter Report

PEA (3.1

ARF

PEA (11.6) #3 001055

"Protocols for Generation of Baseline Risk Assessments for the Pease AFB Sites — Revised®
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

EPA, NHDES

July 1991

Report

None

ARF

PEA (11.6) #4 001-002
“Procedures for handling solids and liquids produced during well construction and soil bormgs at Site 8 investigations"
Department of the Air Force
NHDES
21 August 1990
Procedures
Site 8
ARF

PEA (11.6) #5 001-002
"Disposal of Drill Cuttings From Stage 2 and 3 Investigations”
Department of the Air Force
NHDES
14 August 1990
Procedures
None
ARF
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11.7 Correspondence

PEA (11.7) #1 001-006

"Letter to EPA requesting review and concurrence of risk assessment data and sampling procedure letter report™

Department of the Air Force
State of New Hampshire

20 March 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (11.7) 2 001-002

"Letter concerning use of drilling mud*
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

26 December 1990

Letter .

None

ARF

PEA(11.7) #3 001-002

"Analytical Methods for Pease AFB"
Roy F. Weston, Inc.

Air Force

23 April 1991

Letter

None

ARF

PEA (11.7) #4 001-001
Consolidated Background Values Letter Report
USAF

Richard Pease, NHDES
Johanns Hunter, EPA
March 9, 1993

Letter Report

None

ARF
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12.1 Privileged Documents (Extractions)
* NOTE: NO ENTRIES IN THIS SECTION AT THIS TIME
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